Group J Ductlle or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
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Renewable Option 01- 01 20 through 12 31 20

Commodity Consolidated | Southern Pipe
Codes Pipe & Supply & Supply
I. Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

89030-J-101 1 |Standard 26" grate w/frame $305.00 $331.77
w/24" clearing opening w/city lettering
EJIW - V-5624

89030-J-102 2 |Standard 26" grate only wicity lettering $174.00 $188.20
EJIW - V-5624

89030-J-103 3 [Standard 24" Grate w/Frame $129.00 $139.37
w/22" clearing opening w/city lettering
EJIW - V-5724

89030-J-104 4 |Standard 24" grate only w/city lettering $78.00 $84.23
EJIW -V-5724-4

89030-J-105 5 |ADA Compliant 26" grate w/frame $306.00 $331.77
w/24" clear opening
EJIW - V-5624-80

89030-J-106 6 |ADA Compliant 26" grate only $201.00 $216.44
EJIW - V-5624-80

II. Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Manhole Frames & Covers
1 |Standard 26" manhole frame w/cover
w/4" Rise & 24" clear opening w/City Logo
89030-J-II01A EJIW - 1046 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $269.95 $513.00
89030-J-1101B EJIW - 1046 (labeled STORM) $269.95 $513.00
2 |Standard 26" manhole frame w/cover
w/7" Rise & 24" clear openign w/City Logo
89030-J-1102A EJIW - 1045 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $329.58 $303.00
89030-J-1102B EJIW - 1045 (labeled STORM) $329.58 $303.00
3 |Standard 26" manhole cover only w/City Logo
89030-J-I103A EJIW - 1040 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $141.25 $130.00
89030-J-1103B EJIW - 1040 (labeled STORM) 141.25 $130.00
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Renewable Option 01-01-20 through 12-31-20

Commodity Consolidated | Southern Pipe
Codes Pipe & Supply & Supply
ERGO 1040hinged 26" manhole frame & cover
w/4" Rise & 24" clear opening w/City Logo
89030-J-1I104A EJIW - 1040 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $410.00 $445.07
89030-J-1104B EJIW - 1040 (labeled STORM) $410.00 $445.07
89030-J-1104C EJIW 1013 Accessory "T" handle key tool $30.00 $34.00
Reversible 26" manhole frame w/cover
w/24" clear opening
89030-J-II05A EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled SANITARY SEWER) $227.00 $246.54
89030-J-1105B EJIW - V-1600-3 (labeled STORM) $227.00 $246.54
Reversible 26" manhole cover only
89030-J-TI06A EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled SANITARY SEWER) $122.00 $131.68
89030-J-1106B EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled STORM) $122.00 $131.68]

III. Infra-Riser Multi-Purpose Rubber Composite Adjustment Risers (24"ID X 36" OD)

89031-J-III01A 1" Flat Round EJIW $43.00 $46.29
89031-J-1I101B 1" Tapered Round (.5 to 1") EJIW $41.00 $44.00p
89031-J-1I102A 1 1/2" Flat Round EJIW $63.00 $66.92
89031-J-11102B 1 1/2" Tapered Round (1.0" to 1.5") EJTW, $49.00 $54.00]
89031-J-III03A 2" Flat Round EJIW $80.00 $90.76
89031-J-11103B 2" Tapered round (1.0" to 2.0") EJIW $63.00 $71.00]
IV. Ductile or Cast Iron Valve Boxes (w/out set screws)
89040-J-1V01 18" - 24" height valve box price $78.00 $28.24
brand| EJIW Sigmal
p/n 85501922 VB261
89040-J-1V02 24" - 36" height valve box price $102.00 $42.36
brand| EJTW Sigmal
p/n 85502737 VB262{
V. Ductile or Cast Iron Valve Box Risers
89040-J-V01 2" price| $ 28.00 $9.42
brand EJIW Sigma
p/n 85008020 VB2602]
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Commodity Consolidated | Southern Pipe |  MS Utilities
Codes Pipe & Supply & Supply _ Supply
VI. Ductile or cast iron valve box lids labeled with '""Water' or "Sewer"
89030-J-V101 Standard lid price $18.00 $10.60 $6.00
brand EJIW Sigma Proselect
p/n 06800001 IVB26005 IVBLID
VII. Ductile or Cast Iron Cleanout & Covered labeled "Sewer' and City of Gulfport Lettering
89030-J-VIIO1 Cleanout Ring EJIW - V-8503 | $2000 $21.09 $19.50
89030-J-VII02 Cleanout Cover EJW-V-8503  $18.00 $17.20 $26.00
89030-J-VII03 Cleanout Ritig & Cover EJTW - V8503 ASSY|  $37.00 $38.29 $35.00
VIII. Meter boxes (metal)
89040-J-VIIIO1 Small w/lid price]  NO BID $34.12 32,00
brand Sigma Sigm:
p/n MB382 SMB3821
89040-J-VIII02 Large w/lid price NO BID stz L $99.00
brand Sigmal @& Slgma
p/n MB381| ‘SMB381
IX. Meter box lids only (metal)
89040-J-IX01 Small (19 1/8" X 9 3/4") price NO BID $16.00 [ igid 00
brand Sigma |  ‘ jvj‘Sig’ma
p/n MB3g2l  SMB3821
89040-J-1X02 Large - oval type price NO BID 43.75 : . $40.00
brand Sigma . Sigma
p/n MB381l| SMB3811
89040-J-IX03 Large - square type price NO BID $40.00 ! $4000
brand Sigma Hine 1gma
p/n MB3821  SMB2831
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9337 -B West Oaklawn

Biloxi Ms 39532
(228) 396-8818
Bill Turner

(228) 396-8889 Fax.#

wturner@consolidatedpipe.com
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Mississippi Utilities Supply
14231 Seaway Road Unit B-5

Gulfport, Ms 39503
(228) 863-2757
Catrina Walker

(228) 863-6587 Fax#

catrina.walker@ferguson.com




