
Design Precast  Coburn Southern Pipe
and Pipe  Supply, Inc. & Supply 

Section I - Ram Neck,Gasket Only

Cut Length
1.  1 x 2'5"  No bid No bid No bid

No bid No bid No bid

No bid No bid No bid

Section II - Round Concrete Pipe,ASTM C-76, Class III, w/Rubber Gasket

Diameter  
 

1.  15" per foot $11.20 No bid No bid

2.  18" per foot $15.36 No bid No bid

3.  24" per foot $23.44 No bid No bid

4.  30" per foot $33.84 No bid No bid

5.  36" per foot $44.00 No Bid No Bid
6.  42" per foot $54.88 No Bid No Bid

  
7.  48" per foot $69.36 No Bid No Bid

 
8.  54" per foot $85.44 No Bid No Bid

9.  60" per foot $103.60 No bid No bid
Section III - Concrete Arch, ASTM C-506, Class III, w/Preformed Mastic
Diameter
1. 18 x 11 16.92$                   No Bid No Bid

2. 22 x 13 20.97$                   No Bid No Bid

3. 29 x 18 29.25$                   No Bid No Bid

4. 36 x 23 35.28$                   No Bid No Bid

5. 44 x 27 48.33$                   No Bid No Bid

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2020 through 12-31-2020

Renewable Option 01-01-2021 through 12-31-2021

2.  1 1/2" x 3'5"

3.  1 3/4" x 3'5"

1 of 4



Design Precast  Coburn Southern Pipe
and Pipe  Supply, Inc. & Supply 

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2020 through 12-31-2020

Renewable Option 01-01-2021 through 12-31-2021

6. 51 x 31 62.64$                   No Bid No Bid

7. 58 x 36 79.65$                   No Bid No Bid

8. 65 x 40 97.11$                   No Bid No Bid

Concrete Flared End Sections

1.  18" round each $338.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $388.00 No Bid No Bid  

2.  24" round each $488.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $538.00 No Bid No Bid

3.  30" round each $675.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $725.00 No Bid No Bid

4.  36" round each $938.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $988.00 No Bid No Bid

5.  42" round each $1,305.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $1,355.00 No Bid No Bid

6.  48" round each $1,425.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $1,475.00 No Bid No Bid

7.  54" round each $1,508.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $1,558.00 No Bid No Bid

8.  60" round each $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid
arch each $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid

Section IV - HDPE Pipe Water Tight (Bell End) Connection, Smooth Interior
1.  15" per lineal foot No bid 8.11$                    8.11$                             

2.  18" per lineal foot No bid 10.66$                  10.66$                           

3.  24" per lineal foot No bid 17.97$                  17.97$                           

4.  30" per lineal foot No bid 26.12$                  26.12$                           

5.  36" per lineal foot No bid 32.58$                  32.58$                           
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Design Precast  Coburn Southern Pipe
and Pipe  Supply, Inc. & Supply 

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2020 through 12-31-2020

Renewable Option 01-01-2021 through 12-31-2021

6.  42" per lineal foot No bid 42.18$                  42.18$                           

7.  48" per lineal foot No bid 53.16$                  53.16$                           

8. 60" per lineal foot No bid 91.55$                  91.55$                           
Section V - Nyloplast or Equal, PVC Drain Basins with Lockable Cast Iron Grates

1.  15” per lineal foot No bid 738.71$                738.71$                         

2.  18” per lineal foot No bid 856.99$                856.99$                         

3.  24” per lineal foot No bid 1,060.21$             1,060.21$                      

4.  30” per lineal foot No bid 1,675.27$             1,675.27$                      

Section VI - HDPE Pipe Perforated Sock Pipe – 20’ Sections - Price per section

Diameter

1.  4” Flexible (100 ft.roll) No bid 42.00$                  54.00$                           

2.  4" Rigid No bid 124.00$                24.80$                           

3.  6" Rigid No bid 252.00$                50.40$                           

4.  8" Rigid No bid 412.00$                82.40$                           

5.  10" Rigid No bid 548.00$                109.60$                         

6.  12" Rigid No bid 658.00$                131.60$                         

7. 15" Rigid No bid 897.00$                179.40$                         

8. 18" Rigid No bid 1,196.00$             239.20$                         

9. 24" Rigid No bid 1,965.00$             393.00$                         
Section VII - HDPE Pipe, 20' Sections
Diameter
1.  15” Flared End No bid 153.28$                153.28$                         

2.  18” Flared End No bid 205.91$                205.91$                         

3.  24” Flared End No bid 264.24$                264.24$                         
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Design Precast  Coburn Southern Pipe
and Pipe  Supply, Inc. & Supply 

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2020 through 12-31-2020

Renewable Option 01-01-2021 through 12-31-2021

Section VIII - HDPE Perforated Sock Pipe, Flexible - 100 ft. Roll

1.  4" Perforated Under-Drain No Bid 54.00$                  54.00$                           
sock pipe

2.  6" Perforated Under-Drain No Bid 120.00$                120.00$                         
sock pipe

Design Precast & Pipe,Inc. Southern Pipe & Supply
P. O.Box 2401 2202 34th Street

Gulfport, MS  39501
228-863-2025 - phone

228-831-2791 - fax 228-863-1729 - fax
rgregory@designprecast.com; edboykin@southernpipe.com

Gulfport, MS  39505
228-831-5833 - phone
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