Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations

Reewable option 1-01-21 through 12-31-21

“Gulf Coast
Bay Motor | Pump &
Winding Eqmpment Control Systems| Allen J. Harris
Lift Stations with transducers

1 |Duplex panel/10 hp pump No Bid § 9,875.00] % 7,123.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

2 |Duplex panel/15 hp pump : No Bid $ 10,150.00 | $ 7,261.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

3 [Duplex panel/20 hp pump No Bid ¥ 11,650.00[$ 8,283.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

4 IDuplex panel/25 hp pump ; No Bid $ 11,850.00|$ 9,575.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

5 [Duplex panel/30 hp pump ; No Bid $ 13,554.00] $ 9,621.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

Lift Stations with float ball setup

1 |Duplex panel - 5 hp pump i ol No Bid $ 8,580.00]% 5,171.00 No Bid
Brand] = Pri GCPE Control Systems

2 |Duplex panel - 7.5 hp pump No Bid § 9,050.00]$ 5,482.00 No Bid
Brand] GCPE Control Systems

3 |Duplex panel - 10 hp pump No Bid $ 9295001 % 5,619.00 No Bid
Brand GCPE Control Systems

Myers pumps or equal - 230V,3Phase - 40' lead

1 [4vx 30m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 3 hp 3,350.00 No Bid No Bid $ 3,677.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SL

2 |4vx 50m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 5 hp 3,350.00 No Bid No Bid $ 4,180.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SL

3 |4vx 75ma-23 - 4” non-log pump 7.5 hp 3,425.00 No Bid No Bid $ 4,645.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SL

4 |4vx 100ma-23- 4” non-log pump 10 hp 3,510.00 No Bid No Bid $ 5,167.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SL

5 [4vx 150ma-23- 4” non-log pump 15 hp 5,540.00 No Bid No Bid § 7,016.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SE

6 [4vx 200ma-23- 4” non-log pump 20 hp 7,834.00 No Bid No Bid $ 7,571.00
Brand Wilo Grundfos SE

Submersible pumps -

1 |3 hp with 4” discharge 2,796.00 1 $§ 3,899.00 | $ No Bid $ 3,677.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug Grundfos SL

2 |5 hp with 4” discharge 3,050.00 1§ 4,230.00 No Bid $ 4,180.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug Grundfos SL

3 |7.5 hp with 4” discharge 3,300.00 ] § 4,425.00 No Bid $ 4,645.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug | Grundfos SL

4 110 hp with 4” discharge 3,430.00 1% 4,972.00 [:$ No Bid $ 5,167.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug Grundfos SL

5 |15 hp with 4” discharge 4,650.00 1 $ 5,310.00 No Bid $ 7,016.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug Grundfos SE

6 |20 hp with 4” discharge 7,075.00 § 6,517.00 No Bid $ 7,571.00
Brand Wilo Mudbug Grundfos SE

J. H. Wright & Associates, Inc.
27395 Pollard Rd.

Daphne, AL 36526

(228) 238-3320 - phone

(251) 621-8111 - fax
pcoletta@jhwright.com

Gulf Coast Pump & Equipment
1271 Schillinger Rd.
Mobile, AL 36608

(251) 645-5006 - phone
(251) 645-5038 - fax
blaine@gcpemobile.com
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Memorandum - City of Guifport
Purchasing

To:  The Honora‘tl)@ Mayor and City Council

From: Connie Debport, CPPB

Date: November 6, 2019

Ref: Term Contract Group K — Control Panels

Contract Period 01/01/2020 thru 12-31-2020
Renewable Period 01/01/2021 thru 12/31/2021

I have reviewed the bids received on the above referenced group and recommend
acceptance of the lowest and best bids as submitted by J. H. Wright and Gulf Coast
Pump & Equipment as designated by the highlighted columns on attached
spreadsheet.

Thank you for your consideration.




