
*Bell Gravel **Gulf Concrete ***Talley ****Landshapers

  Inc. LLC, Contracting, Inc. Inc.

1 Top soil 12.50$               No Bid 20.00$                      12.00$                       

2 Fill Dirt 7.00$                 No Bid 7.50$                        5.50$                         

3 Fill sand (dry) 7.50$                 No Bid 7.50$                        5.50$                         

4 Washed sand 7.50$                 23.75$                      20.00$                      9.00$                         

5 Mason sand 12.00$               No Bid 25.00$                      12.00$                       

6 Clay and sand mix, 70% clay / 30% sand 8.00$                 No Bid 9.00$                        5.50$                         

7 Red sand - Class 9 8.95$                 No Bid 9.00$                        6.50$                         

8 Alabama Red ball field clay 8.50$                 No Bid 9.00$                        7.00$                         

9 Washed gravel, Class 67 No bid 34.00$                      38.00$                      18.00$                       

10 Pea gravel 26.00$               28.00$                      38.00$                      13.00$                       

11 Clay gravel, Class 3 or 4 No bid No Bid 28.00$                      15.00$                       

12 Clay gravel, Class 5 or 6 No bid No Bid 28.00$                      17.00$                       

13 Washed road gravel, Class 57 No bid No Bid 38.00$                      27.00$                       

14 Crushed gravel, class 67 No bid No Bid 40.00$                      26.00$                       

15 Coarse washed concrete sand 8.50$                 23.75$                      No Bid 12.00$                       

.

*Minimum quantity delivered is 14 cy

**Minimum quantity delivered is 10 cy

***Minimum quantity delivered is 15 cy

****Minimum quantity delivered is 15 cy

Landshapers, Inc.

P. O. Box 995

Gulfport, MS  39502

228-863-8996 - phone

228-868-8878 - fax

landshapersinc.@cableone.net

Group C - Sundry Road Materials

Contract Period 10-01-05 through 09-30-06

All quantities are in cubic yards

Renewed for 10-01-06 through 09-30-07


