Group C3 - Products and Services for Various Types Hot Bituminous Pavement
Contract Period 01-02-07 through 09-30-07
Renwable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Warren |Landshapers,| Bond Paving Williams
Paving, Inc. Inc. Co., Inc. |Paving, Co., LLC
Section I

(prices quoted are per ton)
FOB plant, loaded on City trucks $ 55001 $ 50.00 | $ 53.00 1 $ 51.23
Hot bituminous pavement, Type SC-1
Hot bituminous pavement, Type SC-1 $ 75.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 64.00 | $ 82.95
For overlaying existing pavement in place
Hot bituminous pavement, Type HT $ 86.25 NoBid | $ 72.00 | $ 87.27
For overlaying existing pavement in place
Hot bituminous pavement, Type MT $ 86.25 NoBid | $ 72.00 | $ 87.27
For overlaying existing pavement in place
Hot bituminous pavement, Type ST $ 86.25 NoBid | $ 72.00 | $ 83.06
For overlaying existing pavement in place

Section II

F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type CQS-1H - per gallon
F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type CRS-2 - per gallon
F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type CSS-1 - per gallon
F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid NoBid | $ 27519 3.50
Type SS-1 - per gallon
F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type SS-1H - per 5-gallon bucket
F.O.B. Department of Public Works No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Type SS-1H - per 5-gallon bucket
Bond Paving Co., Inc. Landshapers, Inc.
PO Box 3147 P. O. Box 995
Gulfport, MS 39505 Gulfport, MS 39502
228-863-9894 - phone 228-863-8996 - phone
228-864-5381 - fax 228-868-8878 - fax

iroondjrbpc@cableone.net landshapersinc @cableone.net







