
MS FJ Consolidated Central Pipe Summit

Utilities Turner Pipe & Supply Supply, Inc. Pipe & Supply

Supply Company Company, Inc.

I. Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

1 24" x 24" grates with frames Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid 1,536.00$                    1,269.12$            1,252.80$               

P/N Sigma V-5724-1  V-5724-1

2 36" x 36" grates with frames Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 356.03$               328.00$                  

P/N V-5736 V-5736

3 V5724-1 or equal Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.76$               104.40$                  

P/N V-5724-1 V-5724-1

II. Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Covers & Rings  

1 24" diameter standard lid without rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid 716.40$               684.48$                  

Each 59.70$                 57.04$                    

P/N V-1501 V-1501

2 24" diameter standard lid with ring Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,746.12$            1,664.40$               

Each 145.51$               138.70$                  

P/N V-1403 V-1403

3 24” diameter hinged lid without rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Each

P/N

4 24” diameter hinged lid with rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Each

P/N

5 V1600-3 manhole rings and lids Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,046.60$            1,944.00$               

Each 170.55$               162.00$                  

P/N V-1600-3 V-1600-3

6 V1503-3 manhole rings and lids Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,887.48$            1,783.92$               

Each 157.29$               148.66$                  

P/N V-1503 V-1503

III. Sanitary Sewer and Drain Sewer Manhole Risers

1 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 67.43$                 63.90$                    

P/N V1915-1 V1915-1

2 1 ½” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (23” cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 72.45$                 69.23$                    

P/N V1901-1 V1901-1

3 2" ductile or cast iron manhole risers (23 ½” cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 77.58$                 73.30$                    

P/N V1984-2 V1984-2

4 2" cast iron manhole risers (26 ½” cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 76.41$                 72.20$                    

P/N V1915-2 V1915-2

5 1 ½” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (H-1 24") Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.30$                 59.52$                    

P/N V1907-1 V1907-1

6 2" ductile or cast iron manhole risers (H-1 24") Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 64.69$                 61.14$                    

 P/N V1907-2 V1907-2

7 1 ½” riser for hinged lid type manholes (24”) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P/N

IV. Manhole riser rings

1 24" diameter manhole riser rings (1 ½” high) Each No Bid 90.00$             No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand Turner

P/N 24-1.5

 

2  Polypropylene 27 ½”diameter manhole riser Each No Bid 92.00$             No Bid No Bid No Bid

rings (1 ½” high) Brand Turner

P/N 27.5-1.5

3 24” diameter manhole riser rings for hinged Each No Bid 90.00$             No Bid No Bid No Bid

1½” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (26 ½" cover)

Group J - Ductile or Cast-Iron Grates and Frames

Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07

Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08
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MS FJ Consolidated Central Pipe Summit

Utilities Turner Pipe & Supply Supply, Inc. Pipe & Supply

Supply Company Company, Inc.

Group J - Ductile or Cast-Iron Grates and Frames

Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07

Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

lid type (1-1/2” high) price Brand Turner

P/N 24H-1.5

V. Ductile or cast iron valve boxes

1 18 - 24" height valve box Each No Bid No Bid 22.94$                         21.00$                 20.38$                    

Brand Sigma Star Sigma

P/N 4615 461S 461S

2 24 - 36" height valve box Each No Bid No Bid 33.40$                         30.00$                 29.68$                    

Brand Sigma Star Sigma

P/N 5625 562S 562S

VI. Ductile or cast iron valve box risers   

1 2” Each No Bid No Bid 8.10$                           10.00$                 7.06$                      

Brand Sigma Star Sigma

P/N VBXR-2 VB2602

VII. Ductile or cast iron valve box lids with “water” or “sewer” on top

1 Standard lid Each No Bid No Bid 8.43$                           7.50$                   7.59$                      

Brand Sigma Star Sigma

P/N VBXCVR VB2600W or S

VIII.Meter boxes (Rome, Vulcan, Jefferson Parish)

1 Small w/lid Each No Bid No Bid 25.00$                         22.50$                 23.10$                    

Brand Sigma Russell MB282

P/N Rome Sigma

2  Large w/lid Each No Bid No Bid 73.00$                         65.00$                 64.58$                    

Brand Sigma Russell Sigma

P/N Decatur MB381

Meter box lids only

1 Small (19 1/8” x 9 ¾”) Each No Bid No Bid 9.64$                           No Bid 8.69$                      

Brand Sigma Sigma

P/N Rome MB2821

2 Large, oval type Each No Bid No Bid 36.15$                         No Bid 32.60$                    

Brand Sigma Sigma

P/N Dec-Oval MB3811

3 Large, square type Each No Bid No Bid 37.70$                         No Bid 33.81$                    

Brand Sigma Sigma

P/N D112 MB2831

8,704.37$            8,313.68$               

 Summit Pipe & Supply

 450 Industrial Drive

 Jackson, MS  39209

 601-353-0073 - phone

 601-353-0084 - fax

 dmckinley@summitpipe.com
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