
Control Gulf Coast Bay Motor B.E.A.R. J. H. Wright

Sys., Inc. Pump & Equ. Winding, Inc.  & Assoc.

 Lift stations with transducers  
1 Duplex panel/10 hp pump 9,736.00$        6,458.39$          No bid No bid $10,736.00

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

2 Duplex panel/15 hp pump 9,914.00$        6,458.39$          No bid No bid 10,914.00$           

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

3 Duplex panel/20 hp pump 10,355.00$      7,314.39$          No bid No bid 11,355.00$           

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

4 Duplex panel/25 hp pump 10,514.00$      7,314.39$          No bid No bid 11,514.00$           

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

5 Duplex panel/30 hp pump 11,109.00$      7,314.39$          No bid No bid 12,109.00$           

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

Lift stations with float ball setup

1 Duplex panel - 5 hp pump 6,549.00$        5,237.72$          No bid No bid 7,549.00$             

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

2 Duplex panel - 7.5 hp pump 6,622.00$        5,237.72$          No bid No bid 7,622.00$             

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

3 Duplex panel - 10 hp pump 6,808.00$        5,472.12$          No bid No bid 7,808.00$             

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

Meyers pumps or equal - 230V, 3Phase - 40' lead

1 4vx 30m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 3 hp No bid 2,373.00$          No bid 2,480.00$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

2 4vx 50m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 5 hp No bid 2,640.00$          No bid 2,904.00$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

3 4vx 75ma-23 - 4” non-log pump 7.5 hp No bid 2,926.00$          No bid 3,258.20$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

4 4vx 100ma-23- 4” non-log pump 10 hp No bid 3,684.00$          No bid 4,052.40$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

5 4vx 150ma-23- 4” non-log pump 15 hp No bid 3,977.00$          No bid 4,374.70$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

6 4vx 200ma-23- 4” non-log pump 20 hp No bid 5,584.00$          No bid 5,980.00$     No bid

Brand Meyers Meyers

Renewed for 10-01-06 through 09-30-07

Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations

Contract Period 10-01-05 through 09-30-06
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Renewed for 10-01-06 through 09-30-07
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Submersible pumps - 230/460V

1 3 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 3,347.00$          2,700.00$     2,750.00$             

Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

2 5 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 3,208.00$          2,800.00$     2,804.00$             

Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

3 7.5 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 3,779.00$          3,500.00$     3,050.00$             

Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

4 10 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 4,005.00$          3,800.00$     3,200.00$             
Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

5 15 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 4,519.00$          4,300.00$     3,600.00$             

Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

6 20 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid 4,758.00$          4,800.00$     3,750.00$             

Brand Mudbug Gibco WEMCO

Gulf Coast Pump & Equipment Inc. J. H. Wrigt & Associates

P. O. Box 8529 P. O. Box 1085

Mobile, AL  36689 Daphne, AL  36526

251-645-5006 - phone 251-621-1491 - phone

251-645-5038 - fax 251-621-8111 - fax

bselphgcp@aol.com pcoletta@jhwright.com


