Group M - Water Meters

Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07
Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Central Pipe MS Utility Hughes | Badger
& Supply Supply Supply, Inc. | Meter
Residential Type Size
‘Water meter w/connections 5/87x3/4"
Model Badger| BL PMM No Bid
P/N M25 BLOS-SAA-AAA2 PM20
Price] $ 46.50 | $ 35.00 | $ 32.00
‘Water meter w/connections 1
Model Badger| MIJ PMM
P/N M70 MIJ09-1BD-AAA2 PM50
Price] $ 11650 | $ 77.65 ] $ 90.00
‘Water meter flanged only 112"
Model Badger| MIJ PMM
P/N M120 MI11-1BD-AAA2 PM61
Price] $ 23355] 8 190.00 | $ 174.00
‘Water meter flanged only 2"
Model Badger| MIJ PMM
P/N M170 MI13-1BD-AAA2 PM81
Price] $ 36620 | $ 242.001 $ 280.00
Compound type
Compound meter 2"
Model Badger| DC SRH
P/N| DC-13-1BM-AAA2 Sensus
Price] $ 1,001.15] $ 760.00 | $ 1,075.00
Compound meter 3"
Model Badger| DC SRH
P/N| DC14-1BM-AAA2 Sensus
Price] $ 1,169.65 | $ 985.00 | $ 1,375.00
Compound meter 4"
Model Badger| DC SRH
P/N| DC15-1BM-AAA2 Sensus
Price] $ 1,856.25 1 $ 1,430.00 | $ 2,295.00
Compound meter 6"
Model Badger| DC SRH
P/N DC16-1BM-AAA2 Sensus
Price] $ 2,519.60 | $ 2,525.00 | $ 4,250.00
Compound meter 8"
Model Badger| No Bid SRH
P/N| Sensus
Price| $ 4,530.90 $ 7,500.00
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Group M - Water Meters

Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07
Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Central Pipe MS Utility Hughes | Badger
& Supply Supply Supply, Inc. | Meter
Meter strainers:
I|Meter strainers 1Y
Model No Bid 907 Bronze V
P/N 907150TSA Sensus
Price 176.00 | $ 210.00
2|Meter strainers 2"
Model Badger| 907 Bronze V
P/N 907-150-TSA Sensus
Price $ 187.20 178.00 | $ 210.00
3|Meter strainers 3"
Model Badger| 907 Bronze V
P/N 907-300-TSA Sensus
Price $ 297.45 300.00 | $ 275.00
4] Meter strainers 4"
Model Badger| 907] UL-VSTRAINER
P/N 907-400-TSA Sensus
Price $ 444.65 479.00 1 $ 1,375.00
5|Meter strainers 6"
Model Badger| 907] UL-VSTRAINER
P/N 907-600-TSA Sensus
Price $ 534.00 628.00 | $ 1,980.00
6]Meter strainers 8"
Model Badger| No Bid] UL-VSTRAINER
P/N Sensus
Price $ 1,095.05 $ 2,900.00
Turbine type:
1] Turbine meters 1V
Model Badger| ™ W-120DRS
P/N T-160 TM-11 Sensus
Price 446.85 235.00 1 $ 495.00
2] Turbine meters 2"
Model Badger| ™ W-160DRS
P/N T-200 TM-13 Sensus
Price 460.35 277.00 ] $ 620.00
3] Turbine meters 3"
Model Badger| ™ W-350DRS
P/N T450 TM-14 Sensus
Price 521.24 440.00 | $ 775.00
4] Turbine meters 4"
Model Badger| ™ W-1000DRS
P/N T1000 TM-15 Sensus
Price $ 818.10 575.00 | $ 1,600.00
5] Turbine meters 6"
Model Badger| ™ W-2000DRS
P/N T-2000 TM-16 Sensus
Price $ 2,025.00 1,250.00 | $ 2,700.00
6] Turbine meters 8"
Model Badger| ™ W-3500DRS
P/N T-3500 Sensus
Price $ 2,430.00 1,880.00 | $ 4,200.00
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Group M - Water Meters

Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07
Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Central Pipe MS Utility Hughes | Badger
& Supply Supply Supply, Inc. | Meter
Fire Service Meters:
Fire Service Meter
Model Badger| FC W-2000
PN FSAA FC16 Sensus
Price $ 6,532.90 4,760.00 | $ 6.900.00
Fire Service Meter
Model Badger| FC W-3500
P/IN FSAA FC17 Sensus
Price $ 8,565.85 6,325.00 | $ 9,600.00

Central Pipe Supply, Inc.
P.O. Box 5470

Pearl, MS 39288
800-844-7700 - phone
601-932-8944 - fax
dtownsend @centralpipe.com

MS Utilities

14231 Seaway Road
Gulfport, MS 39503
228-863-2727 - phone
228-863-6587 - fax
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