Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 10-01-08 through 09-30-09
Renewable 10-01-09 through 09-30-10

Hanson Advanced Southern Design
Pipe & Drainage Waterworks Precast
Products, Inc. | Systems Supply & Pipe
(ADS) Inc.

Section I - Ram Neck, Gasket Only
1. 1"X2'5" $ 2.15 No Bid No Bid 2.40
2.11/2"X3'5" $ 3.19 No Bid No Bid 3.78
3. 13/4"X 35" $ 4.68 No Bid No Bid 4.35]
Section Il - Round Concrete Pipe ASTM C-76, Class 111 w/Rubber Gasket
Diameter
1. 15" $ 13.26 No Bid No Bid 13.05
2. 18" $ 14.69 No Bid No Bid 14.88
3. 21" $ 20.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. 24" $ 24.38 No Bid No Bid 24.37
5. 27" $ 30.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. 30" $ 33.90 No Bid No Bid 34.02
7. 36" $ 48.14 No Bid No Bid 47.83
8. 42" $ 60.22 No Bid No Bid 60.27
9. 48" $ 78.54 No Bid No Bid 78.58
10. 54" $ 96.50 No Bid No Bid 96.33
11. 60" $ 116.96 No Bid No Bid 116.83
12. 66" $ 141.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
13. 72" $ 163.58 No Bid No Bid 163.55
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14. 84" $ 221.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15. 96" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16. 108" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section I11 - Concrete Arch - ASTM C-506, Class I11 w/Preformed Mastic
Diameter Per Linear Foot
1. 18X11 $ 25.75 No Bid No Bid 25.86
2.22X13 $ 27.75 No Bid No Bid 27.83
3.29X18 $ 33.50 No Bid No Bid 33.31
4. 36X23 $ 40.15 No Bid No Bid 40.18
5. 44 X 27 $ 55.65 No Bid No Bid 55.43
6. 51 X 31 $ 72.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7. 58 X 36 $ 91.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. 65X 40 $ 111.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
9. 73X 45 $ 139.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10. 88 X 54 $ 192.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 10-01-08 through 09-30-09
Renewable 10-01-09 through 09-30-10

Hanson Advanced Southern Design
Pipe & Drainage Waterworks Precast
Products, Inc. | Systems Supply & Pipe
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Concrete Flared End Sections Hanson Pipe & PreCast Advanced Drainage Systems Southern Waterworks Supply Design Precast
Round Arch Round Arch Round Arch Round Arch

1. 15" 404.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2.18" 404.00 404.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3. 24" 464.00 464.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. 30" 512.00 512.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5. 36" 874.00 874.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. 42" 1,112.00 1,112.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7. 48" 1,218.00 1,218.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. 54" 1,460.00 1,460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9. 60" 1,847.00 1,871.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10. 66" 2,039.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11. 72" 2,380.00 2,380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section IV - HDPE Pipe Water Tight (Bell End) Connection, Smooth Interior
Diameter
1. 15" No Bid | $ 8.29 8.77 No Bid
2. 18" No Bid | $ 11.64 12.31 No Bid
3. 24" No Bid | $ 18.22 19.26 No Bid
4. 30" No Bid | $ 28.73 30.36 No Bid
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5. 36" No Bid | $ 34.92 36.90 No Bid
6. 42" No Bid | $ 49.38 52.17 No Bid
7. 48" No Bid | $ 59.50 59.87 No Bid
8. 60" No Bid | $ 99.44 110.33 No Bid
Section IV - Nyloplast or Equal, PVC Drain Basins with Lockable Cast Iron Grates
1. 15" No Bid | $ 595.00 625.94 No Bid
2. 18” No Bid | $ 695.00 729.97 No Bid
3. 24” No Bid | $ 845.00 906.93 No Bid
4. 30 NoBid | $ 1,290.00 1,404.89 No Bid
Section V - HDPE Pipe Perforated Sock Pipe — 20" Sections - Price per section
Diameter
1. 4” Flexible NoBid | $ 53.00 56.00 No Bid
2. 4” Rigid No Bid | $ 19.80 22.00 No Bid
3. 6” Rigid No Bid | $ 47.40 50.00 No Bid
4. 8” Rigid No Bid | $ 79.20 83.80 No Bid
5. 10” Rigid No Bid | $ 113.20 119.40 No Bid
6. 12” Rigid No Bid | $ 128.60 135.60 No Bid
7. 15" Rigid No Bid | $ 172.60 182.20 No Bid
8. 18" Rigid No Bid | $ 243.40 257.20 No Bid
9. 24” Rigid No Bid | $ 378.20 399.60 No Bid
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Section VI - HDPE Pipe, 20" Sections
Diameter
2. 15" Flared End NoBid | $ 95.71 1 $ 94.75 No Bid
3. 18" Flared End NoBid | $ 12757 $ 127.28 No Bid
4. 24” Flared End NoBid | $ 165.00 | $ 163.35 No Bid
Section VII - HDPE Perforated Sock Pipe, Flexibale - 100 ft. Roll
1. 4" Perforated Under-Drain Stock Pipe No Bid | $ 53.00 | $ 56.00 No Bid
2. 6" Perforated Under-Drain Sock Pipe No Bid | $ 146.00 | $ 152.00 No Bid

Hanson Pipe & Products, Inc.

P. 0. Box 2217
Gulfport, MS 39505
228-863-2000 - voice
228-864-7288 - fax

jeff.bassett@hanson.biz

Advanced Drainage System, Inc. (ADS)
P. 0. Box 550

Saucier, MS 39574

228-832-7974 - voice

228-832-8188 - fax

stevethomas007 @bellsouth.net

Southern Waterworks Supply, Inc.

497 Cole Road
Hattiesburg, MS 39402
601-268-7463 - voice
601-296-0353 - fax

sws_Kevin@yahoo.com
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