
Control Gulf Coast Bay Motor General Pump JH Wright
Sys., Inc. Pump & Equ. Winding, Inc. & Equipment & Associates

 Lift stations with transducers   
1 Duplex panel/10 hp pump 6,321.00$        5,510.00$          No bid No bid 11,301.00$          

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

2 Duplex panel/15 hp pump 6,599.00$        5,913.00$         No bid No bid 11,488.00$         
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

3 Duplex panel/20 hp pump 8,028.00$        6,552.00$         No bid No bid 11,953.00$         
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

4 Duplex panel/25 hp pump 8,072.00$        6,851.00$          No bid No bid 12,120.00$          
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

5 Duplex panel/30 hp pump 8,776.00$        7,840.00$          No bid No bid 12,746.00$          
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

Lift stations with float ball setup
1 Duplex panel - 5 hp pump 5,320.00$        3,942.00$          No bid No bid 7,946.00$            

Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

Renewable Option 10-01-09 through 09-30-10

Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations
Contract Period 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

2 Duplex panel - 7.5 hp pump 5,406.00$        3,958.00$         No bid No bid 8,023.00$           
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

3 Duplex panel - 10 hp pump 5,630.00$        4,252.00$          No bid No bid 8,219.00$            
Brand CSI GCP&E BCC

Meyers pumps or equal - 230V, 3Phase - 40' lead
1 4vx 30m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 3 hp No bid 3,481.00$          No bid No bid 3,146.00$            

Brand Myers Goulds

2 4vx 50m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 5 hp No bid 3,767.00$          No bid No bid 3,325.00$            
Brand Myers Goulds

3 4vx 75ma-23 - 4” non-log pump 7.5 hp No bid 4,074.00$         No bid No bid 4,650.00$           
Brand Myers Goulds

4 4vx 100ma-23- 4” non-log pump 10 hp No bid 4,997.00$         No bid No bid 4,875.00$           
Brand Myers Goulds

5 4vx 150ma-23- 4” non-log pump 15 hp No bid 5,224.00$         No bid No bid 5,425.00$           
Brand Myers Goulds

6 4vx 200ma-23- 4” non-log pump 20 hp No bid 8,001.00$          No bid No bid 5,825.00$            
Brand Myers GouldsBrand Myers Goulds

Submersible pumps - 230/460V
1 3 hp with 4” discharge No bid 2,532.00$          3,370.00$         5,574.00$             4,084.00$            



Control Gulf Coast Bay Motor General Pump JH Wright
Sys., Inc. Pump & Equ. Winding, Inc. & Equipment & Associates

 Lift stations with transducers   

Renewable Option 10-01-09 through 09-30-10

Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations
Contract Period 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

2 5 hp with 4” discharge No bid 2,796.00$          3,370.00$         5,473.00$             4,101.00$            
Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

3 7.5 hp with 4” discharge No bid 3,029.00$         4,230.00$        5,618.00$             4,275.00$           
Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

4 10 hp with 4” discharge No bid 3,450.00$         4,475.00$        6,379.00$             4,712.00$           
Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

5 15 hp with 4” discharge No bid 3,825.00$         4,908.00$        7,107.00$             5,326.00$           
Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

6 20 hp with 4” discharge No bid 4,010.00$         5,272.00$        7,421.00$             5,635.00$           
Brand Myers Mudbug Essco Wemco

Gulf Coast Pump & Equipment
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Mobile, AL 36608
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