
  Central Pipe Supply Empire Pipe & Supply

Residential Type Size Mfg Unit Price Mfg Unit Price
Water meter with connections 5/8" x 3/4" No Bid BL05-5AA-AAA-2 44.00$               
Water meter with connections 1" No Bid MJ09-1BD-AAA-2 94.00$               
Water meter flanged only 1- 1/2" No Bid MJ11-1BD-AAA-2 235.00$             
Water meter flanged only 2" No Bid MJ13-1BD-AAA-2 340.00$             
Compound Type
Compound Meter 2" No Bid DC13-1BM-AAG-2 1,100.00$          
Compound Meter 3" No Bid DC14-1BM-AAA-2 1,425.00$          
Compound Meter 4" No Bid DC15-1BM-AAA-2 2,075.00$          
Compound Meter 6" No Bid DC16-1BM-AAA-2 3,925.00$          
Compound Meter 8" No Bid No Bid
Meter Strainers
Meter Strainers 2" Badger 185.60$      907 200 TSA 235.00$             
Meter Strainers 3" Badger 315.60$      907 300 TSA 390.00$             
Meter Strainers 4" Badger 462.25$      907 400 TSA 550.00$             
Meter Strainers 6" Badger 580.00$      907 600 TSA 780.00$             
Meter Strainers 8" Badger 1,180.00$   907 800 TS 1,515.00$          
Turbine Type
Turbine Meters 1-1/2" Badger 424.00$      TM11-1BM-AAG-2 410.00$             
Turbine Meters 2" Badger 474 00$ TM13 1BM AAG 2 470 00$

Group M - Fire Service Meters
Contract Period 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

Renewable Option 10-01-09 through 09-30-10

Turbine Meters 2 Badger 474.00$      TM13-1BM-AAG-2 470.00$             
Turbine Meters 3" Badger 549.00$      TM14-1BM-AAG-2 650.00$             
Turbine Meters 4" Badger 857.35$       TM15-1BM-AAG-2 995.00$              
Turbine Meters 6" Badger 2,174.00$    TM16-1BM-AAG-2 1,875.00$           
Turbine Meters 8" Badger 2,340.70$    TM17-1BM-AAG-2 2,595.00$           
Meter Strainers
Meter Strainers 1- 1/2" Badger No Bid 907 150 TSA 235.00$              
Meter Strainers 2" Badger 185.60$       907 200 TSA 235.00$              
Meter Strainers 3" Badger 315.60$       907 300 TSA 390.00$              
Meter Strainers 4" Badger 462.25$       907 400 TSA 550.00$              
Meter Strainers 6" Badger 580.00$       907 600 TSA 780.00$              
Meter Strainers 8" Badger 1,180.00$    907 800 TS 1,515.00$           
Fire Service Meter:
Fire Service Meter: 6" No Bid FC16-1BM-AAA-2 8,175.00$           
Fire Service Meter: 8" No Bid FC17-1BM-AAA-2 11,250.00$         
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