
Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Section I - Ram Neck, Gasket Only

1.  1" X 2' 5" $2.75 No Bid $2.40 No Bid No Bid

2.  1 1/2" X 3' 5" $4.25 No Bid $3.78 No Bid No Bid

3.  1 3/4" X 3' 5" $4.75 No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid

Section II - Round Concrete Pipe ASTM C-76, Class III w/Rubber Gasket

 Diameter

1.  15" $10.15 No Bid $12.76 No Bid No Bid

2.  18"               $12.00 No Bid $14.11 No Bid No Bid

3.  21"              $20.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.  24"               $21.25 No Bid $23.26 No Bid No Bid

5.  27"               $29.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.  30"               $30.75 No Bid $32.25 No Bid No Bid

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

1 of 7



Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

7.  36"               $40.05 No Bid $45.70 No Bid No Bid

8.  42"               $51.05 No Bid $57.10 No Bid No Bid

9.  48"               $68.15 No Bid $74.40 No Bid No Bid

10.  54"               $85.25 No Bid $91.13 No Bid No Bid

11.  60"               $105.10 No Bid $110.46 No Bid No Bid

12.  66"               $143.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13.  72"               $150.90 No Bid $154.48 No Bid No Bid

14.  84"               $224.00 No Bid $224.00 No Bid No Bid

15.  96"               No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16.  108"              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section III - Concrete Arch - ASTM C-506, Class III w/Preformed Mastic

Diameter Per Linear Foot  

1.  18 X 11 $19.00 No Bid $26.46 No Bid No Bid

2.  22 X 13 $22.65 No Bid $26.46 No Bid No Bid
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Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

3.  29 X 18 $31.10 No Bid $31.86 No Bid No Bid

4.  36 X 23 $37.75 No Bid $38.17 No Bid No Bid

 5.  44 X 27 $51.95 No Bid $52.92 No Bid No Bid

6.  51 X 31 $68.85 No Bid $69.15 No Bid No Bid

7.  58 X 36 $87.20 No Bid $87.15 No Bid No Bid

8.  65 X 40 $105.45 No Bid $105.74 No Bid No Bid

9.  73 X 45 $134.50 No Bid $135.15 No Bid No Bid

10.  88 X 54 $251.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Round/ Arch Round/ Arch Round/ Arch

1.  15" $340.60 No Bid 382.00$                     No Bid No Bid

2.  18" $340.60 No Bid 382.00$                     No Bid No Bid

3.  24" $356.00 No Bid 439.00$                     No Bid No Bid

Concrete Flared End Sections
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Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

4.  30" $391.00 No Bid 484.00$                     No Bid No Bid

5.  36" $740.00 No Bid 826.00$                     No Bid No Bid

6.  42" $936.00 No Bid 1,049.00$                  No Bid No Bid

7.  48" $993.00 No Bid 1,150.00$                  No Bid No Bid

8.  54" $1,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.  60" $1,795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.  66" $1,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.  72" $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section IV - HDPE Pipe Water Tight (Bell End) Connection, Smooth Interior

Diameter

1.  15" No Bid $7.29 No Bid $7.29 $7.29

2.  18" No Bid $8.49 No Bid $8.49 $8.49

3.  24" No Bid $15.88 No Bid $15.88 $15.88

4.  30" No Bid $22.98 No Bid $22.98 $22.98
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Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

5.  36" No Bid $29.10 No Bid $29.10 $29.10

6.  42" No Bid $36.65 No Bid $36.65 $36.65

7.  48" No Bid $47.78 No Bid $47.78 $47.78

8. 60" No Bid $84.00 No Bid $84.00 $84.00

Section V - Nyloplast or Equal, PVC Drain Basins with Lockable Cast Iron Grates

1.  15” No Bid $679.00 No Bid $679.00 $679.00

2.  18” No Bid $795.00 No Bid $795.00 $795.00

3.  24” No Bid $959.00 No Bid $959.00 $959.00

4.  30” No Bid $1,509.00 No Bid $1,509.00 $1,509.00

Section VI - HDPE Pipe Perforated Sock Pipe – 20’ Sections - Price per section

Diameter

1.  4” Flexible No Bid $49.00 No Bid $49.00 $49.00

2.  4” Rigid No Bid $27.80 No Bid $27.80 $27.80

3.  6” Rigid No Bid $51.00 No Bid $51.00 $51.00

4.  8” Rigid No Bid $77.00 No Bid $77.00 $77.00
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Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

5.  10” Rigid No Bid $104.00 No Bid $104.00 $104.00

6.  12” Rigid No Bid $124.00 No Bid $124.00 $124.00

7.  15” Rigid No Bid $160.00 No Bid $160.00 $160.00

8.  18” Rigid No Bid $220.00 No Bid $220.00 $220.00

9.  24” Rigid No Bid $350.00 No Bid $350.00 $350.00
 

Section VII - HDPE Pipe, 20' Sections

 

Diameter

2.  15” Flared End No Bid $124.42 No Bid $124.42 $124.42

3.  18” Flared End No Bid $167.14 No Bid $167.14 $167.14

4.  24” Flared End No Bid $214.50 No Bid $214.50 $214.50
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Hanson Pipe G & O Supply, Inc. Design Precast & Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe

& Precast Pipe, Inc. Systems & Supply

Hattiesburg/Gulfport Saucier, MS Gulfport, MS Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

Section VIII - HDPE Perforated Sock Pipe, Flexible - 100 ft. Roll

1.  4" Perforated Under-Drain Stock Pipe No Bid $49.00 No Bid $49.00 $49.00

2.  6" Perforated Under-Drain Sock Pipe No Bid $139.00 No Bid $139.00 $139.00

Barry Hatten Ted Forbes

Hanson Pipe & Precast G & O Supply, Inc.

6934 Highway 49 North 18088 Highway 49 

Hattiesburg, MS 39401 Saucier, MS 39574

Phone - (601)268-2081 Phone- (228)832-9655

Fax- (601)264-7123 Fax- (228)832-9677

barry.hatten@lehighhanson.com tforbes@gosupplyinc.com

Chris A. Fore Steve Thomas Edward Boykin

Design Precast & Pipe Advanced Drainage Southern Pipe Supply

P.O. Box 2401 205 Apache Dr. 2202 34th St.

Gulfport, MS 39505 Jackson, MS Gulfport, MS

Phone- (228)831-5833 Phone- (228)861-7974 Phone- (228)863-2505

Fax- (228)831-2791 Fax- (228)832-2346 Fax- (228)863-1729

rgregory@designprecast.com steve.thomas@ads-pipe.com eboykin@southernpipe.com
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