
Warren Landshapers,

  Paving, Inc. Inc.

Section I

(prices quoted are per ton)   
1 FOB plant, loaded on City trucks 57.00$                              58.00$                              

Hot bituminous pavement, Type SC-1

2 Hot bituminous pavement, Type SC-1 74.00$                              70.00$                              

For overlaying existing pavement in place

3 Hot bituminous pavement, Type HT       

For overlaying existing pavement in place

9.5 MM 81.00$                              80.00$                              

19 MM 72.50$                              71.00$                              

4 Hot bituminous pavement, Type MT     

For overlaying existing pavement in place

9.5 MM 79.00$                              80.00$                              

19 MM 70.00$                              71.00$                              

5 Hot bituminous pavement, Type ST      

For overlaying existing pavement in place

9.5 MM 78.50$                              80.00$                              

19 MM 70.00$                              71.00$                              

Section II   

1 F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid

Type CQS-1H - per gallon

2 F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid

Type CRS-2 - per gallon

3 F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid

Type CSS-1 - per gallon

4 F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid 5.00$                                

Type SS-1 - per gallon

5 F.O.B. our plant, loaded on city trucks No Bid No Bid

Type SS-1H - per 5-gallon bucket

6 F.O.B. Department of Public Works No Bid No Bid

Type SS-1H - per 5-gallon bucket

 

  

Landshapers, Inc. Warren Paving

P. O. Box 995

Gulfport, MS  39502

228-863-8996 - phone

228-868-8878 - fax

landshapersinc@cableone.net

 

Group C3 - Products and Services for Various Types Hot Bituminous Pavement

Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14

 

Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

mailto:landshapersinc@cableone.net

