
Mississippi Utilities Central Pipe Southern Pipe & Supply

Supply & Supply Water & Sewer Sales

I Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

1 Standard 24” x 24” Grate w/ Frame

     EJIW: V-5624 $293.00 $325.00 $300.00

     NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Standard 24” x 24” Grate Only

     EJIW: V-5624 $166.00 $185.00 $170.00

     NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 ADA Compliant 24” x 24” Grate w/ Frame

     EJIW: V-5624-80 $317.00 $345.00 $328.00

     NFCo: R1879-A6G (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 ADA Compliant 24” x 24” Grate Only

     EJIW: V-5624-80 $190.00 $205.00 $200.00

     NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid

II Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Frames & Covers

1 Standard 24" Manhole Frame w/Cover

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) $244.00 $273.00 $249.61

NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) $244.00 $273.00 $249.61

NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Standard 24" Manhole Cover Only

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) $99.00 $109.85 $103.76

NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) $99.00 $109.85 $103.76

NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Hinged 24" Manhole Frame & Cover

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) $345.00 $385.00 $364.15

NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) $345.00 $385.00 $364.15

NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16



Mississippi Utilities Central Pipe Southern Pipe & Supply

Supply & Supply Water & Sewer Sales

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

4 Reversible 24" Manhole Frame w/Cover

EJIW: V-1600-3 (Labeled SEWER) $227.00 $242.00 $239.00

NFCo: R-1642-A (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

EJIW: W-1600-3 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) $227.00 $242.00 $239.00

NFCo: R1642-A (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Reversible 24" Manhole Cover Only

EJIW: V-1600-3 (Labeled SEWER) $122.00 $132.00 $127.82

NFCo: R-1642-A (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

EJIW: W-1600-3 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) $122.00 $132.00 $127.82

NFCo: R1642-A (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Reversible 26.5" Manhole Cover Only No Bid

EJIW: 1090 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

NFCo: R-1712 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid

III Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Frames & Covers with custom logo

1 Standard 24” Manhole Frame w/ Cover

     EJIW: 1040 $245.00 $320.00 $249.61

     NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid

     EJIW: 1040 $245.00 $320.00 $249.61

     NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Standard 24” Manhole Cover Only

     EJIW: 1040 $99.00 $109.85 $103.76

     NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid

     EJIW: 1040 $99.00 $109.85 $103.76

     NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Hinged 24” Manhole Frame & Cover

     EJIW: 1040 $345.00 $368.00 $364.15

     NFCo: R-1642-LM No Bid No Bid No Bid

     EJIW: 1040 $345.00 $368.00 $364.15

     NFCo: R-1642-LM No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Reversable 24” Manhole Frame w/ Cover

     EJIW: V-1600-3 $227.00 $254.00 $239.00

     NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid

     EJIW: V-1600-3 $227.00 $254.00 $239.00

     NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Reversable 24” Manhole Cover Only

     EJIW: V-1600-3 $122.00 $132.00 $127.82

     NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid



Mississippi Utilities Central Pipe Southern Pipe & Supply

Supply & Supply Water & Sewer Sales

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

     EJIW: V-1600-3 $122.00 $132.00 $127.82

     NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid

IV Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riser Rings

1 Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

     1” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) $84.00 $91.00 No Bid

     2” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) $87.00 $94.00 No Bid

2 Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

     1” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     2” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

     1” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) $100.00 $106.10 No Bid

     2” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) $108.00 $116.00 No Bid

2 Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

     1” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

     2” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

V Composite Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riser Rings

1 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

     1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

     1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

     1.5” Rise (For 24” x 2” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

     1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid



Mississippi Utilities Central Pipe Southern Pipe & Supply

Supply & Supply Water & Sewer Sales

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

5 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

1.5" Rise (For 26" x 1.5" Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring

1.5" Rise (for 26" x 2" Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

VI Ductile or cast iron valve boxes

1 18 - 24" height valve box $27.00 $30.00 $33.00

Brand Sigma Star Star

P/N VB261 461-S VB461S

2  24 - 36" height valve box $38.00 $42.00 $48.00

Brand Sigma Star Star

P/N VB262 652-S VB562S

VII Ductile or cast iron valve box risers

1 2” $8.00 $10.95 $13.00

Brand Sigma Star Star

P/N  VB2602 VBR2 VBR2

VIII Ductile or cast iron valve box lids with “Water” or “Sewer” on top

1 Standard lid $7.95 $9.10 $10.00

Brand Sigma Star Star

P/N VB2600 VBLIDW/S VBLDW/VBLIDS

IX Meter boxes (Rome, Vulcan, Jefferson Parish)

1 Small w/lid $32.00 $33.50 $36.50

Brand Sigma Star Star

P/N MB282 MBD1910 MBD1910

2 Large w/lid $198.00 $82.10 $38.00

Brand Sigma Sigma Star

P/N MB381 MB283 MBX1



Mississippi Utilities Central Pipe Southern Pipe & Supply

Supply & Supply Water & Sewer Sales

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Renewable Option 01-01-16 through 12-31-16

X Meter box lids only

1 Small (19 1/8” x 9 ¾”) $11.95 $11.00 No Bid

Brand Sigma Star No Bid

P/N MB2821 MBX1L No Bid

2 Large, oval type $69.95 No Bid No Bid

Brand Sigma No Bid

P/N MB3811 No Bid

3 Large, square type $69.95 No Bid No Bid

Brand Sigma No Bid

P/N MB2831 No Bid

edward.boykin@southernpipe.com

Edward Boykin

Southern Pipe & Supply

2202 34th St.

Gulfport, MS 39501

Phone-(228)863-2505

Fax- (228)863-1729

Mississippi Utilities

14231 Seaway Rd, Unit B-5

Gulfport, MS 39503

Bryan Tagert

Central Pipe Supply

P.O. Box 5470

Pearl, MS 39208

Phone- (228)863-2757

william.turner@ferguson.com

Fax- (228)863-6587

Bill Turner

Phone- (800)844-7700

Fax- (601)932-8944

btagert@cenralpipe.com
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