Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

Municipal service tubing |

Copper tube size OD ASTM D-2737-SDR9 (PE3408) Drisco pipe or equal

Y% per ft $0.18 $0.18 $0.18 $0.19 $0.18
Brand ADS ADS ADS ADS Endot

1” per ft $0.29 $0.28 $0.29 $0.30 $0.29
Brand ADS ADS ADS ADS Endot

7% per ft $0.43 $0.38 $0.39 $0.40 $0.38
Brand ADS ADS ADS ADS Endot

1 %7 per ft $0.60 $0.57 $0.59 $0.61 $0.58
Brand ADS ADS ADS ADS Endot

2” per ft $0.99 $0.89 $0.94 $0.95 $0.89
Brand ADS ADS ADS ADS Endot

. |[PVC Pressure Pipe

All PVC pressure pipe is to be as slip joint pipe.

4" per Ift $2.00 $2.08 $2.10 $2.02 $3.43
Brand Sanderson Diamondjson/Napco/Diamond Vulcan Plastics

6" per Ift $3.97 $4.12 $4.15 $3.99 $6.69
Brand Sanderson Diamondjson/Napco/Diamond Vulcan Plastics

8" per Ift $6.88 $7.15 $7.16 $6.92 $11.49
Brand Sanderson Diamondjson/Napco/Diamond Vulcan Plastics

10" per Ift $10.32 $10.73 $10.60 $10.39 $17.48
Brand Sanderson Diamondjson/Napco/Diamond Vulcan Plastics

lorsZ




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

5 |12" per Ift $14.57 $15.15 $15.07 $14.66 $24.70
Brand Sanderson Diamondjson/Napco/Diamond Vulcan Plastics

6 |16" per Ift $28.90 $31.86 No Bid $29.63 $38.89
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics

11.]PVC sewer fittings SDR35 glue type

1 |4" Sleeve ea $1.62 $1.33 $1.20 $1.32 $1.23
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

2 |6" sleeve ea $5.40 $4.86 $4.64 $4.80 $4.51
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

3 |4" with a 1/16" bend 22.5 ea $2.50 $2.20 $1.92 $2.18 $2.05
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

4 16” with a 1/16” bend 22.5° ea $10.00 $9.67 $8.22 $9.56 $8.97
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

5 |4" with a 1/8" bend 45° ea $2.35 $2.01 $1.65 $1.99 $1.87
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

6 |6” with a 1/8” bend 45° ea $8.20 $7.90 $6.73 $7.81 $7.35
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

7 |4" with a 1/4" bend 90° ea $2.90 $2.33 $1.99 $2.31 $2.18
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

8 |6” with a '4” bend 90° ea $8.85 $8.59 $7.10 $8.49 $6.82
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal

9 |4" bell cap ea $1.30 $1.17 $1.12 $1.15 $1.08
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
10 |6" bell cap ea $4.80 $4.26 $4.07 $4.21 $3.95
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
11 |8"x 6" saddle "PVC" WYE ea $23.85 $20.33 No Bid $20.11 $18.90
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
12 |6"x 6" saddle "PVC" WYE ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.11 $34.90
Brand Plastic Trends Royal
13 16"x 4" reducers ea $6.90 $6.46 $6.10 $6.38 $5.99
Brand Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
14 |8"x 6" reducers ea $27.00 $27.32 $24.50 $27.02 $25.32
Brand Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
15 |4" clean out SW-MPT (w/o plug) ea $3.11 $2.64 $3.78 $2.62 $2.45
Brand Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
16 |4" clean out plug MPT ea $1.92 $1.60 $2.30 $1.58 $1.49
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
17 |6" clean out SW-MPT (w/o plug) ea $12.50 $12.48 $10.20 $12.34 $11.59
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
18 |6" clean out plug MPT ea $8.50 $8.07 $8.45 $7.98 $7.49
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
19 |6" WYE-SW ea $17.00 $15.57 $13.39 $15.40 $14.44
Brand Plastic Trends Multifitting Multifitting Plastic Trends Royal
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
IV.|Ductile iron pressure main
Ductile iron pipe

1 |4" Mechanical Joint ea $21.75 $24.43 No Bid $20.85 $26.48
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
4" Slip Joint ea $21.75 $24.13 No Bid $20.85 $24.98
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
2 |6" Mechanical Joint ea $32.11 $34.56 No Bid $29.46 $37.47
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
6" Slip Joint ea $20.38 $18.38 No Bid $18.55 $22.25
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
3 18" Mechanical Joint ea $37.45 $41.66 No Bid $35.55 $45.17
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
8" Slip Joint ea $23.00 $23.90 No Bid $21.28 $25.53
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
4 110" Mechanical Joint ea $48.00 $54.87 No Bid $46.80 $59.49
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
10" Slip Joint ea $28.85 $31.24 No Bid $28.14 $33.74
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
5 |12" Mechanical Joint ea $60.10 $68.78 No Bid $58.65 $74.58
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
12" Slip Joint ea $35.95 $39.39 No Bid $35.16 $42.17
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

6 |16" Mechanical Joint ea $82.95 $99.43 No Bid $84.77 $107.81
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe
16" Slip Joint ea $50.70 $57.03 No Bid $50.80 $60.61
Brand McWane American McWane US Pipe

V. |PVC sewer pipe
1 |4" per Ift $0.83 $0.86 $0.88 $1.11 $1.10
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics US Pipe
2 |6" per Ift $1.77 $1.86 $1.91 $2.38 $2.40
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics US Pipe
3 18" per Ift $3.20 $3.33 $3.41 $4.29 $4.30
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics US Pipe
4 110" per Ift $5.02 $5.22 $5.70 $6.73 $6.74
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics US Pipe
5 |12" per Ift $7.22 $7.50 $7.71 $9.59 $9.69
Brand Sanderson Diamond Vulcan Plastics US Pipe

V1. | Ductile iron fittings
Tees

1 |4x4"MJ ea $60.40 $40.96 $36.76 $38.40 $40.96
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
2 |6x4"MJ ea $90.00 $68.82 $61.77 $64.52 $68.82
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
3 16 x6"MJ ea $96.40 $73.89 $66.32 $69.27 $76.89
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
4 18x 4" MJ ea $103.60 $79.80 $71.63 $74.81 $79.80
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
518 x6"MJ ea $115.20 $92.04 $83.00 $86.29 $92.04
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
6 |8x8"MJ ea $134.00 $111.04 $100.73 $104.10 $111.04
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
7 |12 x 4" MJ ea $176.40 $149.89 $135.96 $132.60 $149.89
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
8 |12 x 6" MJ ea $178.00 $149.89 $137.80 $132.60 $149.89
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
9 |12 x 8" MJ ea $200.80 $173.11 $157.03 $162.29 $173.11
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
10 |12 x 12" MJ ea $250.80 $221.67 $201.00 $207.81 $221.67
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Elbows - 22.5 Degree bends
11 |4" MJ ea $37.60 $24.49 $22.22 $22.96 $24.49
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
12 |6" MJ ea $53.60 $38.00 $34.11 $35.63 $38.00
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
13 18" MJ ea $75.20 $59.11 $53.06 $55.42 $59.11
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
14 (12" MJ ea $136.40 $115.27 $103.46 $108.06 $115.27
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
Elbows - 45 Degree bends
15 |4" MJ ea $38.80 $25.76 $23.12 $24.15 $25.76
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
16 |6" MJ ea $56.80 $41.38 $37.15 $38.79 $41.38
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
17 |8" MJ ea $76.40 $60.38 $55.00 $56.60 $60.38
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
18 |12" MJ ea $152.00 $131.73 $120.00 $123.50 $131.73
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Elbows - 90 Degree bends
19 |4" MJ ea $44.00 $31.24 $28.05 $29.29 $31.24
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
20 |6" MJ ea $66.00 $51.09 $46.02 $47.90 $51.09
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
21 18" MJ ea $89.60 $74.31 $66.70 $69.97 $74.31
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
22 12" MJ ea $178.10 $159.18 $143.00 $149.23 $159.18
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Crosses
23 |4 x 4" ea $112.40 $88.24 $79.20 $82.73 $88.24
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
24 |6 x 4" ea $135.00 $96.27 $86.40 $90.25 $96.27
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
25 |6 x 6" ea $143.20 $108.09 $270.00 $101.33 $108.09
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
26 |8 x 6" ea $148.55 $111.89 $104.00 $104.90 $111.89
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
27 18 x 8" ea $150.00 $117.80 $107.00 $110.44 $117.80
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Reducers - Spigot Both Ends
28 |6 x 4" ea No Bid $35.89 $32.50 $35.65 $35.89
Brand Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
29 |18 x 4" ea No Bid $53.62 $48.13 $50.27 $53.62
Brand Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
30 |8 x6" ea No Bid $56.58 $50.80 $53.04 $56.58
Brand Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
31|12 x 6" ea No Bid $94.16 $85.40 $88.27 $94.16
Brand Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
32 |12 x 8" ea No Bid $97.11 $88.04 $91.04 $97.11
Brand Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Reducers - Spigot to MJ
3316 x 4" ea $44.80 $30.40 $27.40 $43.54 $30.40
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
3418 x 4" ea $65.60 $51.51 $46.24 $49.48 $51.51
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
3518 x6" ea $128.00 $46.44 $41.69 $39.98 $46.44
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union o e, OMAr
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
36 |12 x 6" ea $120.50 $103.87 $92.85 $89.85 $103.44
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
37 |12 x 8" ea $100.00 $80.64 $74.50 $92.60 $80.64
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Reducers - MJ Both Ends
3816 x 4" ea $44.00 $29.56 $26.53 $27.71 $29.56
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
39 |8 x4" ea $5.20 $40.53 $36.38 $38.00 $40.53
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
40 I8 x 6" ea $59.20 $43.07 $39.00 $40.38 $43.07
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
41 112 x 6" ea $92.00 $73.47 $65.94 $68.88 $73.47
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
42 112 x 8" ea $94.80 $75.58 $68.60 $70.85 $73.36
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
43 112 x 10" ea $108.00 $83.60 $76.00 $78.38 $83.60
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Retaining Glands (mega-lug design) - ""Retainers"’
44 14" MJ ea $24.95 $25.40 $23.99 $24.10 $22.00
Brand Tyler Union Tyler Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
45 16" MJ ea $33.80 $31.80 $30.04 $30.20 $26.00
Brand Tyler Union Tyler Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
8" MJ ea $44.50 $42.90 $40.53 $40.65 $35.00
Brand Tyler Union Tyler Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
12" MJ ea $83.20 $78.40 $74.05 $74.27 $66.00
Brand Tyler Union Tyler Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
16" MJ ea $143.50 $155.60 $146.96 $147.41 $115.00
Brand Tyler Union Tyler Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Sleeves - Solid (12" Length)
4" MJ ea $40.40 $27.44 $24.64 $25.73 $27.44
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
6" MJ ea $61.20 $46.02 $41.31 $43.15 $46.02
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
8" MJ ea $90.80 $75.58 $67.84 $70.85 $75.58
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
12" MJ ea $142.40 $121.60 $109.50 $114.00 $121.60
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
16" MJ ea $263.60 $232.64 $218.00 $218.10 $232.64
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
Blank Plug with 2'* Tap (pipe threads)
4" MJ ea $32.00 $26.18 $23.50 $24.55 $26.18
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
6" MJ ea $46.00 $39.27 $35.25 $36.81 $39.27
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
56 |8" MJ ea $50.00 $52.78 $47.37 $49.48 $52.78
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
57 12" MJ ea $89.00 $82.33 $73.90 $77.20 $82.33
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
V11 ]Bolts and Gaskets
Bolts
1 |MJ Lock Bolts "Anti Rotation" ea $166.00 $184.00 No Bid $169.00 $151.00
Brand SIP Proselect Tyler/ Union Star
2 |Bolt (3/4" x 3 1/3") MJ ea $118.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 $91.00
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star
3 |Bolt (3/4" x 4") MJ ea $105.00 $132.00 No Bid $110.00 $160.00
Brand SIP Proselect Tyler/ Union Star
Gaskets
4 14" MJ ea $108.00 $121.00 $103.00 $105.50 $105.50
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
4" Transition ea $131.00 $149.00 $127.00 $135.50 $126.50
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
5 16" MJ ea $111.00 $149.00 $103.00 $114.50 $105.50
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
6" Transition ea $154.50 $181.50 $151.00 $164.00 $148.00
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
6 8" MJ ea $137.00 $128.00 $129.55 $139.00 $126.50
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
8" Transition ea $218.00 $181.50 $209.45 $285.00 $211.00
Brand SIP Proselect Star Tyler/ Union Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
7 112" MJ ea $220.00 $311.50 $207.00 $267.50 $211.00
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
12" Transition ea $311.00 $375.00 $290.91 $461.00 $295.00
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Star Tyler/ Union Star
8 16" MJ ea $368.00 N/R No Bid $500.00 $359.00
Brand SIP Tyler/ Union Tyler/ Union Star
16" Transition ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,650.00 $2,123.50
Brand Tyler/ Union Tyler/ Union Star
VI111|Gate valves & Appurtenances
""Gate valves - 3" thru 48" - for water and other liquids
GATE Valve - MJ
1 |3” Mueller or ea $288.00 No Bid $285.54 $248.42 $546.77
M & H or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
2 |4" Mueller a2380-20 or ea $317.50 No Bid $319.08 $277.60 $611.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
3 |6" Mueller A2380-20 or ea $404.20 No Bid $407.18 $354.00 $779.68
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
4 18" Mueller A2380-20 or ea $644.90 No Bid $648.54 $563.92 $1,241.84
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
5 110" Mueller A2380-20 or ea $1,005.00 No Bid $1,011.27 $879.27 $1,936.40
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
6 |12" Mueller A2380-20 or ea $1,267.00 No Bid $1,279.63 $1,112.59 $2,450.27
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
7 |16 Mueller A2380-20 ea $4,482.90 No Bid $4,289.45 $3,729.35 $8,213.51
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
TAPPING Gate Valve - MJ to FL
8 |4" Mueller H667 or ea $400.00 No Bid $304.63 $354.00 $366.40
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
9 |6" Mueller H667 or ea $565.00 No Bid $407.18 $499.60 $393.60
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
10 |8" Mueller H667 or ea $836.00 No Bid $636.27 $741.66 $556.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller Clow
11 |10" Mueller H667 or ea $1,262.00 No Bid $1,011.27 $1,118.35 No Bid
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller
12 |12" Mueller H667 or ea $1,905.00 No Bid $1,220.99 $1,689.27 No Bid
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller
13 |16" Mueller H667 or ea $5,995.00 No Bid $4,289.45 $4,398.00 No Bid
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H Mueller
Tapping Sleeve
14 14 x 4" JCM 412 or equal "C900" ea No Bid $291.00 $193.00 $189.20 $213.71
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
4 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $291.00 $193.00 $189.20 $213.71
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
15 |6 x 4" JCM 412 or equal "C900" ea No Bid $300.32 $205.00 $202.20 $208.61
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

6 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $300.32 $200.00 $195.65 $208.61
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

16 |6 x 6" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $329.17 $231.10 $226.10 $247.78
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

6 x 6" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $329.17 $225.55 $220.65 $247.78
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

17 |8 x 4" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $315.59 $224.40 $219.60 $206.78
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

8 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $315.59 $210.00 $205.45 $206.78
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

18 |8 x 6" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $344.46 $237.75 $232.61 $227.84
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

8 x 6" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $344.46 $232.00 $227.20 $227.84
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

19 |8 x 8" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $420.03 $302.20 $295.65 $303.53
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

8 x 8" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $420.03 $293.30 $286.96 $303.53
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

20 |10 x 4" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $329.00 $234.40 $229.35 $221.84
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

10 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $329.00 $214.45 $210.00 $221.84
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

21 |10 x 6" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $357.52 $251.00 $246.00 $241.79
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

10 x 6" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $357.52 $233.34 $229.00 $241.79
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

22 |10 x 8" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $429.93 $313.20 $306.55 $287.28
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

10 x 8" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $429.93 $295.50 $289.00 $287.28
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

23 |12 x 4" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $347.36 $240.00 $235.00 $246.35
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

12 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $347.36 $245.56 $221.00 $246.35
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

24 |12 x 6" JCM 412 or equal ea No Bid $375.80 $262.20 $257.00 $267.98
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

12 x 6" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $375.80 $246.67 $242.00 $267.98
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

25 |12 x 8" JCM 412 or equal "C900" ea No Bid $451.91 $333.34 $326.00 $313.65
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

12 x 8" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $451.91 $313.34 $307.00 $313.65
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford

26 |16x6" JCM 412 or equal "C900" ea No Bid $472.28 $295.00 $286.00 $322.40
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
16 x 6" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $472.28 $284.09 $272.00 $308.35
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
27 |16x8" JCM 412 or equal "C900" ea No Bid $554.26 $369.32 $353.26 $397.37
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
16 x 8" "CLASS 160" ea No Bid $554.26 $362.50 $346.74 $389.88
Brand Power Seal JCM JCM Ford
IX.|Brass Water Service Fittings AWWA C-800
Dual check Backflow Preventers |
Dual check w/Meter Nipple (Built In)
1 |3/4" ea $41.10 $41.24 $45.60 $30.87 $38.17
Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
2 |1 ea $44.55 $44.81 $85.04 $48.00 $73.48
Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
3 |11/2" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.57 No Bid
Brand Mueller
4 12" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.90 No Bid
Brand Mueller
Dual Check w/o
Meter Nipple
1 |3/4" ea $38.11 $38.33 $38.07 $24.79 $41.98
Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonalds Mueller Ford
2 |1 ea No Bid No Bid $73.28 $42.63 $78.30
Brand Ay Mcdonalds Mueller Ford
3 |1/2" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.26 No Bid
Brand Mueller
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
2" ea $194.88 $154.45 No Bid $139.00 No Bid
Brand Ford Ford Mueller
Bronze gate valves (3/4'-3" diameter)
%" diameter bronze gate valve ea $25.80 No Bid No Bid $8.35 $27.42
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
1" diameter bronze gate valve ea $38.31 No Bid No Bid $10.45 $34.76
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
1 ¥4 diameter bronze gate valve ea $62.00 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $53.58
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
1 14” diameter bronze gate valve ea $63.20 No Bid No Bid 23.00 $63.05
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
2" diameter bronze gate valve "full ea $89.60 No Bid No Bid $34.00 $77.17
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
2 ¥4 diameter bronze gate valve ea $242.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $220.57
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
3" diameter bronze gate valve ea $265.00 No Bid No Bid $76.00 $272.39
Brand American Ay Mcdonalds Webstone
Cut off valves - With Lock Wing Only
Ball Valve % (FPT) <4056> ea $35.00 $35.03 $25.11 $38.98 $34.67
Mueller B-20245/ Ford B11- 333W Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
Ball Valve 1" (FPT) <4079> ea $53.39 $53.68 $44.32 $57.65 $53.14
Mueller B-2020/ Form B11-444W Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

3 |Ball Valve %" (CTS-MPT)"Packe( ea $45.90 $45.57 $44.00 $47.72 $41.55

Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford

4 |Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-MSN) "Pack] ea $44.85 $45.10 No Bid $49.97 $44.64

<4048>, Mueller H-14348/Ford B4 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

5 |Ball Valve 1" (CTS-MSN) "Packeg ea $66.30 $66.67 No Bid $76.60 $65.99

<4095>, Mueller H-14348//Ford/B Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

6 |Ball Valve 3/4" x 1" (MSN-CTS)"H ea $48.40 $48.74 No Bid $58.25 $48.24

<4058>, Mueller B-24350/Ford B4] Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

7 |Ball Valve 3/4" (PVC-MSN) <406! ea $48.42 $48.75 No Bid $52.30 $48.25

Mueller B-24353/Ford B73-332W Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

8 |Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-FPT)"Packeq ea $39.18 $39.39 No Bid $47.72 $38.99

<4066>, Mueller B-25170/Ford B4] Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

9 |Ball Valve 1" (CTS-FPT)"Packed J ea $59.40 $59.76 No Bid $72.33 $59.16

<4092>, Mueller B-25170/Ford B4 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

10 |Ball Valve 1"X 3/4" (CTS-FPT)"P4 ea $43.72 $43.97 No Bid $60.60 $43.52

<4057>, Mueller B-25170/Ford B4 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

11 |Ball Valve 2"(FPT-CTS)"Packed J ea $176.37 $178.22 No Bid $217.35 $176.41

<4035>, Mueller B-25170/Ford B4 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford

12 |Ball Valve 2" (FPT) ea $156.32 $158.01 No Bid $193.00 $156.41

Ford B11-777W Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
Joint Connections

1 |Coupling 3/4" (CTS-MPT)"Packed| ea $9.73 $9.81 No Bid $10.39 $9.71

Mueller H-15428 / Ford C84-33 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
2 |Coupling 1" (CTS-MPT) "Packed | ea $11.55 $11.61 No Bid $12.30 $11.49
Mueller H-15428 / Ford C84-44 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
3 |Coupling 3/4" (FPT-CTS)"Packed ea $10.25 $10.31 No Bid $11.15 $10.20
Mueller H-15451 / Ford C14-33 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
4 |Coupling 1" (CTS-FPT) "Packed J¢ ea $13.90 $13.99 No Bid $16.16 $13.85
Mueller H-15451 / Ford C14-44 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
5 |Coupling 3/4" (CTS) "Packed Joint ea $11.97 $11.94 No Bid $12.69 $11.82
Mueller H-15403 / Ford C44-33 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
6 |Coupling 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint" ea $13.57 $13.66 No Bid $13.85 $13.52
Mueller H-15403 / Ford C44-44 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
7 |Coupling 2" (CTS) "Packed Joint" ea $61.25 $61.69 No Bid $65.92 $61.07
Mueller H-15403 / Ford C44-77 Brand Ford Ford Mueller Ford
8 |Coupling 3/4" (FPT-CTS) "Packed ea $12.85 $12.89 $13.00 $12.67 $12.76
Ford C17-33 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
9 |Coupling 1" (FPT-CTS) "Packed J ea $19.75 $19.88 $21.00 $19.79 $19.68
Ford C17-44 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
10 |Coupling 3/4"X 1" (FPT-CTS) "Pa ea $20.20 $20.31 $21.74 $22.80 $20.10
<4069>, Ford C17-34 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
11 |Coupling 3/4" (CTS--PVC) "Packe ea $16.05 $16.14 $16.00 $19.52 $15.98
<4053>, Ford C47-33 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
12 |Coupling 1" (CTS--PVC) "Packed ea $23.18 $23.32 $23.26 $21.44 $23.09
<4086>, Ford C47-44 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
13 |Coupling 3/4" (CTS--PVC) "Packe ea $22.44 $22.58 $23.00 $31.05 $22.36
<4074>, Ford C47-34 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
14 |Coupling 3/4" X 1" (CTS) "Packed| ea $13.79 $13.87 $13.84 $15.77 $13.73
<4071>, Ford C44-34 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
15 |Coupling 3/4" X 1" (MPT-CTS) ") ea $10.80 $10.86 $10.83 $12.60 $10.75
<4072>, Ford C84-34 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
16 |Coupling 3/4" (MPT-PVC) <40643 ea $12.97 $12.98 $12.96 $14.60 $12.85
Ford C87-33 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
17 |Coupling 1" (PVC) <4026> ea $20.15 $20.27 $20.21 $15.46 $20.06
Ford C87-44 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
18 |Coupling 2" (CTS-MPT) "Packed ] ea $45.99 $46.35 $48.31 $49.51 $45.88
<4037>, Ford C84-77 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
19 |Coupling 2" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Jq ea $47.99 $48.44 $48.31 $51.77 $47.95
<4029>, Ford C14-77 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
20 |Coupling 2" (Meter-FL-MPT)w/G4 ea $40.63 $44.21 $41.60 $41.00 $40.44
Ford CF38-77-2.125 Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
21 |Coupling 2" (Meter-FL-FPT)w/Gag ea $36.80 $40.34 $31.00 $37.00 $36.63
Ford CF31-78 Brand Ford Ford Matco Mueller Ford
Miscellaneous Brass Fitting
1 |Corporation 3/4"cc (MPT-CTS) "P ea $21.25 $21.38 $21.33 $22.71 $21.17
<4054>,Mueller H-15008 / Ford F] Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
2 |Corporation 1"cc (MPT-CTS) "Pac ea $32.15 $32.35 $32.37 $34.39 $32.02
<4091>,Mueller H-15008 / Ford F] Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

3 |WYE 1" X 3.4"(CTS) "Packed Joir ea $24.57 $24.71 $24.50 $28.55 $24.46
<4068>,Mueller H-15343 / Ford F] Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Ford
4 |TEE 3/4" (FPT) <4052> ea $6.36 $12.07 $5.50 $32.00 $3.17
Brand Matco Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
5 |TEE 3/4" (CTS) "Packed Joint" <4 ea $28.80 $28.89 $28.84 $32.88 $28.60
Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
6 |TEE 1" (FPT) <4084> ea $10.20 $17.22 $10.00 $46.07 $5.61
Brand Matco Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
7 |TEE 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint" <407 ea $30.75 $30.92 $30.83 $45.59 $30.61
Brand Ford Ford Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
8 |Nipple 2" (All Thread / By Close) s ea $7.62 $7.27 $7.20 $9.00 $5.48
Brand Matco Merit Brass Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
9 [Nipple 3/4" (All Thread / By Close ea $1.89 $1.89 $1.64 $1.80 $1.25
Brand Matco Merit Brass Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
10 |Nipple 3/4" (3" Length) ea $3.87 $2.78 $2.75 $3.50 $2.09
Brand Matco Merit Brass Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
11 |Meter Nipple 3/4" X 2 1/2" - long ea $6.20 $5.00 $4.99 $5.72 $6.30
Brand Matco Matco Ay Mcdonald Mueller Matco
12 |Meter Nipple 3/4"X 1 5/8" - short ea $6.18 No Bid Non Bid $13.94 $6.30
Brand Matco Mueller Matco

Gemeral Galvanized Fittings
13 |Dresser Coupling 3/4" (compressio ea $10.25 $9.56 Non Bid $8.78 $5.84
Smith Blair 522 Brand Smith Blair Telso Smith Blair Matco
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
14 |Dresser Coupling 1" (compression ea $13.20 $11.28 Non Bid $9.92 $7.73
Smith Blair 522 Brand Smith Blair Telso Smith Blair Matco
15 |Dress Coupling 2" (compression) < ea $25.00 $20.67 Non Bid $18.10 $16.43
Smith Blair 522 Brand Smith Blair Telso Smith Blair Matco
X. |Rubber couplings - Fernco, Mission or equal
PVC to PVC
1 |4x4PVCtoPVC ea $3.75 $3.60 $3.41 $3.45 $3.09
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
2 14x6PVCtoPVC ea $9.36 $9.04 $8.56 $8.57 $7.19
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
3 |16 x6PVCtoPVC ea $7.95 $7.70 $7.29 $7.29 $6.62
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
4 |6 x8PVCtoPVC ea $14.70 $14.30 $13.54 $13.55 $11.32
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
5 |18x8PVCtoPVC ea $12.10 $11.84 $11.22 $11.22 $10.14
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
6 |10 x 10 PVCto PVC ea $17.61 $17.79 $16.85 $16.85 $13.75
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
7 112 x 12 PVCto PVC ea $20.40 $20.76 $19.66 $19.66 $16.42
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe -Conx
PVC to Clay
1 |4 x4 PVC to clay ea $3.73 $3.60 $3.41 $3.41 $3.09
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx

2Z 0l 52




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
4 x 6 PVC to clay ea $9.35 $9.04 $8.95 $8.57 $7.19
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
6 x 6 PVC to clay ea $7.95 $7.70 $7.40 $7.29 $6.62
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
6 x 8 PVC to clay ea $14.80 $14.30 $13.60 $13.55 $11.32
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
8 x 8 PVC to clay ea $12.25 $11.84 $11.22 $11.22 $10.14
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
10 x 10 PVC to clay ea $17.60 $17.79 $16.85 $16.85 $13.75
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
12 x 12 PVC to clay ea $20.50 $20.76 $20.00 $19.66 $16.42
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
PVC to Concrete
4 x 4 PVC to concrete ea $4.03 $3.89 $3.68 $3.68 $3.09
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
4 x 6 PVC to concrete ea $9.35 $9.04 $8.56 $8.57 $7.19
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
6 x 6 PVC to concrete ea $8.80 $8.52 $8.07 $8.07 $6.62
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
6 x 8 PVC to concrete ea $16.25 $15.72 $14.89 $14.89 $15.55
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
8 x 8 PVC to concrete ea $12.60 $12.79 $12.11 $12.12 $10.14
Brand Fernco Fernco Fernco Fernco Pipe-Conx
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
XI. |Coupling - Hymax 2000 or equal

1 |4" w/overall range of 4.25" - 5.63, ea $135.00 $142.92 $131.13 $156.00 $135.40

overall width 7.87" overall couplin Brand Hymax Hymax
maximum gap between pipes 5.50" P/N| 860-56-010C-16C|860-56-0108-16C 2000-0563-260 Item # 219256

2 |6" w/overall range of 6.42" - 7.68", ea $178.80 $189.28 $175.00 $223.00 $179.32

overall width 10.75" overall coupli Brand Hymax Hymax
maximum gap between pipes 7.50" P/N| 860-56-0163-16] 860-56-0163-16 2000-0768-260 Item # 231619

3 |8" w/overall range of 8.54" - 9.84, ea $201.90 $213.70 $198.00 $229.00 $206.39

overall width 12.91" overall coupli Brand Hymax Hymax
maximum gap between pipes 7.50" P/N| 860-56-0217-16] 860-56-0217-16 2000-0984-260 Item # 231620

XI1|Repair clamps - 3" Long

1 s ea $4.30 $4.05 No Bid $4.05 $3.97
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

2 1" ea $4.95 $4.40 No Bid $4.43 $4.32
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

31w ea $5.25 $4.57 No Bid $4.55 $4.48
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

4 11%” ea $5.63 $4.89 No Bid $4.89 $4.79
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

5 |2" ea $6.15 $5.47 No Bid $5.35 $5.37
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

6 |27 ea $7.70 $6.67 No Bid $6.70 $6.54
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

Repair clamps - 6" Long

74 ea $8.00 $7.55 No Bid $7.57 $7.40
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

1" ea $9.26 $8.04 No Bid $8.05 $7.78
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

1% ea $9.75 $8.47 No Bid $8.49 $8.30
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

1% ea $10.60 $9.20 No Bid $9.22 $9.01
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

2" ea $11.10 $10.14 No Bid $9.68 $9.94
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

27 ea $15.35 $13.20 No Bid $13.37 $13.05
Brand Smith Blair Ford Smith Blair

Full Circle Repair Clamps - JCM 7" 12" 8" /12" 7" 12" 12"ONLY 7"/12"

2ll

Range(s) 2.35-2.63 ea $27.98/$53.80 $36.49/$51.44 $64.78 $60.00 $28.34/ $43.48
2.70-3.13 ea $32.45/$55.85 $32.43/ $46.03

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

3"

Range(s) 2.97-3.25 ea $34.66/ $57.59] $39.80/ $53.44 $75.00 $69.50 $36.06/ $51.69
3.46-3.70 ea $35.50/ $58.88 $36.06/ $51.69
3.73-4.00 ea $36.36/ $60.60 $36.06/ $51.69
3.96-4.25 ea $37.66/ $63.98 $35.58/ $53.02

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

25 of 32




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

4"

Range(s) 4.45-4.73 ea $38.99/ $65.81] $40.08/ $58.03 $78.89 $74.74 $35.58/ $53.02
4.74-5.14 ea $40.35/ $66.13 $37.65/ $60.24
4.95-5.35 ea $40.75/ $69.00 $37.65/ $60.24
5.22-5.62 ea $41.30/ $71.16 $37.65/ $60.24

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

&

Range(s) 5.95-6.35 ea $42.40/$73.67| $45.70/ $67.28 $95.56 $90.53 $43.22/ $69.40
6.56-6.96 ea $46.60/$75.00 $43.22/ $69.40
6.84-7.24 ea $47.63/ $76.17 $44.18/ $70.70
7.05-7.45 $48.34/ $77.42 $44.18/ $70.70

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

g

Range(s) 7.95-8.35 ea $52.74/ $84.47) $54.90/ $79.76 $112.23 $95.95 $51.82/ $76.64
8.54-8.94 ea $55.22/ $88.50 $51.82/ $76.64
8.99-9.39 ea $56.97/ $91.22 $51.82/ $76.64
9.27-9.67 ea $58.23/ $93.23 $53.00/ $78.42
9.7-10-10 ea] $62.13/%$101.29 $53.00/ $78.42

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

10"

Range(s) 11.75-12.15 eal] $70.82/$114.00] $54.90/ $88.90 $143.34 $135.80 $59.09/ $92.79
10.64-11.04 eal] $67.09/ $105.50 $59.09/ $92.79
11.04-11.46 ea $69.34/ $107.70 $59.09/ $92.79

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM

12"

Range(s) 13.10-13.5 ea $75.97/$123.00] $66.20/ $98.00 $165.56 $156.85 $67.15/ $107.45
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM JCM
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
Bell Joint Clamps: All are Dresser, Smith Blair, Ford, or Muller, Bell Joint Clamps 067900
1 |4" ea $77.15 $59.21 $106.82 $79.59 $55.02
Brand Smith Blair Ford JCM Smith Blair
2 16" ea $84.95 $65.21 $115.56 $87.65 $60.60
Brand Smith Blair Ford JCM Smith Blair
3 |18" ea $117.50 $90.20 $160.00 $121.12 $83.82
Brand Smith Blair Ford JCM Smith Blair
4 |12" ea $159.35 $122.65 $248.89 $164.60 $113.98
Brand Smith Blair Ford JCM Smith Blair
Foster adapters or approved equal
1 14” ea $72.25 $69.51 $63.58 $67.32 $67.32
Brand Star Infact Star Infact
2 16" ea $89.38 $86.90 $81.77 $84.00 $84.16
Brand Star Infact Star Infact
3 |8" ea $132.00 $126.03 $121.00 $122.00 $122.05
Brand Star Infact Star Infact
4 |12" ea $178.00 $190.16 $180.00 $184.00 $184.16
Brand Star Infact Star Infact
X111|Cast Iron Saddles-Baker, Ford, Smith Blair, Mueller, Rockwell with extended range to fit all pipes.
**Double Strap |
MAIN Size Tap Size - Cast Iron C900
1 |12"** 1"cc ea $37.62 $61.80 No Bid $57.89 $34.59
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

2" IPT ea $46.11 $70.63 No Bid $63.16 $45.60

Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

107%* 1" cc ea $30.79 $53.31 No Bid $49.47 $27.95
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

2" IPT ea $39.15 $60.97 No Bid $55.79 $38.59

Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

g7k 1" cc ea $21.30 $45.42 No Bid $43.16 $20.76
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

2" IPT ea $29.00 $50.50 No Bid $47.37 $28.71

Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

67%* 1"cc ea $19.76 $36.17 No Bid $33.68 $18.42
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

2" IPT ea $23.65 $40.76 No Bid $37.90 $23.52

Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

4"** 1"cc ea $17.00 $32.43 No Bid $29.50 $16.38
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

2" IPT ea $24.10 $36.79 No Bid $35.80 $22.00

Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

3wk 1"cc ea $16.20 $31.92 No Bid $29.50 $20.60
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

7%k 1"cc ea $13.11 $36.68 No Bid $26.35 $12.62
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
1M** 1"cc ea No Bid *N/R No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
MAIN Size Tap Size - Extended Range
127%* 1"cc ea $37.62 $61.80 No Bid $57.89 $34.59
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
27 1P| ea $46.9Y $/0.63 NO BId $63.16 $45.6U
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
107%* 1"cc ea $30.79 $53.31 No Bid $49.47 $27.95
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
2" IPT ea $39.15 $60.97 No Bid $55.79 $38.59
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
g7k 1"cc ea $23.15 $45.42 No Bid $43.16 $20.76
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
2" IPT ea $29.70 $50.50 No Bid $47.37 $28.71
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
67** 1"cc ea $21.80 $36.17 No Bid $33.68 $18.42
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
2" IPT ea $26.90 $40.76 No Bid $37.90 $23.52
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
4%k 1"cc ea $18.00 $32.43 No Bid $29.50 $16.38
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
2" IPT ea $25.18 $36.79 No Bid $35.80 $22.00
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

6 |37 1"cc ea $16.20 $31.92 No Bid $29.50 $20.60
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

7 |27%* 1"cc ea $13.11 $32.68 No Bid $26.35 $12.62
Brand Smith Blair Romac JCM Ford

8 |1"** 1"cc ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand

X1V|Fire hydrants/kits/brass nipples/misc.

1 (18" bury size 5 V4" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,117.00 No Bid
Brand Mueller
Model A423

2 124" bury size 5 V4" ea $1,395.00 No Bid No Bid $1,146.00 No Bid
Brand M&H Mueller
Model $129.00 A423

3 |3' bury size 5 V4~ ea $1,352.00 No Bid $1,350.00 $1,205.00 $1,349.14
Brand M&H M&H Mueller
Model 129 129 A423

4 |4 bury size 5 V4~ ea $1,410.00 No Bid $1,440.00 $1,264.00 $1,414.88
Brand M&H M&H Mueller
Model 129 129 A423

5 118" bury size 5 Va” ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,004.00 No Bid
Brand Mueller
Model A423

6 |24" bury size 5 V4 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,033.00 No Bid
Brand Mueller
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks
Model A423
7 |3’ bury size 5 V4~ ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,092.00 $1,303.71
Brand Mueller
Model A423
8 |4’ bury size 5 V4" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,151.00 $1,354.30
Brand Mueller
Model A423
Fire hydrant accessories:
Extension kit for 5 %4” main valve opening. (barrel, stem, coupling, etc.)
1 IM&H 129 12” $238.00 No Bid No Bid $229.00 $316.54
2 IM&H 129 18” $270.00 No Bid No Bid $262.00 $359.26
1 IM&H929 127 No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 $316.54
2 IM&H 929 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid $262.00 $359.26
1 [Mueller A-422 127 No Bid No Bid No Bid $265.00 No Bid
2 |Mueller A-422 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid $295.00 No Bid
1 [Mueller A-423 127 No Bid No Bid No Bid $265.00 No Bid
2 |Mueller A-423 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid $295.00 No Bid
Bryan Tagert Catrina Walker Edward Boykin Allen Lepine

Central Pipe Supply
101 Ware Rd

Pearl, MS 39208
Phone (800)844-7700
(601)-939-3322

Fax- (601)932-8944
btagert@centralpipe.com

Kristen All

Mississippi Utilities

14231 Seaway Rd., B-5

Gulfport,MS
Phone (228)863-2757

Fax (228)863-6587

Southern Pipe & Supply

2202 34th Street

Gulfport, MS 39501
Phone (228)863-2505

Fax (228)863-1729

Catrinawalker@ferguson.com edward.boykin@southernpipe.com

Consolidated Pipe & Supply
9337-B West Oaklawn Rd.

Biloxi, MS 39532
Phone (228)396-8818

Fax (228)396-8889

Alepine@Consolidatedpipe.com
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 01-01-16 through 12-31-117
Renewable Option 01-01-17 through 12-31-18

Central Mississippi Southern Consolidated HD
Pipe Utilities Pipe & Pipe & Supply &
Supply, Inc. Supply Supply, Inc. Supply, Inc. Waterworks

HD Supply Waterworks
3490 Hurricane Bay Drive
Theodore, AL 36582
(251)443-1725
(251)443-7921
Kristen.all@hdsupply.com
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