Group J - Ductile or Cast-Iron Grates and Frames

Contract Period 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Renewable Option 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

MS FJ Consolidated Central Pipe Summit Empire H.D. (Hughes) Southern
Utilities Turner Pipe & Supply Supply, Inc. Pipe & Supply | Pipe & Supply Supply Waterworks
Supply Company Company, Inc. Supply
L Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
1 24" x 24" grates with frames Lots of 12] $ 1,163.28 No Bid NoBid | $ 1,212.00| $ 1,259.04 NoBid | $ 1,380.00 1,231.20
P/N FG2424R V-5724-1 V-5724-1 V-5724-1 FG2424R
2 36" x 36" grates with frames Each| $ 270.41 No Bid NoBid | $ 332300 $ 312.00 NoBid | $ 337.00 289.75
P/N FG326 V-5736 V-5736 V-5736 FG326
3 V5724-1 or equal Each| $ 91.85 No Bid NoBid | $ 101.00 ] $ 104.92 No Bid | $ 115.00 98.70
P/N F134 V-5724-1 V-5724-1 V-5724-1 F134
II. Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Covers & Rings
1 24" diameter standard lid without rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 697.80 NoBid | $ 708.00 No Bid
Each $ 58.15 $ 59.00
P/N V-1501 V-1501
2 24" diameter standard lid with ring Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 1,659.60 NoBid | $ 1,716.00 No Bid
Each $ 138.30 $ 143.00
P/N V-1403 V-1403
3 24” diameter hinged lid without rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each
P/N
4 24” diameter hinged lid with rings Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each
P/N
5 V1600-3 manhole rings and lids Lots of 12] $ 1,408.20 No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 1,730.16 NoBid | $ 1,884.00 1,518.00
Each] $ 117.35 $ 144.18 $ 157.00 126.50
P/N MH133 V-1600-3 V-1600-3
6 V1503-3 manhole rings and lids Lots of 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 1,717.92 NoBid | $ 1,776.00 No Bid
Each $ 143.16 $ 148.00
P/N V-1503 V-1503
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Group J - Ductile or Cast-Iron Grates and Frames

Contract Period 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Renewable Option 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

MS FJ Consolidated Central Pipe Summit Empire H.D. (Hughes) Southern
Utilities Turner Pipe & Supply Supply, Inc. Pipe & Supply | Pipe & Supply Supply Waterworks
Supply Company Company, Inc. Supply
III. Sanitary Sewer and Drain Sewer Manhole Risers
1 1¥2” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (26 ¥2" cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 73151 $ 62.88 NoBid | $ 61.00 No Bid
P/N| V1915-1 V1915-1 V1915-1
2 1 ¥2” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (23" cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 70.72 NoBid | $ 69.00 No Bid
P/N V1901-1 V1901-1
3 2" ductile or cast iron manhole risers (23 ¥2” cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 72.15 NoBid | $ 70.00 No Bid
P/N| V1984-2 V1984-2
4 2" cast iron manhole risers (26 ¥2” cover) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 7205 $ 74.65 NoBid | $ 73.00 No Bid
P/N V1915-2 V1915-2 V1915-2
5 1%,” ductile or cast iron manhole risers (H-1 24") Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 60.50 1 $ 58.43 NoBid | $ 57.00 No Bid
P/N| V1907-1 V1907-1 V1907-1
6 2" ductile or cast iron manhole risers (H-1 24") Each No Bid No Bid No Bid 61.881 $ 60.67 NoBid| $ 59.00 No Bid
P/N V1907-2 V1907-2 V1907-2
7 1 Y2” riser for hinged lid type manholes (24”) Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
P/N|
IV. Manbhole riser rings
1 24" diameter manhole riser rings (1 ¥2” high) Each No Bid 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand| Turner
P/N
2 Polypropylene 27 %2”diameter manhole riser Each No Bid 94.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
rings (1 %2” high) Brand| Turner
P/N
3 24” diameter manhole riser rings for hinged Each No Bid 92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
lid type (1-1/2” high) price Brand Turner
P/N
V. Ductile or cast iron valve boxes
1 18 - 24" height valve box Each| $ 19.90 NoBid | $ 22.00 21.00] $ 22.15 NoBid | $ 21.60 21.45
Brand Sigma Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N| VB261 206271 4618 VB261 VB261 VB261
2 24 - 36" height valve box Each| $ 29.10 NoBid | $ 31.00 30001 $ 31.90 NoBid | $ 31.70 30.78
Brand Sigma Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N| VB262 209682 5628 VB262 VB262 VB262
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Utilities Turner Pipe & Supply Supply, Inc. Pipe & Supply | Pipe & Supply Supply Waterworks
Supply Company Company, Inc. Supply
VI. Ductile or cast iron valve box risers
127 Each] $ 7.25 NoBid | $ 8401 $ 1050 | $ 7.92 NoBid | $ 7.78 7.75
Brand Sigma Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB2602 209686 VB2602 VB2602 VB2602
VII. Ductile or cast iron valve box lids with “water” or “sewer’” on top
1 Standard lid Each| $ 7.85 NoBid | $ 9.00] $ 8.001 $ 8.42 NoBid | $ 8.34 8.25
Brand Sigma Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB2000W/S 200161 VB2600W/ S VB2600W/ S VB2600W/ S
VIII. Meter boxes (Rome, Vulcan, Jefferson Parish)
1 Small w/lid Each| $ 24.70 NoBid| $ 26.00 | $ 25001 $ 27.27 NoBid | $ 26.67 26.16
Brand Sigma Sigma Russell Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB282 209667 MB282 MB282 MB282
2 Large w/lid Each| $ 81.75 NoBid | $ 71.00 | $ 80.00] $ 84.21 NoBid | $ 88.89 96.70
Brand Sigma Sigma Russell Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB283 261564 MB283 MB283 MB283
IX. Meter box lids only
1 Small (19 1/8” x 9 347) Each| $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 10.29 NoBid | $ 9.73 9.98
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB2821 MB2821 MB2821 MB2821
2 Large, oval type Each| $ 29.90 No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 32.38 NoBid | $ 31.67 32.78
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB3811 MB3811 MB3811 MB3811
3 Large, square type Each| $ 36.50 No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 39.20 NoBid | $ 38.34 39.68
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB2831 MB2831 MB2831 MB2831

MS Utilities

14231 Seaway Rd., Unit BS
Gulfport, MS 39503
228-863-2757 - voice
228-863-6587 - fax

Summit Pipe & Supply
450 Industrial Drive
Jackson, MS 39209
601-353-0073 - phone
601-353-0084 - fax

dmckinley @ summitpipe.com

Souther Waterworks Supply
497 Cole Rd.

Hattiesburg, MS 39402
601-268-7463 - voice
601-296-0353 - fax

SWS Kevin@yahoo.com
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