Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations
Contract Period 10-01-07 through 09-30-08
Renewable Option 10-01-08 through 09-30-09

Control Gulf Coast | Bay Motor | B.E.A.R. | J. H. Wright
Sys., Inc. |Pump & Equ.|Winding, Inc. & Assoc.
Lift stations with transducers
Duplex panel/10 hp pump $  7,069.00 | $ 7,466.67 No bid $ 8,296.30 $11,301.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel/15 hp pump $ 7,329.00 ] $ 7,502.69 No bid $ 833633 $ 11,488.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel/20 hp pump $ 7,942.00 | $ 8,287.50 No bid $ 920834 $ 11,953.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel/25 hp pump $ 8,119.00 | $ 8,452.00 No bid $ 9391121 $ 12,120.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel/30 hp pump $ 8779.00| $ 9,218.57 No bid $ 10,242.86 | $ 12,746.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Lift stations with float ball setup
Duplex panel - 5 hp pump $ 5,184.00] $ 5,237.72 No bid $ 5819.69] $ 7,946.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel - 7.5 hp pump $  5266.00] $ 5,237.72 No bid $ 5819.69] $ 8,023.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Duplex panel - 10 hp pump $ 5471.00] $ 5,472.12 No bid $ 6,080.14] $ 8,219.00
Brand CSI GCP&E B.E.AR. BCC
Meyers pumps or equal - 230V, 3Phase - 40' lead
4vx 30m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 3 hp No bid $ 5,852.00 No bid $ 6502231 $ 2,475.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
4vx 50m4-23 - 4” non-log pump 5 hp No bid $ 5,960.00 No bid $ 6,62223] $ 2,580.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
4vx 75ma-23 - 4” non-log pump 7.5 hp No bid $ 5,986.00 No bid $ 6,651.12] $ 3,183.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
4vx 100ma-23- 4” non-log pump 10 hp No bid $ 6,058.00 No bid $ 6,731.12] $ 3,675.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
4vx 150ma-23- 4” non-log pump 15 hp No bid $ 6,616.00 No bid $ 7351.12] $ 4,225.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
4vx 200ma-23- 4” non-log pump 20 hp No bid $ 7,177.00 No bid $ 797445] $ 4,330.00
Brand Meyers Meyers Goulds
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Submersible pumps - 230/460V
3 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 2,707.00 | $ 4,643.3415$ 3,225.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco
5 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 2,621.00 | $ 4,543.34]1$ 3,276.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco
7.5 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 3212001 $ 5,221.12 | $ 3,625.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco
10 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 3,380.00 | $ 5,421.121$ 3,855.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco
15 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 3,539.00 $ 6,165.56] % 4,430.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco
20 hp with 4” discharge No bid No bid $ 4,340.00 | $ 6,521.121 $ 4,675.00
Brand Mudbug Wemco Wemco

Control Systems, Inc.

909 Quinn Street

Jackson, MS 39202
601-355-8594 - voice
601-355-8774 - fax
richards@controlsysinc.com

Bay Motor Winding, Inc.

P.O.box 411

Long Beach, MS 39560
28-863-0666 - voice
228-864-4470 - fax
ned@baymotorwinding.com

sabrina@baymotorwinding.com

J. H. Wright & Associates

P. O. Box 1085

Daphne, AL 36526
251-621-1491 - phone
251-621-8111 - fax
pcoletta@jhwright.com




