Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 10-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

[ [Buctile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames

1 {Standard 24" x 24” Grate w/ Frame
EJIW: V-5624 $£360.00 $325.33
NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 {Standard 247 x 24” Grate Only
EJIW: V-5624 No Bid $183.97 No Bid
NIFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Gratc A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 FADA Compliant 247 x 24” Grate w/ Frame
EHW: V-5624-80 No Bid $353.01 No Bid
NFCo: R1879-A0G (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 JADA Compliant 24” x 24" Grate Only
EITW: V-5624-80 No Bid $212.23 No Bid
NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate Q) No Bid Neo Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F {(Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

II |Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm ole Frames & Covers

I [Reversable 26.5" Manhole Cover Only
EJIW: 1090 (Labeled SEWER)
NFCo: R-1712 (Labeled SEWER)

$155.76 $159.81 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

HI {Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Frames & Covers with custom logo

1 {Standard 24” Manhole Frame w/ Cover

EJIW: 1040 $358.75 $387.45 $396.24| 0!
NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 No Bid $387.45 $396.24 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 [Standard 24” Manhole Cover Only

EHW: 1040 $149.70 $161.50 $165.34|
NFCo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 No Bid $161.50 $165.34

NFCeo: R-1642 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 10-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

3 [Hinged 24" Manhole Frame & Cover

EIHW: 1040 $374.55 $400.00 $405.63] ]
NFCo: R-1642-1.M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EHW: 1040 No Bid $400.00 $405.63 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-LM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 {Reversable 24 Manhole Frame w/ Cover

EJIIW: V-1600-3 $228.56 $246.75 $252.45} )
NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EIIW: V-1600-3 No Bid $246.75 $252.45 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 [Reversable 24™ Manhole Cover Only

ENW: V-1600-3 $131.00 $134.44 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJTW: V-1600-3 No Bid $131.00 $134.44 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

IV [Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riser Rings

1 {Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring
1" Rise (For 24” x 1" Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.57 Rise (For 24” x 1™ Cover) $83.43 $90.00
2” Rise (For 24" x 17 Cover) $86.63 $93.60

2 {Ductile or Cast [ron Manhole Riser Ring

17 Rise (For 24”7 x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.5 Rise (For 24 x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 Rise (For 24” x 1.5 Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 [Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

i” Rise (For 26” x 17 Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

[.5” Rise (For 26" x 1” Cover) No Bid $107.00

2” Rise (For 26” x 1 Cover) No Bid $115.00

4 [Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring
1” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.57 Rise (For 26™ x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2” Rise (For 26” x 1.5 Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Group J Ductile or Cast [ron Grates & Frames

Contract Period 10-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

Composite Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riscer Rings

A"
1 [Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.57 Rise (For 247 x 1.5 Cover) No Bid No Bid $38.75
2 {Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (FFor 24” x 2" Cover) No Bid No Bid $38.75
3 {Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid $38.75
4 {Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5 Rise (For 26 x 2” Cover) Ne Bid No Bid $38.75
V1 |Dauctile or cast iron valve boxes
1 Ji8" - 24" height valve box $38.00 $26.99 $26.00
Sigma StarPipe Sigma
461-S VB461]
2 124" -36" height valve box $45.00 $45.01 $38.42
Sigma Star Pipe Sigma
462-S
VII {Ductile or cast iron valve box risers
Io2" $14.00 $12.00 $9.8
Brand Sigma Sigma Start Pipe}
P/N 2 VBR|
VI [Ductile or cast iron valve box lids with “Water” or “Sewer” on top
1 }Standard lid $11.50 $9.00 $9.27§
Brand Sigma Sigma Star Pip
P/N 5-1/4 VB
IX IMeter boxes (Reme, Vulcan, Jefferson Parish)
I [Small w/lid $38.00 $38.00 No Bid
Brand Sigma Sigma
P/N Rome Oval
2 QLarge w/lid
Brand $145.00 No Bid $105.92
P/N Sigma

Sigma




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 10-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through (9-30-14

Meter box lids only

Small (19 1/8” x 9 %)

Large,oval type

Large, square type

Brand
P/N

Brand
P/N

Brand
P/N

$15.00

Sigma Sigma
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Coburns Supply

5271 Old Hwy 11
Hattiesvurg, MS 39402
601-268-061 1 phone
601-268-3083 fax

www.coburns.com

Central Pipe & Supply
PO Box 5470

Pearl, MS 39208
300-844-7700 phone
601-932-8944 fax
Btagert@centralpipe.com

www.centraipipe.com

Southern Pipe & Supply

2202 34ih Street

Guifport, MS 39501

228-863-2505 phone

228-863-1729 fax
edward.boykin@southernpipe.com

HD Supply Waterworks

14050 White Road

Gulfport, MS 39503
228-563-1905 phone
228-563-6484 fax
Dusty.dysart@hdsupply.com

UNGIL
DEC 04 72012
APPROVEI

No Bid

No Bid




