Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Pertod 11-21-12 through 09-30-13

Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

i, Municipal service tubing
Copper tube size OD ASTM D-2737-SDR9 (PE3408) Drisco pipe or equal

1 ¥ per ft] § 0171 % 0193 % 0.17 No Bid
Brand Endot ADS Charter

2 1 per fif § 0281 8 0321°% 0.28 No Bid
Brand Endot ADS Charter

3 1V perft] $ 04218 05011 8§ 0.40 Ne Bid
Brand Endot ADS Charter

4 I per fif § 057§ % 0681 % 0.62 No Bid
Brand Endot ADS Charter

3 2" per fif $ 1.0t 1 8 1051 % 1.00 No Bid
Brand Endot ADS Charter

I, PVC Pressure Pipe

All PVC pressure pipe is to be as slip joint pipe.

1 4" per Ht No Bid 2.26 2.34 2.18 No Bid
Brand IM Eagle M NAPCO

2 6" per Ift No Bid 4.50 4.66 4.34 No Bid
Brand JM Eagle M NAPCO

3 8" per It No Bid 1,79 8.06 7.31 No Bid
Brand IJM Eagle M NAPCO

4 10" per Ift Ne Bid 11.69 12,11 11.28 No Bid
Brand JM Eagle M NAPCO

5 p2n per lt No Bid 16.51 17.09 15.92 No Bid
Brand JM Eagle IM NAPCO

6 16" per it NoBid{ % 28.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Diamond
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

4" Sleeve ed $ 1201 § 1101 8 09515 0.99 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends §  Muiti Fittings | Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

6" sleeve ea h) 4101 8 394158 3401 8 3.61 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Mulii Fittings | Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

3 4"witha 1/16" bend 22.3 ed A 1851 % 1.73 1% 15518 1.64 No Bid

Brand Plastic Trends § Multi Fittings § Multi Fitztings |  Plastic Trends

6" with a 1/16” bend 22.5° ea § 809F 5 7.56 | 7.18 No Bid
Brand!  Malti Fittings { Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings § Plastic Trends

4" with & 1/8" bend 45° ea S 1.69 1 § 1.6G}|$ 140} 5 1.50 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings { Plastic Trends

67 with a 1/8" bend 45° ea $ 6.651 § 64018 55448 5.87 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Muiti Fittings | Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

4" with a 1/4" bend 90° eaj $ 1971 % 190§ S 16318 1.74 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings § Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

67 with a 4 bend 90° ea $ 6.14 ¢ § 6.05]8% 5.1418% 5.46 No Bid
Brand} Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings | Muld Fittings {  Plastic Trends

4" beli cap eaf $ 1101 8 0921% 085]1% 0.87 No Bid
Brand} Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

6" bell cap ea $ 3531 8 3351% 300§ 5 3.16 No Bid
Brand} Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings § Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

6"x 6" saddle (Flex Rubber) WYE ea; by 42201 % 36131 % 42.68 No Bid Ne Bid
Brand} Fernco | Multi Fittings Fernce

8"x 6" saddle "PVC" WYE ea 5 21001 8 205513 20,06 ¢ No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends { Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings |
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

Brand

14 4" spigot caps FPT ea Ne Bid No Bid NeBid]$ 1.97 Ne Bid
Brand Plastic Trends

13 6" spigot caps FPT ed Noe Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 9.28 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends

16 B" sleeves ea 5 12651 § 122718 11.00 g $ 11.23 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings |  Plastic Trends

17 6"x 4" reducers ea $ 5390 % 506153 50008 4.80 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends | Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings | Plastic Trends

18  8"x 6" reducers ea S 228513 2140 5 210018 20.29 No Bid
Brand Multi Fittings | Multi Fittings {  Plastic Trends

19 4" clean out SW-MPT (w/o cap) ea NoBid | § 6.20 NoBid f § 1.19 No Bid
Brand Multi Fittings PlasticTrends

20 6" clean out SW-MPT (w/o cap) ea No Bid No Bid NeBidi§ 5.99 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends

21 6" SYE, SW-SW.SW ga $ 13.001 % 12,18 | 11.60 No Bid
Brand Plastic Trends § Multi Fittings | Plastic trends

IV, Ductile iron pressure main

Duactile iron pipe

1 4" Mechanical Joint ea No Bid No Bid 31.80 No Bid

Brand McWane
4"Slip Joint ea No Bid NoBid | $ 20141 % 23.19 Ne Bid

Brand US pipe McWane

2 6" Mechanical Joint ea No Bid No Bid 31.49 No Bid
Brand McWane
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
19]

6" Slip Joint ca 26.46
Brand US Pipe McWane

8" Mechanical Joint ea 35.60 No Bid No Bid 39.94 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

8" Slip foint ea No Bid No Bid 23.60 26.50 Ne Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

10" Mechanical Joint ed 46.61 No Bid No Bid 52.28 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

10" Siip leint ea 32.17 No Bid No Bid 38.10 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

12" Mechanical Joint ea 58.60 Ne Bid No Bid 63.73 Ne Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

12" Slip loint ea 36.85 No Bid No Bid 43.63 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

16" Mechanical Joint ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand

16" Slip Joint ea 53.44 No Bid No Bid 6327 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

18" Mechanical Joint ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand US Pipe

18" Stip Joint 2a 68.52 No Bid No Bid 81.13 No Bid
Brand US Pipe McWane

PYC sewer pipe

4" per It No Bid (.94 0.96 .90 No Bid
Brand JM Eagle M NAPCO

6" per Ift No Bid 2.03 2.10 1.96 No Bid
Brand iM Eagle M NAPCO
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Peried 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

3 8" 3.64 3 3.51 Ne Bid
IM Eagle M NAPCO
4 10" 5.71 591 5.50 No Bid
IM Eagle M NAPCO
3 12" No Bid 8.19 8.49 7.90 No Bid
JM Eagle Im NAPCO
V1. Ductile iron fittings - without flanges
Tees
1 4x4"MJ 36.90 55.00 36.90 56.40
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
2 6x 4" Ml 62.10 81.50 62.00 84.15
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
3 6x 06" M 67.05 87.88 67.00 90.60
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
4 §x4"MlJ 72.00 92.00 72.00 95.20
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
3 §xo6"MJ 83.25 99.00 83.25 107.70
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
6 8 x 8" Ml 100,35 114.00 100.35 125.00
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
7 12x4" M 135.45 156.00 135.45 164.00
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
8 12x6"MJ 135.45 158.00 135.45 165.90
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
9 12 x 8" MJ 156.60 179.00 156.60 187.00
SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
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Group JI - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
-- - T R
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Elbows - 22.5 Degree bends
114" Ml ea $ 40211 8 22.05 33.60 22.00 35.15
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
12 6" Ml €a $ 5680 % 34.20 43.16 34.20 50.35
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
13 8"MJ ea S 82,101 % 53.10 66.41 53.00 70.05
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
14 12" MJ eg $ 14266 % § 104.40 120.10 104.40 140.75
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Elbows ~ 45 Degree bends
15 4"MJ ea $ 4070 ¢ § 22.95 34,59 2295 36.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
16 6" M]J ed h 60.14 1 § 37.35 50.8¢ 37.35 53.35
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
17  8"MlJ ea b 80.16 | § 54.45 67.50 54.45 71.35
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA. Star
18 12" MJ eg $ 158501 § 119.25 133.40 119.25 155.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Eibows - 90 Degree hends
19 4" MJ ea $ 46581 § 27.90 38.87 27.90 40.75
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
20 6"MJ ea 3 69261 % 45.90 58.00 4590 61.60
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
O ok o
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
22 12"MJ ea 185.60 144,00 153.00 144.00 165.40
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Crosses
23 4x4 ea 117,40 79.65 99.04 79.65 104,50
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
24 6x4" ea 138.42 86.85 105.47 86.85 114,90
BRrand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
25 6x6" ea 144 .80 97.65 118.45 G7.65 128.8¢
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
26 8x 6" ea 150,40 101.25 126.80 101.25 133.80
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
27 8x & ea|l § 102531 % 146.91 133.25 106.65 140.50
Brand Star Sta SIGMA SIGMA Star
WYES
28 4" MJ ea 89.00 60.30 74.80 60.30 78.90
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
29 6"MIJ ea 128.37 91.80 108.00 91.80 114.45
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Reducers - Spigot Both Ends
30 ex4"MJ ea 35.25 32.40 28.95 34.56 31.15
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
31 8x4"MI ea 52.88 48.60 43.42 51.84 46.75
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Suppiies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
33 10x4"Ml ea No bid NoBid] § 104.40 § 111.36 No Bid
Brand SIGMA . SIGMA
34 10x6"MJ caf $ 64891 % 73901 8% 67.50 72.00 64.90
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
35 10x8'MJ eaj § 66.190 § 749008 $ 63.85 73.44 66.20
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
36 12x6" M eal $ 81761 § 9200¢ % 85.05 90.72 81.80
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
37 12x8"MIJ eal § 84363 S 954010 % 87.75 93.60 84.40¢
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
38 12x10"MJ eajf $ 76.14 1 % 86161 % 7920 84.48 76.20
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
Reducers - Spigot to M.J
39 6x4"MIJ 396541 % 41.83 3150 1 % 41.835 33.35
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
40 8x4"MJ 60007 3§ 47.70 48301 % 47.70 51.50
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
41 Bx6"MIJ eaf § 40231 % 46.00 48.95
Brand Star SIGMA Star
42 10 x4" Ml 78.00 1 % 63.00 62.801% 63.00 67.15
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
43 10x6"MJ 833231 § 65.25 67.021 5 65.25 71.50
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through (9-30-14
i D
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
45 12x6"MlJ eaj § 89981 $ 92.30 98.73
Brand Star SIGMA Star
46 12x 8" Ml 9200¢ § 89.53 74.60 89.55 79.60
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
47 12x 10" MJ 113283 92.25 9].26 92.23 97.30
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
Reducers - M.J both ends
48 6x4"MJ 48264 $ 26.35 3940 28.32 41.20
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
49 8 x 4" MJ 61007 % 3645 45.00 36.43 31.30
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
50 8x6"MJ 66001 % 38.70 52.78. 38.70 5540
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
51 10 x4"MJ 91008 % 59.85 72.90 59.85 77.00
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
52 10x6"MJ 82901} § 50.40 66.21 50.40 69.65
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
33 10x8&"MJ 97001 % 55.35 71.35 55.35 75.19
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
54 12x6"MI 116.00 | $ 66.60 81.65 66.60 86.20
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
35 12x8&"MJ 105001 % 67.93 83.60 67.95 88.30
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
56 12x 10" MJ 117.00§ $ 75.60 93.40 73.60 98.60
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through (9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-39-14

57  4"MJ ea 5 10.65 NoBid}$§ 11.00 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

38 6" MIJ ea $ 18.10 NoBid{ § 18.20 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

59 8" Ml ea $ 21.00 NoBid | $ 2175 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

50 10" MIJ ea S 37.30 NoBid | § 37.50 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

61 12" M) ea $ 52.00 NoBid ] § 53.50 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

62 16" MI ea h) 72.90 NoBid | $ 74.75 No Bid No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA

Retaining Glands (mega-lug) - '"Retainers"

63 4" MJ caj S 14.00 NoBid | § 2498 1% 1754 1 % 12.15
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA Star

64 6" MJ ed g 20.00 NoBid]$ 31001 8 21281 § 14.25
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA Star

65 8"MJ ea $ 27.90 NoBid{ § 3900 ) 8 31451 % 21.75
Brand | Star SIGMA SIGMA Star

66 10" MJ eag $ 45,90 NoBid i § 7050 § 59431 % 32.20
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA, Star

67 12" MJ eal $ 57.60 NoBidj s 74001 8 62461 S 46.85
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA Star

68 16"MJ ea $ 99.50 NeoBid] § 147.001 8 133691 % 85.45
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
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Group Ji - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 49-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

69 4" MJ ea b 41508 S 22.95 36.00 24,75 37.75
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star

70 6" MJ ea $ 65759 % 41.40 34.30 41.40 57.25
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star

71 8" M ea b 96451 % 67.95 79.30 67.95 84.35
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star

72 10" M) ea $ 18201 § 81.45 97.60 81.45 103.20
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star

73 12" M ea $ 153.061 § 109.80 125.00 109.80 132.50
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star

74 18" MJ ea 3 276.00% % 210.60 230.64 210.60 235.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA, Star

Biank Plug with 2" Tap (pipe threads)

75 4" MJ ea $ 25401 8 23.40 27.80 23.40 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA

76 6" MJ 2a $ 37201 % 34.20 39.00 34.20 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA

77 8" M ed IS 4990 ¢ § 45.90 50.45 45.90 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA

78 10" MI ea 3 82201 % 75.60 80.00 75.60 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA

79 12" MIJ ea h 81201 % 74.70 8:.00 74.70 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA

Adapters - MJ to FL. _

g0 4" ea 1 3 3761F § 26.55 36.90 26.55 No Bid

Brand| Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-38-14
5 e
82 8 ea 74.40 56.25 597518§ 36.25 No Bid
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA
VII. Bolts and gaskets
Bolts
1 MIJ Lock Bolts "Anti Rotation” 171.00 165.00 131254 8 139.00 123.70
Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
2 Bolt (3/4"x 3 1/3"y Ml per 100 96.00 93.00 108.00 93.00 86.50
Brand Star| Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
3 Bolt (3/4" x 4"y Ml per 100 163.00 108.00 123.00 9%.00 92.70
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
Gaskets
3 4" MJ per 50 120.00 113.00 10300 ¢ % 113.00 99.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
4" Transition per 50' 142.00 135.50 125501 % 135.00 118.50
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
4 6" MlJ per 50E 120.00 113.00 106.00 18 113.00 99.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
6" Transition per 50 170.00 164.50 133.00 ¢ 8 164.50 144.00
Brand Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA Star
5 8" M per 50 137.00 150.00 141.00 141.00 123.50
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
8" Transition per 50 221.00 240.00 228.00 228.00 200.00
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA Star
6 10" MJ per 50 164.00 180.00 169.50 1575061 % 169.00
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contraet Perjiod 11-21-12 through 09-30-13

Renewable Option 10-91-13 through 09-30-14

7295 .50

276.50 276.00
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA }§
7 12" M1 per 50 221.00 240001 § 2280018 212.50 228.00 }
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA |
12" Transition per 50 308.00 333.001 % 317560 S 295.50 317.50 §
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA
8 16" MJ per 50 365.00 39500 S 376.00 | $ 350.00 376.00
Brand Star Star SIGMA SIGMA SIGMA | Stap:
16" Transition per 50 547.00 NeBid | § 2,044,350 2,044.50 No Bid
Brand Star, SIGMA SIGMA
VIl Gate valves & Appurtenances 5
"Gate valves - 3" thru 48" - for water and other liguids
GATE Valve - M)
I 3" Mueller or ea 296.66 266.00 § 268.00 282001 % 271.00
M & H or equal Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H M&H
2 4" Mueller a2380-20 or ea 301.33 298.35 % 300.00 31500 ¢ 8 304.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H M&H
3 6" Mueller A2380-20 or ea 384.53 380.70 5 381.75 402.00 | § 388.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H Mé&H M&H M&H
4 8" Muelier A2380-20 or ea 612.45 606.40 § 608.00 642.00 ] 618.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H M&H
5 10" Mueiier A2380-20 or ed 955.00 945.00 8 947.00 998.00 1 § 964.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M & H M&H M & H M&H M&H
6 12" Mueller A2380-20 or ea 1,208.42 1,196.00 3 },198.00 1,261.00] § 1,220.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H M&H
7 16" Mueller A2380-20 ea 4,281.51 3,930.00 b 3,935.00 424600} 8 4,010.00
M & H 67-01 or equal Brand M&H M & H M & H M & H M&H
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Peried 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewabie Option 10-01-13 through 09-3G-14
8 4" Mueller H667 or 353.87 380.00 398.00 384.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H M&H M & H M&H
5 6" Mueller H667 or ea 337.00 33200¢ % 389.00 562.00 542.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H AVK M&H M & H
10 8" Mueller H667 or ea 797.12 792.00 508.00 835.00 805.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H M&H M&H M&H
i1 10" Mueller H667 or ea 1,207.99 1,200.00 947.00 1,260.00 1,214.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H M&H M & H M & H
12 12" Mueller H667 or ea 1,815.73 1,800.00 1,198.00 1,903.00 1,834.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M&H M & H M&H M & H
13 16" Mueller H667 or 2a 4,854.57 4,700.00 No Bid 4,956.00 4,680.00
M & H 751 or equal brand M&H M & H M&H M & H
Tapping Sleeve
14 4x4" JCM 412 or equai "CO00" eaf 241111 8 261.40 210.00 238.20 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM ¥ord
4x4" "CLASS 160" €a No Bid 241011 § 261.40 238.20 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
15 6x4" JCM 412 or equal "C00" eaf 220721 % 269.01 225.00 221.45 Ne Bid
Brand} Smith Blair Power Seal JICM Ford
6 x 4" "CLASS 160" ea 220721 8 269.01 225.00 221.45 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford
16 6x6"ICM 412 or equal ca 272.85 258721 % 294.84 276.17 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
6 x 6" "CLLASS 160" ea 272.85 25872 1 8 294.84 276.17 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13

Renewabie Option 18-01-13 throu

gh 09-30-14

I8

19

20

21

22

23

Brand

8 x 4" "CLASS 160"

8 x 6" JCM 412 or equal

Bx 6" "CLASS 160"

& x 8" JCM 412 or equal

& x 8" "CLASS 160"

10 x 4" JCM 412 or equal

0 x 4" "CLASS 160"

10 x 6" JCM 412 or equal

10 x 6" "CLASS 160"

10 x 8" JCM 412 or equal

10 x 8" "CLASS 160"

12 x 4" JCM 412 or equal

ea
Brand

ea
Brand

ea
Brand

ea
Brand

ea
Brand§

ea
Brand

€a

Brand

ea
Brand

Ford

334.26
Ford

334.26
Ford

268.00
Ford

240.18
Smith Blair

240,181 &
Smith Blair

26244 1 &
Smith Blair

26244 § %
Smith Blair

320221 %
Smith Blair

329228 8
Smith Blair

24204 § &
Smith Blair

242041 §
Smith Blair

269861 %
Smith Blair

269861 §
Smith Blair

35240 &
Smith Blair

352400 %
Smith Blair

261508 §
Smith Blair

282,68
Power Seal

282.68
Power Seal

308.54
Power Seal

308.54
Power Seal

376.24
Power Seal

376.24
Power Seal

295.30
Power Seal

295.50
Power Seal

320.25
Power Seal

320.25
Power Seal

385.09
Power Seal

385.09
Power Sea}l

311.13
Power Seal

JICM

245.00
JCM

259.60
JICM

259.00
JCM

255.00
ICM

255.00
JCM

273.00
ICM

273.00
JCM

341.00
iCM

341.00
ICM

230.49
Ford

253.95
Ford

253.95
Ford

338.32
Ford

338.32
Ford

247.27
Ford

24727
Ford

269.50
Ford

269.50
Ford

320.20
Ford

32020
Ford

274.58
Ford

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-38-14
‘.ZH C
e e e st
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
24 12x 6" JCM 412 or equal eal $ 292001 8§ 285621 8 336.6G ) 298.70 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
12 x 6" "CLASS 160" eaf § 292001 % 285621 % 336.60 298.70 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
25 12x 8" ICM 412 or egual "C900" 363531 % 40478 | § 363001 % 349.60 No Bid
Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford
12 x 8" "CLASS 160" 363551 ¢ 40478 1 $ 3630098 349.60 No Bid
Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford
26 16 x 4" JCM 412 or equal "C900" eaj § 31400 $ 290221 % 392.60 1% 320.68 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
16 x 4" "CLASS 1607 eaj $ 30448 § § 290221 % 392.90 s 320.68 Ne Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal : Ford
27 16x6" JCM 412 or equal "CH00" eaf S 351003 § 325201 8 423.03 S 359.35 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
16x 6" "CLASS 160" eaf § 339.55 423.03 NoBid§ § 359.35 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal Ford
28 16x8" JCM 412 or equal "C900" eal § 433001 % 400831 % 496.47 44291 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Biair Power Seal Ford
16 x 8" "CLASS 160" eaj $ 437600 $ 400,831 & 496.47 442.91 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal Ford
IX. Brass Water Service Fittings AWWA C-800
Dual check w/Meter Nipple (Built In)
1 344 45.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 0%-30-13
HRenewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

No Bid

No Bid |

Brand Ford
3 112" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
4 " ea No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Dual Check w/o Meter
Meter nipple built in
1 3/4n No Bid No Bid NoBid{§ 45.57 No Bid
Ford
HHS31-323-NL
2 ! No Bid No Bid NoBid 1 8 49.52 No Bid
Ford
HHS31-344-NL
3 112" ea No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
4 2 ea No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
Brand
Bronze gate valves (1/2" - 3" diameter)
1 ¥:" diameter bronze gate valve No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1" diameter bronze gate valve No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 | ¥&” diameter bronze gate valve No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 1 Y& diameter bronze gate valve No Bid No Bid Neo Bid No Bid No Bid
sEmvIE




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Pericd 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

b

5 2" diameter bronze gate valve "full port" ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
6 24" diameter bronze gate valve ca No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
7 3" diameter bronze gate valve ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Cut off valves - With Lock Wing Only
{Items 1-12 are "or equal'")
1 Ball Valve 34" (FPT) <4056 eajl $ 37348 8 38.08 No Bid 40.16 No Bid
Mueller B-20245/ Ford B11- 333W Brand Ford Ford AY
2 Ball Valve 1" (FPT) <407%> eaj $ 62201 8§ 58.35 No Bid 61.553 No Bid
Mueller B-2020/ Form B11-444W Brand Ford Ford AY
3 Bail Valve %" (CTS-MPT)"Packed Joint <4051> ea No Bid No Bid 52.78 No Bid No Bid
Brand AY
4 Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-MSN) "Packed Joint cal § 51971 % 49.00 No Bid 51.71 No Bid
<4048>, Mueller H-14348/Ford B43-3332W Brand Ford Ford AY
5 Ball Valve 1" (CTS-MSN) "Packed Joint" eal $ 71061 % 72.50 No Bid 76.41 No Bid
<4095>, Mueller H-14348//Ford/B43-444W Brand Ford Ford AY
6 Ball Valve 3/4" x 1" (MSN-CTS)"Packed Joint” ea 52.97 No Bid 55.88 53.86 No Bid
<4038>, Mueller B-24350/Ford B43-342W Brand Ford AY Ford
7 Ball Valve 3/4" (PVC-MSN) <4065> caj 54.00 No Bid 5591 53.88 Neo Bid
Mueller B-24353/Ford B73-332W Brand Ford Ford
8 Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-FPT)"'Packed Joint" ea 43.25 No Bid 32.78 43.53 No Bid
<4066, Muelier B-25170/Ford B41-333W Brand Ford AY Ford
9 Ball Valve 1" (CTS-FPT)"Packed Joint" e 65.40 No Bid 66.96 66.05 No Bid
<4092>, Mueller B-25170/Ford B41-444W Bran Ford AY Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through $9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
. T .

<4057>, Muelier B-25170/Ford B41-343W Brand Ford AY Mueller

1T Ball Valve 2"(FPT-CTS)"Packed Joint" ea S 191.90 NoBid {3 202731 % 196.94 No Bid
<4035>, Muelier B-25170/Ford B41-777W Brand Ford AY Ford

12 Ball Valve 2" (FPT) ea 5 171.75 NoBid [ $ 181311 % 174.61 No Bid
Ford B11-777W Brand Ford AY Ford
Joint Connections
(Ttems 1-21 are "or equal™)

1 Coupling 3/4" (CTS-MPTY'Packed Joint <4050> ea 3 FL.18 NoBid | § I1L251% 10.84 No Bid
Mueller H-15428 / Ford C84-33 Brand Ford AY Ford

2 Coupling 1" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint" <4027> ea $ 13.23 NoBid|$ 1332 1% 12.83 No Bid
Mueller H-15428 / Ford C84-44 Brand Ford AY Ford

3 Coupling 3/4" (FPT-CTS)"Packed Joint" <4055> ea $ 11.60 No Bid || § 11831 % 11.46 No Bid
Muelier H-15451 / Ford C14-33 Brand Ford AY Ford

4 Coupling 1" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint" <4080> eal 5 15.95 No Bid § § 160415 15.47 No Bid
Mueller H-15451 / Ford Cl14-44 Brand Ford AY Ford

5 Coupling 3/4" (CTS) “Packed Joint" <4049> ea b 13.05 No Bid ] § 1370 1 8 13.20 No Bid
Mueiler H-15403 / Ford C44-33 Brand Ford AY Ford

6 Coupling 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint" <4083> eal 1% 15.27 NoBid [ $ 1564 1% 15.09 No Bid
Mueller H-15403 / Ford C44-44 Brand} Ford AY Ford

7 Coupling 2" (CTS) "Packed Joint" <4036> €a $ 67.10 NoBid|$ 7074 1 § 68.17 No Bid
Mueller H-15403 / Ford C44-77 Brand} Ford AY Ford

g Coupling 3/4" (FPT-CTS) "Packed Joint" eaj $ 13748 % 14.59 No Bid 14.24 No Bid
Ford C17-33 Brand Ford Ford Ford

9 Coupling 1" (FPT-CTS) "Packed Joint™ <4088> eal $ 21201 $ 22.20 No Bid 21.97 No Bid
Ford C17-44 Brand Ford Ford Ford

=
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 16-01-13 through 09-30-14

12

17

18

20

21

<4069, Ford C17-34

Coupling 3/4" (CTS--PVC) "Packed Joint"
<4053>, Ford C47-33

Coupling 1" (CTS--PV() "Packed Joint"
<4086>, Ford C47-44

Coupling 3/4" (CTS—PVC) "Packed Joint"
<4074>, Ford C47-34

Coupling 3/4" X 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint”
<4071, Ford C44-34

Coupling 3/4" X 1" (MPT-CTS) "Packed Joint"
<4072>, Ford C84-34

Coupling 3/4" (MPT-PVC) <4064>
Ford C87-33

Coupling 1" (PVC) <4026>
Ford C&7-44

Coupling 2" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"
<4037>, Ford C84-77

Coupling 2" {CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"
<4029>, Ford C14-77

Coupling 2" (Meter-FL-MPT)w/Gaskets <4030>
Ford CF38-77-2.125

Coupling 2" (Meter-FL-FPT)w/Gaskets <4034>
Ford CF31-78

D

Brand

Brand

Ford

17.84
Ford

2577
Ford

24.96
Ford

15.33
Ford

12.00
Ford

14,35
Ford

22.40
Ford

31.22
Ford

53.53
Ford

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Na Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Opticn 10-01-13 through (9-30-14

11

12

Corporation 3/4"cc (MPT-CTS) "Packed Joint"
<4054> Mueller H-15008 / Ford F1000

Corporation "cc (MPT-CTS) "Packed Joint"
<4091> Muelier H-13008 / Ford F1000

WYE 1" X 3.4"(CTS} "Packed Joint"

<4068> Mueller HI-15343 / Ford F144-243

TEE 3/4" (FPT) <4052>

TEE 3/4" (CTS) "Packed Joint" <4062>

TEE 1" (FPT) <4084>

TEE 1" (CTS} "Packed Joint" <4075>

Nipple 2" (All Thread / By Close) <4033>

Nipple 3/4" (All Thread / By Close)

Nipple 3/4" (3" Length)

Meter Nipple 3/4" X 2 1/2" - long

Meter Nipple 3/4"X 1 5/8" - short

ea kY 23.50
Brand Ford
ea b 35.25
Brand Ford
ea S 27.10
Brand Ford
eal § 12001 § 8.50
Brand Merit Merit
eal $§ 33471 8 32.00
Brand Ford Ford
eai § 20481 % 11.95
Brand Merit Merit
eal $ 35834 % 34.20
Brand Ford Ford
eal & 7561 $ 10.25
Brand Merit Merit
ea 3.63
Brand Merit
ea 4.7%
Brand Merit
ea No Bid
Brand
ea No Bid
Brand

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

37.04 1 8

8.06
MATCO

3544
AY

9.00
MATCO

20415
MATCO

3951 %
MATCO

23.64
Ford

3574
Ford

27.30
Ford

1.96
Merit

3.27
Merit

4.80
Dake

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ne Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-36-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-3¢-14
13 Dresser Coupling 3/4" {compression) <3049> cat § 20313 8§ 10.20 No Bid § No Bid No Bid
Smith Blair 522 Brand Dresser Smith Blair
14 Dresser Coupling 1" (compression) <3058> ea| % 24331 % 11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Smith Blair 522 Brand Dresser Dresser
15 Dress Coupling 2" (compression) <3030> ea] § 42771 $ 20,00 No Bid § No Bid No Bid
Smith Bilair 522 Brand Dresser Dresser
X.  Rubber couplings - Fernco, Mission or equal
PYC to PVC
1 4x4PVCtoPVC ea NoBid| & 35018 375158 4.10 Neo Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
2 4x6PVCto PVC ea NoBid § 3 84718 90418 10.28 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
3 6x6PVCtoPVC eal NoBid{ § 70018 77088 8.76 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
4 6 x 8 PVC 10 PVC ea NoBid | § 111G} $ 14300 % 16.27 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
5 8x &PV o PVC ea NoBid} § 13.00] % 11.841 8% 13.47 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
6 Wx 10 PVC o PVC ea NoBid!] § 157515 17.81 8 8 20.22 No Bid
Brand Mission Femco Mission
7 12x12PVCto PVC ea NoBid} § 19.00 1% 207718 23.60 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission
PVC to Clay
1 4 x4 PVCitoclay eaf NoBid§ § 3501 % 37518 4.10 No Bid
Brand} Mission Fernco Mission
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

Brand Fernco Mission

3 6x6PVCtoclay ea No Bid | 7701 $ 8.76 Ne Bid
Brand ' Fernco Mission

4 6 x 8 PVC to clay ea No Bid NoBid § § 1435301 % 16,27 No Bid
Brand Mission

5 8x 8 PVCtoclay ea NoBid | $ HLOOE S 11.84 1% 13.47 No Bid
Brand Mission Fernco Mission

6 10 x 10 PVC to clay ea] $ 16.34 No Bid § 1781 1% 20.22 No Bid
Brand Fernco Fernco Mission

7 12 x 12 PVC to clay eal § 19.06 No Bid 26771 S 23.60 No Bid
Brand Fernco Fernco Mission

PV to Concrete

{ 4 x4 PVC to congrete eaj $ 3.37 No Bid | 3891 % 4.42 No Bid
Brand Fernco Fernco Mission

2 4 x 6 PVC to concrete ea No Bid NoBid|$§ 90418S 10.28 No Bid
Brand Fernco Mission

3 6 x 6 PVC to concrete ea]l § 7.83 NoBid | 83521% 9.69 No Bid
Brand Fernco Fernco Mission

4 6 x 8 PVC to concrete ea No Bid NoBidi $ 1537218 54.89 No Bid
Brand Fernco Mission

5 8 x 8 PVC to concrete ea] $ 11.74 No Bid 12791 % 14.55 No Bid
Brand Fernco Fernco Mission
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
D South

] 4" w/overall range 0f 4.25" - 5.63, overall length 8.7", eal § 133.00 ¢ § [30.84 ] 137.69 b 131.47 No Bid
overall width 7.87" overall coupling middle ring 5.9" Brand 421 Smith Blair
maximuem gap between pipes 5.50" and weight 15 Ths. B/N 20000563260 563-260 2000-0563-260

2 6" w/overzall range of 6.42" - 7.68", overall length 10.8", eal $ t77.00 1 § 172701 $ 179.03
overall width 10.75" overall coupling middle ring 8.0", Brand 421 Smith Blair

b 174.10 No Bid

maximum gap between pipes 7.50" and weight 21 lbs. PN 20000768260 786-260 2000-0768-260

3 8" w/overall range of 8.54" - 9.84, overall length 10.8", eai § 199001 § 19560 | 202.13 196.56 No Bid
overail width 12.91" overail coupling middle ring 8.0", Brand 421 Smith Blair
maximum gap between pipes 7.50" and weight 26 ibs. P/N 20000984260 984-260 2000-0984-260

4 10" w/overall range of 10.70" - 11.37", overall length eaf § 257.00 1 § 255001 § 260.03 $ 251.74 No Bid
10.8", overall width 15.04" maximum gap between Brand 421 Smith Biair
pipes 7.50" and weight 31 fbs, PINE 200001200260 1200-260 2000-1200-260

XII  Repair clamps - 3" Long

1 W ea $ 4041 % 6.6218% 4501 % 4.43 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford

2 eal § 4.74 6.62 01 $ 491 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal Ford

3 1447 eal $ 4921 % 46118 7.17 § 5.10 No Bid
Brand Ford Smith Biair Power Seal Ford

4 ] A" ea $ 4951 % 74718 53548 5.46 No Bid
Brand| Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford

5 2" eaj $ 6.14 $ 88218 56018 5.96 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

6 27 eafl $ 7.19 $ 8778 7.751% 7.45 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

73" ea B 18.001 8 9.17F$ 775158 7.80 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal ICM Ford Ak an




Group JI - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

; 7 ea 8.i3 3 8.66]% 8.80 8.18 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal ICM Ford

2 i ea 8.67 g 8.6615% §.80 8.99 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

3 B4 ea 9.13 ¢ 952418 8.30 9.47 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

4 14 ea 9.92 A3 10371 % 10.00 10,29 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

3 2" ea 11.83 3 12.857 % 11.10 10.78 No Bid
Brand Ford Power Seal JCM Ford

& 2% ea $ 15000 17.331% 15.50 14.87 No Bid
Brand Smith Biair Power Seal JCM Ford

7 3" ea o 19008 § 18571 % 16.65 15,75 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM Ford

Fall Circle Repair Clamps - JCM

i 2" ea $ 53.001 % 5721 | $ 66.50 No Bid No Bid

Range(s) 2.35-2.63 ea $ 53001 % 57.2118% 66.50 No Bid No Bid

$ 2.70-3.13 ea $ 53003 % 572118 66.50 No Bid No Bid

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM No Bid No Bid

2 3" ea $ 588381 % 5680189 86.50 No Bid No Bid

Range(s) 2.97-3.25 ea $ 58881 % 56801% 86.50 No Bid No Bid

3.46-3.70 ea $ 58881 % 56804 % 86.50 No Bid No Bid

3.73-4.00 ea $ 58881 % 5680108 86.50 No Bid No Bid

3.96-4.25 ea $ 58888 % 5680:% 86.50 No Bid No Bid

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM No Bid No Bid
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through §9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

3B

U S 68.00 | $ S

Range(s) 4.45-4.73 g 68007 § 68.091]S 83.00 No Bid No Bid
4,74-5.14 § 68.00 1 § 63.091]¢ 83.00 No Bid No Bid
4.95-535 ] S 68.00 1 3 68.00| % 83.00 No Bid No Bid
5.22-5.62 $ 68001 3 68.09 1% 83.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM No bid No bid
4 6" 13 77000 % 67.1531 8% 100.00 No bid No Bid

Range(s) 5.95-6.35 1 s 77000 % 67.1518% 100.00 No bid No Bid
6.56-6.96 $ 77001 % 67.151 8 100.00 No bid No Bid
6.84.7.24 3 77001 % 67.15E % 100.00 No bid No Bid
7.05-7.45

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM No Bid No Bid
5 8"

Range(s) 7.95-8.35 S 98200 % 7737158 117.00 No Bid No Bid
8.54-8.94 5 9820 § 773718 117.00 No bid No bid
8.99-9.39 $ 9820141 § 7737415 117.00 No bid No bid
9.27-9.67 $ 98201 % 77.371% 117.00 No bid No bid
9.7-10-10 $ 98.20 % S 7137318 117.060 No bid No bid

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM No bid No Bid
6 10" $ 105001 § 84531¢% 151.00 No Bid No Bid

Range(s) 11.75-12.15 $ 105.00] § 84.53 15§ 151.00 No Bid No Bid
10.64-11.04 $ 165.00] § 84.531°% 151.00 No Bid No Bid
11.04-11.46 $ 105001 & 84531% 151.00 No Bid No Bid

Brand Smith Blair Power Seal ICM No Bid No Bid
7 12" $ 12580} § 90541 % 174.00 NeoBid NoBid
Range(s) 13,10-13.5 b 12580 § § 9054 1 3 174,00 NoBid NoBid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal’ JCM NoBid NoBid
Bell Joint Clamps
(All are Dresser, Smith Blair, Ford or Mueller, Bell Joint clamps 01
] 4" ea ) 104.00 NoBid| $ 95.00 55.26 No Bid
Brand} Smith Blair JCM Ford
2 6" ea 5 115.00 NoBid 1§ 104.00 60.85 No Bid
Brand§ Smith Blair JCM Ford
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through $9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

HD
145.00
Brand Smith Blair JCM Ford
4 on ea ) 200.00 NoBid{ § 197.001 8 105.33 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair JCM Ford
5 12" ea $ 230.00 NoBid§ § 2265013 114.48 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair ICM Ford
Foster adapters or approved equal
1 4 per 504 % 3389501 8 2.975.00 NoBidt § 3,450.00 No Bid
Brand In Fact Star Foster
2 6" per S0 $ 4237501 % 3,850.00 NoBid | $ 4,250.00 No Bid
Brand In Fact Star Foster
3 8" per 501 $ 6145501 % 3.850.00 NoBid | % 6,300.00 No Bid
Brand In Fact Star Foster
4 10" per 508 § 84775010 % 8,200.00 NoBid { § 8,850.060 No Bid
Brand In Fact Star Foster
5 12" per 50t § 927250 % 8.900.00 NoBid| $ 9,400.00 No Bid
Brand in Fact Star Foster
XIIL Cast Iron Saddles-Baker, Ford, Smith Blair, Mueller, Rockwell wit ¢ to fit all pipes.
**Double Strap
MAIN Size Tap Size - Cast Iron C900
l 1207%* 1"ce ea b 37601 % 3884 % 3000 % 39.39 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM 402 Ford
¥
2" IPT ea 3 47.00 | $ 53410 % 510048 30.00 No Bid
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal JCM 402 Ford
2 [ 1" cc ea; $ 31450 % 350018 34001 % 31.05 No Bid
Brand| Smith Blair Power Seal JCM 402 Ford
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Group JI - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13

Renewabie Option 10-01-13 throu

03]

gh 09-30-14

t

39.90

52.74

Brand} Smith Blair Power Seal
3 gk "ee ea N 27501 % 31.59
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
2UIPT €a g 334041 8§ 4025
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
4 B I"ce ea $ 24501 % 28.05
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
2" IPT eaj § 2724 ¢ % 280010 % 37.41
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal §.«
5 4rE 1"ee ea 20501 $ 2558
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
2V IPT ea 26501 § 33.59
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
6 o 1"ce ea 18201 8 18501 % 26.16
Brand Ford Smith Blair Power Seal
7 PR 1"ce ea 14.17 24.40
Brand Ford Power Seal
8 JrEk 1"ee ed No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
MAIN Size Tap Size - Extended Range
1 12k 1"ce ea $ 37601 § 38.84
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
2" IPT ea g 47501 % 5341
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal
2 FOTRE ec caf 3 31451 % 335.00
Brand Smith Blair Power Seal

42.00
JCM 402 Ford
26.00 25.52 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
33.50 31.85 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
24.50 23.31 No Bid
JCM 442 Ford
28.39 No Bid
Ford
20.00 20.13 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
26.00 24.15 No Bid
JICM 402 Ford
19.00 No Bid
JCM 402
16.00 No Bid
ICM 402
No Bid No Bid
39.00 39.39 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
51.00 50.00 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
34.00 31.05 No Bid
JCM 402 Ford
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Group Ji - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-36-13

Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

s

8!1**

611**

4

e

ks

e

1"ce

2" IPT

2" IPT

1"ee

2N IPT

1"ce

1"ce

1"¢e

36.90
Brand Stith Blair
ea S 2800 S
Brand Smith Blair
ea 8 3450 %
Brand Smith Blair
F
ea is 25601 §
Brand Smith Blair
eal § 2724 4% % 3000 §
Brand Mueller Smith Blair
ea 20073
Brand Smith Blair
ea 26501 %
Brand Smith Blair
eaj § 23264 S 18501 %
Brand Mueller Smith Blair
ea 13750 %
Brand Smith Blair
ea No Bid No Bid
Brand

Power Seal

31.59
Power Seal

40.25
Power Seal

28.05
Power Seal

37.41
Power Seal

25.58.
Power Seal

33.59
Power Seal

26.16
Power Seal

24.44
Power Seal

No Bid

42.00
JCM 402

26.00
JCM 402

33.50
JCM 402

24.60
JCM 402

20.00
JCM 402

26.00
JCM 402

16.00
JCM 402

Ford

24.52
Ford

31.85
Ford

2331
Ford

28.39
Ford

20.13
Ford

24,15
Ford

23.03
Ford

No Bid

No Bid
Ford

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through $9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
1 18" bury size 547 €a No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Model
18" bury size 6 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Model
2 24" bury size 5 W ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
Brand
Model
24" bury size 6 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Model
3 3 bury size 547 ea 1,185.00 1,189.00 No Bid § 1,193.30 1,196.06
Brand M & H M&H M&H M&H
Mode! 129 129 129 129T
3 bury size 6 ed 1,145.00 1,150.00 No Bid 1,153.10 1,156.00
Brand M&H M & H M&H M & H
Model 129 129 129 £29T
4 4 bury size 5 Y47 ea 1,242.00 1.239.00 No Bid 1,251.72 1,254.00
Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H
Model 129 129 129 1297
4' bury size 6 ea 1,189.00 £,250.00 No Bid 1,197.86 1,200.00
Brand M&H M&H M&H M&H
Model 129 129 129 1297
5 18' bury size 5 147 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Model
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through §9-30-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
] D
Brand
Model
24" bury size 5 47 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand
Model
24" bury size 6 eal $ 9806.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Maueller
Model
3° bury size 3 W47 ea NoBid] § 1,090.00 Ne Bid No Bid 1,105.00
Brand M&H M & H
Model 129
3 bury size & eaj & 1,043.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid| 5 1,053.00
Brand Mueller M&H
Model
4’ bury size 5 W7 ea NoBid § $ 1,150.00 No Bid Ne Bid 1,163.00
Brand M&H M&H
Model 129
4" bury size 6 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | § [,098.00
Brandk M&H
Model
3" bury eaj § 315001 § 830.00 No Bid 825.60
Item 2 to inciude (1) 2 1/2" hose nozzle Brand M&H M&H M&H
Shore inlet connection to be a MJ 3" - Yellow only Model 33 33 33
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Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through (9-306-13
Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14
HD T
Extension kit for 3 /4” main valve opening. (barrel, stem, coupling, etc.) _
1 M&H 129 12" $ 305.00 235.00 No Bid § 303.00
2 M & H 129 18” $ 344.00 263.00 No Bid 344.00
3 M&H 129 24 § 373.00 295.00 Ne Bid 373.00
4 M & H 129 36" S 589.00 525.00 No Bid 589.00
] M & H 929 12v $ 305.00 No Bid No Bid 303.00
2 M & H 929 187 $ 344.00 No Bid No Bid 344.00
3 M & H 929 247 8 374.00 No Bid No Bid 373.00
4 M & H 929 36" ¥ 390.00 No Bid No Bid 589.00
1 Mueller A-422 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Mueller A-422 187 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Mueller A-422 247 No Bid No Bid No Bid 330.60 No Bid
4 Mueller A-422 36" No Bid No Bid No Bid 513.00 Ne Bid
] Mueller A-423 127 No Bid No Bid No Bid 255.00 No Bid
2 Mueller A-423 18 No Bid No Bid No Bid 288.00 No Bid
3 Mueller A-423 247 No Bid No Bid No Bid 330.00 No Bid
4 Mueller A-423 36" No Bid No Bid No Bid 513.00 No Bid
1 American darling 127 5 183.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 American darling 18 5 208.00 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
3 Armerican darling 24" g 235.00 No Bid No Bid nn VRBid




Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies
Contract Period 11-21-12 through 09-30-13

Renewable Option 10-01-13 through 09-30-14

Empire Pipe

P. 0. Box 101149
Birmingham, AL 35210
300-444-3211-phone
205-956-8251- fax
sktith@bellsouth.net

Southern Pipe & Supply

2202 34th Street

Gulfport, MS 39501

228-863-2505- phone

228-863-1729 fax

edward boykin@southernpipe.com

COUNCIL

HD Supply Waterworks
14050 White Road
Gulfport, MS 39503
228-563-1905 phone

228-563-6484 fax

Dusty.dysart@hdsupply.com

Central Pipe and
P. O. Box 5479
Pearl, MS 39208

Btagert@central

Supply

800-844-7700 - phone
601-932-8944 - fax

pipe.com

www.centralpipe

.CO0m

UEC &4 20m

Southern Waterworks

497 Cole Rd

Hattiesburg, MS 39402
877-261-7463-phone
601-296-0353~ fax
kevin@southernwaterworks.com

APPROVED

Cohurns Sepply
5271 Oid Bwy 11

Hattiesburg, MS 39402
601-268-0611 phone

601-268-3083 fax

www.coburns.com

4 American darling 36" 3 297.00 No Bid No Bid 317.60 No Bid
1 AVK 12”7 No Bid NoBid § $ 329.00 No Bid No Bid
2 AVK 18" No Bid NoBid| § 390.20 No Bid No Bid
3 AVK 247 No Bid NoBid ¢ § 438.00 No Bid No Bid
4 AVE 36" No Bid NoBid] § 667.00 No Bid No Bid
XV. Safety flange repair kit for 5 %4” main valve opening (flange, coupling, ete.)

i M&HI129 3 126.00 120.00 Ne Bid 56.00 172.00
2 M & H 629 8 160.00 No Bid No Bid 115.00 218.00
3 Muelier A-423 No Bid No Bid No Bid 102.0G No Bid
4 AVE No Bid NoBid{ § 120.00 No Bid No Bid

Safety flange repair kit for 4 % main valve opening (flange, coupling, etc.)
1 M&H 129 $ 126.00 120.00 No Bid 90.00 172.00
M & H929
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