

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping							
Contract Period 01-01-2023 through 12-31-2023							
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024							
	Design Precast	Southern Waterworks	Corbuns Supply	G+O Supply Co.	Consolidated Supply	Ferguson Waterworks	
		12/12/22 @ 9:28 am	12/12/22 @9:20 am	12/12/22 @8:54 am	11/22/22 @ 9:24 am	12/12/22 @ 11:36 am	
Section 1 - Ram Neck,Gasket Only							
Cut Length							
1. 1 x 2'5"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2. 1 1/2" x 3'5"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3. 1 3/4" x 3'5"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section 2 - HDPE Pipe Water Tight (Bell End) Connection, Smooth Interior							
1. 15"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$13.60	\$13.50	\$13.90	\$13.90	\$13.60
2. 18"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$18.04	\$18.04	\$18.44	\$18.44	\$18.04
3. 24"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$30.86	\$30.86	\$31.55	\$31.55	\$30.86
4. 30"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$43.30	\$43.30	\$44.27	\$44.27	\$43.30
5. 36"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$54.28	\$54.28	\$55.49	\$55.49	\$54.28
6. 42"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$69.92	\$69.62	\$71.48	\$71.48	\$69.92
7. 48"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$88.13	\$88.13	\$90.09	\$90.09	\$88.13
8. 60"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$151.76	\$151.76	\$155.14	\$155.14	\$151.76
Section 3 - Nyloplast or Equal, PVC Drain Basins with Lockable Cast Iron Grates							
1. 15"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$1,196.74	\$1,196.74	\$1,223.37	\$1,223.37	\$1,196.74
2. 18"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$1,404.35	\$1,404.35	\$1,435.59	\$1,435.59	\$1,404.35
3. 24"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$1,760.87	\$1,760.87	\$1,800.05	\$1,800.05	\$1,760.87
4. 30"	per lineal foot	No Bid	\$2,835.87	\$2,835.87	\$2,898.97	\$2,898.97	\$2,835.87
Section 4 - HDPE Pipe Perforated Sock Pipe – 20' Sections - Price per section							
1. 4" Flexible		No Bid	\$94.00	\$78.00	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$78.00
2. 4" Rigid		No Bid	\$42.80	\$214.00	\$219.00	\$43.80	\$42.80
3. 6" Rigid		No Bid	\$77.20	\$386.00	\$394.00	\$78.80	\$77.20
4. 8" Rigid		No Bid	\$146.00	\$730.00	\$747.00	\$149.40	\$146.00
5. 10" Rigid		No Bid	\$217.60	\$1,086.00	\$1,112.00	\$222.40	\$217.60
6. 12" Rigid		No Bid	\$209.60	\$1,048.00	\$1,071.00	\$214.20	\$209.60
7. 15" Rigid		No Bid	\$288.20	\$1,441.00	\$1,473.00	\$294.60	\$288.20

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2023 through 12-31-2023

Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

		Design Precast	Southern Waterworks	Corbuns Supply	G+O Supply Co.	Consolidated Supply	Ferguson Waterworks
			12/12/22 @ 9:28 am	12/12/22 @9:20 am	12/12/22 @8:54 am	11/22/22 @ 9:24 am	12/12/22 @ 11:36 am
8. 18" Rigid		No Bid	\$385.40	\$1,927.00	\$1,970.00	\$394.00	\$394.00
9. 24" Rigid		No Bid	\$635.80	\$3,179.00	\$3,250.00	\$650.00	\$635.00
Section 5 - HDPE Pipe, 20' Sections							
Diameter							
1. 15"	Flared End	No Bid	\$262.75	\$262.75	\$262.75	\$262.75	\$262.75
2. 18"	Flared End	No Bid	\$352.96	\$352.96	\$352.96	\$352.96	\$352.96
3. 24"	Flared End	No Bid	\$452.98	\$452.98	\$452.98	\$452.98	\$452.98
Section 6 - HDPE Perforated Sock Pipe, Flexible							
1. 4" Perforated Under-Drain sock pipe		No Bid	\$94.00	\$94.00	\$96.00	\$96.00	\$94.00
2. 6" Perforated Under-Drain sock pipe		No Bid	\$207.00	\$207.00	\$211.00	\$211.00	\$207.00
Diameter							
1. 15"	per foot	\$22.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2. 18"	per foot	\$30.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3. 24"	per foot	\$47.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4. 30"	per foot	\$67.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5. 36"	per foot	\$88.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6. 42"	per foot	\$109.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7. 48"	per foot	\$138.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8. 54"	per foot	\$170.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9. 60"	per foot	\$207.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01-01-2023 through 12-31-2023

Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

	Design Precast	Southern Waterworks	Corbuns Supply	G+O Supply Co.	Consolidated Supply	Ferguson Waterworks
		12/12/22 @ 9:28 am	12/12/22 @9:20 am	12/12/22 @8:54 am	11/22/22 @ 9:24 am	12/12/22 @ 11:36 am
	Chis A. Fore PO Box 2401 Gulfport, MS 39505 228-831-5833 rgregory@design[recast.com	Zack Guelker 429 Cole Road Hattiesburg, MS 39402 601-268-7463 zack@southernwaterworks.com	Mark Tate 2378 John Hill Blvd Gulfport, MS 39501 225-202-7808 mtate@coburns.com	Ray Harmon 18188 Hwy 49 Saucier, MS 228-236-4093 rharmon@gosupplyinc.com	Bill Turner 10250 Larkin Smith Gulfport, MS 228-396-8818 william.turner@cpsipe.com	Katje Toups 14231 Seaway Rd Unit B5 Gulfport, MS 39503 228-863-2757 katje.toups@ferguson.com