

Group C1 - Limestone, Washout Materials

Contract Period 01-01-2023 through 12-31-2023

Renewal Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

Description	Warren Paving	Land Shappers
1 Limestone ASTM #610	\$66.50	\$53.00
2 Limestone ASTM #57	\$68.60	\$54.00
3 Limestone 2 to 2 1/2" Clear (No fines) Items 1 - 3 Dept. of Public Works, 4050 Hewes Ave, Gulfport, MS Minimum delivery requirement - 15 cubic yards	\$68.60	\$56.00
4 Gabion Rock Bidder to load and deliver Bidder to load and city haul 5 Rip-Rap 100 Bidder to load and deliver Bidder to load and city haul 6 Rip-Rap 200 Bidder to load and deliver Bidder to load and city haul 7 Rip-Rap 300 Bidder to load and deliver Bidder to load and city haul Items 4-7 Minimum delivery requirement - 10 Tons	 \$61.50 \$53.50 \$61.50 \$53.50 \$61.50 \$53.50 \$61.50 \$53.50	 no bid no bid no bid \$68.00 no bid \$68.00 no bid \$68.00
	Joel Moody 11211 Reichold Road Gulfport, MS 39503 228-896-8003 joelmoody@warrenpaving.com	Ronald Parker PO Box 995 Gulfport, MS 39502 228-863-8996 landshaperinc1@gmail.com