

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
I.	Municipal service tubing Copper tube size OD ASTM D-2737-SDR9 (PE3408) Drisco pipe or equal						
1	¾" per ft Brand	\$0.37 ADS	Win \$0.37 ADS	Alt \$0.38 ADS	\$0.37 ADS	No Bid	Alt \$0.37 ADS
2	1" per ft Brand	\$0.61 ADS	\$0.61 ADS	\$0.62 ADS	\$0.61 ADS	No Bid	\$0.61 ADS
3	1 ½" per ft Brand	\$1.27 ADS	\$1.27 ADS	\$1.30 ADS	\$1.27 ADS	No Bid	\$1.27 ADS
4	2" per ft Brand	\$2.17 ADS	\$2.17 ADS	\$2.22 ADS	\$2.17 ADS	No Bid	\$2.17 ADS
II.	PVC Pressure Pipe						
1	4" per lft Brand	Alt \$7.55 Sanderson	Win \$6.91 Sanderson	No Bid	\$11.00 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$8.00 Westlake
2	6" per lft Brand	\$15.44 Sanderson	\$14.15 Sanderson	No Bid	\$22.95 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$15.35 Westlake - Alt
3	8" per lft Brand	\$26.46 Sanderson	\$24.24 Sanderson	No Bid	\$39.31 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$26.30 Westlake - Alt
4	10" per lft Brand	\$39.71 Sanderson	\$36.37 Sanderson	No Bid	\$59.00 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$42.04 Westlake
5	12" per lft Brand	\$55.91 Sanderson	\$51.20 Sanderson	No Bid	\$83.05 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$56.93 Westlake
6	16" per lft Brand	\$100.50 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$118.30 Westlake
III.	PVC Sewer Pipe - Gravity Flow						
1	4" per lft Brand	Alt \$4.10 Sanderson	Win \$3.75 Sanderson	No Bid	\$6.10 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$4.34 Westlake

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
2	6"	per lft Brand	\$9.18 Sanderson	\$8.41 Sanderson	No Bid	\$13.64 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$9.13 Westlake - Alt
3	8"	per lft Brand	\$16.58 Sanderson	\$15.22 Sanderson	No Bid	\$24.68 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$16.51 Westlake - Alt
4	10"	per lft Brand	\$25.86 Sanderson	\$23.69 Sanderson	No Bid	\$38.45 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$27.38 Westlake
5	12"	per lft Brand	\$37.19 Sanderson	\$34.08 Sanderson	No Bid	\$55.25 Westlake/ Diamond	No Bid	\$37.86 Westlake
PVC Sewer Pipe - Force Main			Alt	Win				
1	4"	per lft Brand	\$ 7.55 Sanderson	\$ 6.91 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.14 Westlake
2	6"	per lft Brand	\$ 15.44 Sanderson	\$ 14.15 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.62 Westlake
3	8"	per lft Brand	\$ 26.46 Sanderson	\$ 24.24 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.77 Westlake
4	10"	per lft Brand	\$ 39.71 Sanderson	\$ 36.37 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$42.80 Westlake
5	12"	per lft Brand	\$ 55.91 Sanderson	\$ 51.20 Sanderson	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.94 Westlake
IV. PVC Sewer Fittings SDR35 Glue type								
1	4" sleeve	ea Brand	\$4.66 Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	\$4.94 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$3.77 Westlake
2	6" sleeve	ea Brand	\$17.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	\$17.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$13.75 Westlake
3	8" sleeve	ea Brand	\$39.68 Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	\$44.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$42.83 Westlake
4	4" with a 1/16" bend 22.5°	ea Brand	\$7.76 Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	\$3.99 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$6.37 Westlake

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
5	6" with a 1/16" bend 22.5°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$33.82	No bid	No bid	\$17.45 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$27.35 Westlake
6	8" with a 1/16" bend 22.5°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$65.52	No bid	No bid	\$46.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$70.72 Westlake
7	4" with a 1/8" bend 45°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$7.04	No bid	No bid	\$3.65 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$5.98 Westlake
8	6" with a 1/8" bend 45°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$27.72	No bid	No bid	\$14.53 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$22.45 Westlake
9	8" with a 1/8" bend 45°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$56.63	No bid	No bid	\$39.90 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$61.15 Westlake
10	4" with a 1/4" bend 90°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$9.66	No bid	No bid	\$5.05 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$6.60 Westlake
11	6" with a 1/4" bend 90°	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$34.88	No bid	No bid	\$24.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$20.80 Westlake
12	4" bell cap	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$4.08	No bid	No bid	\$2.10 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$3.35 Westlake
13	6" bell cap	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$14.90	No bid	No bid	\$7.73 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$12.05 Westlake
14	8"x 6" saddle "PVC" WYE	ea Brand No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$48.00 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$57.60 Westlake
15	6"x 4" reducers	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$22.60	No bid	No bid	\$11.73 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$18.31 Westlake
16	8"x 6" reducers	ea Brand Multi Fittings \$71.67	No bid	No bid	\$49.58 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$77.40 Westlake
17	4" clean out w/o plug SW-MPT	ea Brand no bid	No bid	No bid	\$3.90 Multi Fittings	No bid	\$7.75 Westlake

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
18	4" clean out plug MPT	ea	\$5.64			\$3.00	No bid	\$4.67
		Brand	Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	Multi Fittings		Westlake
19	4" clean out w/ plug	ea	No Bid			\$6.90	No bid	\$18.90
		Brand		No bid	No Bid	Multi Fittings		Westlake
20	6" clean out w/o plug SW-MPT	ea	No Bid			\$24.00	No bid	\$35.35
		Brand		No bid	No bid	Multi Fittings		Westlake
21	6" clean out plug MPT	ea	\$28.26			\$15.00	No bid	\$22.85
		Brand	Multi Fittings			Multi Fittings		Westlake
22	6" clean out w/ plug	ea	No Bid	No bid	No bid	\$39.00	No bid	\$65.35
		Brand				Multi Fittings		Westlake
23	6" WYE (Inline)	ea	\$40.83	No bid	No bid	\$28.25	No bid	\$44.10
		Brand	Multi Fittings			Multi Fittings		Westlake
24	4" WYE (Inline) SW, PVC	ea	\$12.84			\$6.70	No bid	\$44.10
		Brand	Multi Fittings	No bid	No bid	Multi Fittings		Westlake
v.	Ductile Iron Pressure Main							
	Ductile Iron Pipe							
1	4" Mechanical Joint	per lft	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No Bid
		Brand						
	4" Slip Joint	per lft	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
		Brand						
2	6" Mechanical Joint	per lft	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
		Brand						
	6" Slip Joint	per lft	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
		Brand						
3	8" Mechanical Joint	per lft	No Bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
		Brand						
	8" Slip Joint	per lft	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Brand						

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
4	10" Mechanical Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	10" Slip Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	12" Mechanical Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	12" Slip Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	16" Mechanical Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	16" Slip Joint	per lft Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
VI.	Ductile Iron Fittings - ANSI / AWWA C153 / A21.53-84 Tees							
1	4 x 4" MJ	ea Brand	\$83.82 SIP	No Bid	\$83.00 Tyler Union	\$85.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$95.15 Sigma	\$89.55 Sigma
2	6 x 4" MJ	ea Brand	\$139.40 SIP	No Bid	\$141.00 Tyler Union	\$140.80 Tyler /Sigma	\$158.40 Sigma	\$149.00 Sigma
3	6 x 6" MJ	ea Brand	\$150.04 SIP	No Bid	\$152.00 Tyler Union	\$151.56 Tyler /Sigma	\$170.50 Sigma	\$160.40 Sigma
4	8 x 4" MJ	ea Brand	\$162.14 SIP	No Bid	\$164.00 Tyler Union	\$164.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$184.25 Sigma	\$173.35 Sigma
5	8 x 6" MJ	ea Brand	\$185.86 SIP	No Bid	\$188.00 Tyler Union	\$188.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$211.20 Sigma	\$198.65 Sigma
6	8 x 8" MJ	ea Brand	\$224.91 SIP	No Bid	\$227.00 Tyler Union	\$229.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$255.20 Sigma	\$240.20 Sigma
7	12 x 4" MJ	ea Brand	\$303.47 SIP	No Bid	\$307.00 Tyler Union	\$308.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$344.85 Sigma	\$313.50 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
8	12 x 6" MJ ea Brand	\$303.47 SIP	No Bid	\$308.00 Tyler Union	\$310.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$344.85 Sigma	\$313.50 Sigma
9	12 x 8" MJ ea Brand	\$348.97 SIP	No Bid	\$353.00 Tyler Union	\$356.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$396.55 Sigma	\$360.50 Sigma
10	12 x 12" MJ ea Brand	\$447.22 SIP	No Bid	\$452.00 Tyler Union	\$452.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$496.00 Sigma	\$462.00 Sigma
Elbows - 22.5° Degree bends							
11	4" MJ ea Brand	Win \$50.34 SIP	No Bid	Alt \$51.00 Tyler Union	\$51.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$57.20 Sigma	\$53.85 Sigma
12	6" MJ ea Brand	\$76.96 SIP	No Bid	\$78.00 Tyler Union	\$78.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$87.45 Sigma	\$82.30 Sigma
13	8" MJ ea Brand	\$120.52 SIP	No Bid	\$122.00 Tyler Union	\$123.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$136.95 Sigma	\$128.90 Sigma
14	12" MJ ea Brand	\$232.81 SIP	No Bid	\$235.00 Tyler Union	\$236.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$258.20 Sigma	\$249.00 Sigma
Elbows - 45 Degree bends							
15	4" MJ ea Brand	Win \$53.24 SIP	No Bid	Alt \$54.00 Tyler Union	\$54.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$60.50 Sigma	\$56.95 Sigma
16	6" MJ ea Brand	\$84.70 SIP	No Bid	\$86.00 Tyler Union	\$86.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$96.25 Sigma	\$90.60 Sigma
17	8" MJ ea Brand	\$123.42 SIP	No Bid	\$125.00 Tyler Union	\$126.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$140.20 Sigma	\$132.00 Sigma
18	12" MJ ea Brand	\$266.20 SIP	No Bid	\$269.00 Tyler Union	\$269.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$295.24 Sigma	\$284.70 Sigma
Elbows - 90 Degree bends							
19	4" MJ ea Brand	Win \$64.68 SIP	No Bid	Alt \$65.00 Tyler Union	\$65.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$72.60 Sigma	\$68.30 Sigma
20	6" MJ ea Brand	\$104.55 SIP	No Bid	\$106.00 Tyler Union	\$106.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$118.80 Sigma	\$118.80 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
21	8" MJ ea Brand	\$151.00 SIP	No Bid	\$153.00 Tyler Union	\$154.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$167.48 Sigma	\$161.50 Sigma
22	12" MJ ea Brand	\$321.86 SIP	No Bid	\$325.00 Tyler Union	\$328.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$351.12 Sigma	\$344.25 Sigma
Crosses		Win		Alt			
23	4 x 4" MJ ea Brand	\$178.12 SIP	No Bid	\$180.00 Tyler Union	\$181.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$202.40 Sigma	\$184.00 Sigma
24	6 x 4" MJ ea Brand	\$195.06 SIP	No Bid	\$197.00 Tyler Union	\$199.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$230.52 Sigma	\$201.50 Sigma
25	6 x 6" MJ ea Brand	\$218.29 SIP	No Bid	\$220.00 Tyler Union	\$222.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$248.05 Sigma	\$225.50 Sigma
26	8 x 6" MJ ea Brand	\$226.53 SIP	No Bid	\$229.00 Tyler Union	\$230.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$257.40 Sigma	\$234.00 Sigma
27	8 x 8" MJ ea Brand	\$238.13 SIP	No Bid	\$241.00 Tyler Union	\$243.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$270.60 Sigma	\$246.00 Sigma
Reducers - Spigot Both Ends		Win		Alt			
28	6 x 4" ea Brand	\$73.57 SIP	No Bid	\$75.00 Tyler Union	\$75.00 Tyler /Sigma	No Bid	\$78.70 Sigma
29	8 x 4" ea Brand	\$109.39 SIP	No Bid	\$111.00 Tyler Union	\$111.00 Tyler /Sigma	No Bid	\$117.00 Sigma
30	8 x 6" ea Brand	\$115.20 SIP	No Bid	\$117.00 Tyler Union	\$117.00 Tyler /Sigma	No Bid	\$123.20 Sigma
31	12 x 6" ea Brand	\$190.70 SIP	No Bid	\$193.00 Tyler Union	\$194.00 Tyler /Sigma	No Bid	\$203.95 Sigma
32	12 x 8" ea Brand	\$196.02 SIP	No Bid	\$198.00 Tyler Union	\$199.00 Tyler /Sigma	No Bid	\$209.64 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
Reducers - Spigot to MJ		Win					Alt
33	6 x 4" ea Brand	\$62.92 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.50 Sigma	\$67.29 Sigma
34	8 x 4" ea Brand	\$105.03 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$119.35 Sigma	\$112.32 Sigma
35	8 x 6" ea Brand	\$95.39 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$108.30 Sigma	\$101.95 Sigma
36	12 x 6" ea Brand	\$209.09 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$237.60 Sigma	\$223.60 Sigma
37	12 x 8" ea Brand	\$164.08 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$186.45 Sigma	\$175.50 Sigma
Reducers - MJ Both Ends		Win		Alt			
38	6 x 4" ea Brand	\$60.99 SIP	No Bid	\$62.00 Tyler Union	\$62.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$69.30 Sigma	\$65.25 Sigma
39	8 x 4" ea Brand	\$82.76 SIP	No Bid	\$84.00 Tyler Union	\$84.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$94.50 Sigma	\$88.50 Sigma
40	8 x 6" ea Brand	\$88.57 SIP	No Bid	\$90.00 Tyler Union	\$90.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$100.65 Sigma	\$94.75 Sigma
41	12 x 6" ea Brand	\$149.56 SIP	No Bid	\$151.00 Tyler Union	\$152.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$169.95 Sigma	\$159.95 Sigma
42	12 x 8" ea Brand	\$152.46 SIP	No Bid	\$154.00 Tyler Union	\$155.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$173.25 Sigma	\$163.05 Sigma
43	12 x 10" ea Brand	\$169.40 SIP	No Bid	\$171.00 Tyler Union	\$173.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$187.88 Sigma	\$181.20 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
Sleeves - Solid (12" length)		Win		Alt			
44	4" MJ ea Brand	\$56.63 SIP	No Bid	\$57.00 Tyler Union	\$58.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$64.35 Sigma	\$61.50 Sigma
45	6" MJ ea Brand	\$94.87 SIP	No Bid	\$96.00 Tyler Union	\$96.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$107.80 Sigma	\$101.45 Sigma
46	8" MJ ea Brand	\$152.46 SIP	No Bid	\$154.00 Tyler Union	\$155.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$173.25 Sigma	\$163.05 Sigma
47	12" MJ ea Brand	\$245.39 SIP	No Bid	\$248.00 Tyler Union	\$250.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$278.85 Sigma	\$262.45 Sigma
48	16" MJ ea Brand	\$469.00 SIP	No Bid	\$474.00 Tyler Union	\$478.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$520.15 Sigma	\$485.50 Sigma
Blank Plug with 2" Tap (Pipe threads)		Win		Alt			
49	4" MJ ea Brand	\$55.18 SIP	No Bid	\$56.00 Tyler Union	\$56.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$62.70 Sigma	\$60.20 Sigma
50	6" MJ ea Brand	\$80.83 SIP	No Bid	\$82.00 Tyler Union	\$82.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$91.85 Sigma	\$86.45 Sigma
51	8" MJ ea Brand	\$107.94 SIP	No Bid	\$109.00 Tyler Union	\$110.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$122.65 Sigma	\$115.45 Sigma
52	12" MJ ea Brand	\$166.50 SIP	No Bid	\$169.00 Tyler Union	\$169.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$189.20 Sigma	\$178.10 Sigma
VII. Retaining Glands (mega-lug design) - Retainers				Tuff grip Win			
1	4" MJ ea Brand	\$45.19 SIP	No Bid	\$35.00 Tyler Union	\$69.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$41.70 Ford	\$45.74 Sigma
2	6" MJ ea Brand	\$56.58 SIP	No Bid	\$39.00 Tyler Union	\$96.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$53.28 Ford	\$54.15 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
3	8" MJ	ea Brand	\$76.32 SIP	No Bid	\$58.00 Tyler Union	\$114.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$71.89 Ford	\$70.16 Sigma
4	12" MJ	ea Brand	\$132.88 SIP	No Bid	\$112.00 Tyler Union	\$190.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$122.85 Ford	\$135.27 Sigma
5	16" MJ	ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$248.00 Tyler Union	\$365.00 Tyler /Sigma	\$253.09 Ford	\$242.70 Sigma
VIII.	Bolts and Gaskets							
	Bolts							
1	MJ Lock Bolts "Anti Rotation"	Brand p/100	Win SIP \$400.00	No Bid	Tyler Union \$650.00	Tyler \$2,900.00	Win No Bid	Alt Sigma \$450.00
2	Bolt (3/4" X 3 1/3") MJ	Brand p/100	SIP \$400.00	No Bid	Tyler Union \$698.00	Tyler \$900.00	Sigma \$252.27	Sigma \$270.00
3	Bolt (3/4" X 4") MJ	Brand p/100	SIP \$400.00	No Bid	Tyler Union \$750.00	Tyler \$900.00	Sigma \$252.27	Sigma \$270.00
	Gaskets							
4	4" MJ	Per 50 Brand	Win \$290.40 SIP	No Bid	\$343.50 Tyler Union	\$297.50 Proselect/Tyler	\$330.00 Sigma	\$377.50 Sigma
	4" Transition	Per 50 Brand	\$314.60 SIP	No Bid	\$550.00 Tyler Union	\$525.00 Proselect/Tyler	\$357.50 Sigma	Alt \$407.50 Sigma
5	6" MJ	Per 50 Brand	\$290.40 SIP	No Bid	\$350.00 Tyler Union	Alt \$297.50 Proselect/Tyler	\$330.00 Sigma	\$377.50 Sigma
	6" Transition	Per 50 Brand	\$338.80 SIP	No Bid	\$600.00 Tyler Union	\$562.50 Proselect/Tyler	Alt \$385.00 Sigma	\$440.00 Sigma
6	8" MJ	Per 50 Brand	\$314.60 SIP	No Bid	\$400.00 Tyler Union	Alt \$320.00 Proselect/Tyler	\$357.50 Sigma	\$407.50 Sigma

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
7	8" Transition	Per 50 Brand \$484.00 SIP	No Bid	\$800.00 Tyler Union	\$800.00 Proselect/Tyler	Alt \$550.00 Sigma	\$627.50 Sigma
	12" MJ	Per 50 Brand \$484.00 SIP	No Bid	\$500.00 Tyler Union	Alt \$497.50 Proselect/Tyler	\$550.00 Sigma	\$627.50 Sigma
	12" Transition	Per 50 Brand Alt \$605.00 SIP	No Bid	\$1,000.00 Tyler Union	\$1,012.50 Proselect/Tyler	\$687.50 Sigma	Win \$647.50 Sigma
8	16" MJ	Per 50 Brand Win \$822.80 SIP	No Bid	\$850.00 Tyler Union	\$847.50 Proselect/Tyler	\$935.00 Sigma	\$1,067.50 Sigma
	16" Transition	Per 50 Brand No Bid	No Bid	\$2,400.00 Sigma	No Bid	\$2,339.40 Sigma	\$2,437.50 Sigma
VIX.	Gate Valves 3" thru 16" - For Water and other liquids						
	Gate Valve - MJ						
1	3" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow \$ 552.82	M&H - Alt \$529.01	No Bid	Mueller \$595.00	\$ 502.60 M&H - Win	\$ 552.56 M&H
2	4" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow \$ 617.76	M&H - Alt \$581.60	No Bid	Mueller \$673.00	\$ 561.65 M&H - Win	\$ 611.60 M&H
3	6" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow \$ 788.31	M&H - Alt \$754.35	No Bid	Mueller \$858.00	\$ 716.69 M&H - Win	\$ 791.64 M&H
4	8" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow-Alt \$ 1,255.59	M&H - Alt \$1,189.00	No Bid	Mueller \$1,360.00	\$ 1,141.49 M&H - Win	\$ 1,266.44 M&H
5	10" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow -Alt \$ 1,957.83	M&H \$1,873.52	No Bid	Mueller \$2,130.00	\$ 1,779.89 M&H - Win	\$ 1,979.84 M&H
6	12" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea Clow \$ 2,477.38	M&H - Alt \$2,370.70	No Bid	Mueller \$2,695.00	\$ 2,252.20 M&H - Win	\$ 2,502.16 M&H

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
7	16" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Clow-Alt \$ 8,304.39	No Bid	No Bid	Mueller - Win \$6,985.00	No Bid	\$ 8,388.44 M&H
TAPPING Gate Valve - MJ to FL								
8	4" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Alt Clow \$589.78	Win M&H \$564.38	No Bid	Mueller \$848.00	M&H \$708.50	M&H \$815.25
9	6" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Clow \$788.31	M&H \$754.35	No Bid	Mueller \$1,195.00	M&H \$1,000.85	M&H \$1,130.00
10	8" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Clow \$1,231.83	M&H \$1,178.78	No Bid	Mueller \$1,780.00	M&H \$1,485.65	M&H \$1,676.30
11	10" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Clow \$1,957.83	M&H \$1,873.52	No Bid	Mueller \$2,680.00	M&H \$2,240.20	M&H \$2,308.10
12	12" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Clow \$ 2,363.86	M&H \$ 2,262.06	No Bid	Mueller \$ 4,050.00	M&H \$ 3,384.05	M&H \$ 3,835.75
13	16" Mueller or M&H	Brand ea	Alt Clow \$ 8,304.39	No Bid	No Bid	Win Mueller \$ 8,050.00	No Bid	M&H \$ 10,175.60
Tapping Sleeves								
14	4 x 4" JCM 412 or equal "C900"	ea Brand	Win \$297.00 JCM	\$300.05 JCM	Alt \$300.00 JCM	\$374.00 Powerseal	No Bid	\$317.65 JCM
	4 x 4" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$297.00 JCM	\$317.65 JCM	\$300.00 JCM	\$374.00 Powerseal	No Bid	\$317.65 JCM
15	6 x 4" JCM 412 or equal "C900"	ea Brand	\$316.80 JCM	\$320.01 JCM	\$320.00 JCM	\$452.00 Powerseal	No Bid	\$338.80 JCM
	6 x 4" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$306.90 JCM	\$328.24 JCM	\$320.00 JCM	\$452.00 Powerseal	No Bid	\$338.80 JCM

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply	
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am	
16	6 x 6" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$354.20 JCM	Alt \$357.78 JCM	\$358.00 JCM	\$510.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$378.80 JCM
	6 x 6" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$345.40 JCM	\$369.41 JCM	Alt \$358.00 JCM	\$510.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$378.80 JCM
17	8 x 4" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$344.30 JCM	Alt \$347.78 JCM	\$348.00 JCM	\$366.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$368.20 JCM
	8 x 4" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$321.20 JCM	\$343.53 JCM	\$348.00 JCM	\$366.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$368.20 JCM
18	8 x 6" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$364.10 JCM	\$367.78 JCM	\$368.00 JCM	\$405.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$380.00 JCM
	8 x 6" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$355.30 JCM	\$380.00 JCM	Alt \$368.00 JCM	\$405.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$380.00 JCM
19	8 x 8" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$462.00 JCM	Alt \$466.67 JCM	\$467.00 JCM	\$512.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$477.25 JCM
	8 x 8" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$448.80 JCM	\$480.00 JCM	Alt \$467.00 JCM	\$512.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$477.25 JCM
20	10 x 4" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$359.70 JCM	Alt \$363.35 JCM	\$364.00 JCM	\$374.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$384.70 JCM
	10 x 4" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$327.80 JCM	\$350.59 JCM	\$364.00 JCM	\$374.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$384.70 JCM
21	10 x 6" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$383.90 JCM	\$387.77 JCM	\$388.00 JCM	\$432.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$410.60 JCM
	10 x 6" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$357.50 JCM	\$382.35 JCM	\$388.00 JCM	\$432.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$410.60 JCM

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply	
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am	
22	10 x 8" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$478.50 JCM	\$483.34 JCM	Alt \$483.00 JCM	\$560.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$511.75 JCM
	10 x 8" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$452.10 JCM	\$483.53 JCM	\$483.00 JCM	\$560.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$511.75 JCM
23	12 x 4" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$367.40 JCM	\$371.15 JCM	\$371.00 JCM	\$428.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$392.95 JCM
	12 x 4" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$345.40 JCM	Alt \$369.41 JCM	\$371.00 JCM	\$428.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$392.95 JCM
24	12 x 6" JCM 412 or equal	ea Brand	\$400.40 JCM	\$404.45 JCM	Alt \$404.00 JCM	\$530.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$428.20 JCM
	12 x 6" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$376.20 JCM	ALT \$402.36 JCM	\$404.00 JCM	\$530.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$428.20 JCM
25	12 x 8" JCM 412 or equal "C900"	ea Brand	\$509.30 JCM	\$544.71 JCM	ALT \$514.00 JCM	\$675.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$544.70 JCM
	12 x 8" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$480.70 JCM	\$514.12 JCM	\$514.00 JCM	\$675.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$544.70 JCM
26	16x6" JCM 412 or equal "C900"	ea Brand	\$446.60 JCM	\$477.65 JCM	\$451.00 JCM	\$598.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$477.65 JCM
	16 x 6" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$424.60 JCM	\$454.12 JCM	\$451.00 JCM	\$598.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$477.65 JCM
27	16x8" JCM 412 or equal "C900"	ea Brand	\$553.30 JCM	\$591.77 JCM	\$559.00 JCM	\$763.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$591.75 JCM
	16 x 8" "CLASS 160"	ea Brand	\$542.30 JCM	\$580.00 JCM	\$559.00 JCM	\$763.00 Powerseal	No Bid JCM	\$591.75 JCM

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
X.	Brass Water Service Fittings AWWA C-800 Dual check w/Meter Nipple (Built In)						
1	3/4" ea Brand	\$70.33 AY	Win \$26.33 Ford	Alt \$65.30 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	1" ea Brand	\$131.16 AY	\$36.35 Ford	\$122.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	1 1/2" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	2" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Dual Check w/o Meter Nipple						
1	3/4" ea Brand	\$63.93 AY	Alt \$61.94 Ford	Win \$60.00 Ay	\$66.00 Mueller	No Bid	No Bid
	1" ea Brand	\$123.13 AY	Win \$67.31 Ford	\$115.00 Matco	Alt \$91.00 Mueller	No Bid	No Bid
3	1 1/2" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$274.00 Mueller	No Bid	No Bid
4	2" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$297.00 Mueller	No Bid	No Bid
	Bronze gate valves (3/4" - 2 1/2" diameter)						
1	3/4" diameter bronze gate valve ea Brand	Alt \$10.71 Matco	No Bid	Win \$9.60 AY	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.73 Matco
2	1" diameter bronze gate valve ea Brand	\$15.93 Matco	No Bid	\$13.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.05 Matco
3	1 1/4" diameter bronze gate valve ea Brand	\$22.85 Matco	No Bid	\$18.25 AY	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.77 Matco

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
4	1 ½" diameter bronze gate valve	ea	\$27.35	No Bid	\$23.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.25
	Brand		Matco		AY			Matco
5	2" diameter bronze gate valve "full port"	ea	\$38.43	No Bid	\$36.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.10
	Brand		Matco		Matco			Matco
					AY			
6	2 ½" diameter bronze gate valve	ea	\$75.47	No Bid	\$72.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.70
	Brand		Matco		AY			Matco
Cut off valves - With Lock Wing Only (MUELLER - FORD - A.Y.MCDONALD)								
1	Ball Valve 5/8", 3/4" (CTS) -3/4" FPY	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.39	No Bid
	Brand						Ford	
2	Ball Valve 5/8" 3/4" CTS-3/4" MSN	ea	\$48.86	\$43.78	\$45.50	\$51.00	\$43.30	No Bid
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	
3	Ball Valve ¾" (CTS) "Pack Joint	ea	\$46.71	\$42.30	\$43.33	\$69.00	\$41.40	\$48.25
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
4	Ball Valve 3/4" (MPT) "Pack Joint"	ea	No Bid	\$48.40	No Bid	\$65.00	\$61.74	\$71.95
	Brand			Ford		Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
5	Ball Valve 3/4" (FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$36.56	\$39.21	\$40.69	\$54.70	\$32.43	\$37.80
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
6	Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-MPT)"Packed Joint"	ea	\$75.57	\$82.36	\$76.00	\$70.75	\$47.39	\$55.25
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
7	Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-FPT)"Packed Joint"	ea	\$43.25	\$66.04	\$40.20	\$61.70	\$57.95	\$67.50
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
8	Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$93.57	\$47.96	\$79.00	\$82.60	\$77.64	\$54.70
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
9	Ball Valve 3/4" (CTS-MSN) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$74.78	\$81.45	\$69.37	\$76.30	No Bid	\$50.50
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford		Ford
10	Ball Valve 3/4" (PVC-MSN) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$52.64	\$88.82	\$155.00	\$76.30	\$71.70	\$56.30
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford	Ford	Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
11	Ball Valve 1" (CTS) "Pack Joint"	ea	\$93.57	No Bid	\$87.00	\$103.00	\$83.00	\$96.70
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
12	Ball Valve 1" (MPT) "Pack Joint"	ea	\$103.24	No Bid	\$98.00	No Bid	\$72.75	\$84.75
		Brand	AY		AY		Ford	Ford
13	Ball Valve 1" (FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$64.57	No Bid	\$66.00	\$83.00	\$57.25	\$66.70
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
14	Ball Valve 1" (CTS-MPT) "Pack Joint"	ea	\$103.31	No Bid	\$103.00	\$97.00	\$80.67	\$94.00
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
15	Ball Valve 1" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$77.17	No Bid	\$73.00	\$93.00	\$68.41	\$79.70
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
16	Ball Valve 1" (CTS-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$141.32	\$121.36	No Bid	\$123.00	\$116.40	\$135.65
		Brand	AY	Ford		Ford	Ford	Ford
17	Ball Valve 1" (CTS-MSN) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$89.90	No Bid	\$85.00	\$104.00	\$79.80	\$92.95
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
18	Ball Valve 1" (PVC-MSN) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$120.49	No Bid	\$112.00	No Bid	\$85.20	\$124.70
		Brand	AY		AY		Ford	Ford
19	Ball Valve 3/4" x 1" (MSN-CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$63.02	No Bid	\$58.45	\$104.00	\$71.68	\$83.53
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
20	Ball Valve 3/4" X 1" (FPT-CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$72.99	No Bid	\$67.70	\$93.00	\$64.70	\$75.35
		Brand	AY		AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
21	Ball Valve 2" (CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$365.63	\$356.76	\$339.00	\$345.00	\$324.29	\$336.10
		Brand	AY	Ford	AY	Ford	Ford	Ford
22	Ball Valve 2" (MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$321.56	\$313.73	\$298.00	No Bid	\$285.19	\$332.15
		Brand	AY	Ford	AY		Ford	Ford
23	Ball Valve 2" (FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$262.24	\$255.78	\$243.00	\$246.00	\$232.43	\$231.80
		Brand	AY	Ford	AY	Ford	Ford	Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
24	Ball Valve 2" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$318.67 AY	\$294.50 Ford	\$295.00 AY	No Bid	\$282.58 Ford	\$329.15 Ford
25	Ball Valve 2" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$295.75 AY	\$273.29 Ford	\$274.00 AY	\$277.00 Ford	\$243.60 Ford	\$283.80 Ford
26	Ball Valve 3/4", 1" CTS-3/4" MSN "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$80.82 AY	\$73.96 Ford	\$75.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	Ball Valve 5/8" (PVC-MSN) " Packed Joint"	ea brand	No Bid	\$50.36 Ford	\$79.00 AY	\$51.00 Ford	\$48.30 Ford	No Bid
28	Ball Valve 1-1/2" (CTS-FPT)"Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$213.40 AY	No Bid	\$198.00 AY	\$259.00 Ford	No Bid	No Bid
Joint Connections [Mueller / Ford / A.Y. McDonald]								
1	Coupling 3/4" (CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$19.79 AY	\$17.93 Ford	\$18.35 AY	\$18.85 Ford/Mueller	\$17.51 Ford	\$20.45 Ford
2	Coupling 3/4" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$16.26 AY	\$14.72 Ford	\$15.00 AY	\$15.45 Ford / Mueller	\$14.39 Ford	\$16.80 Ford
3	Coupling 3/4" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$17.10 AY	\$15.48 Ford	\$15.85 AY	\$16.30 Ford / Mueller	\$15.14 Ford	\$17.65 Ford
4	Coupling 3/4" (CTS-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$26.75 AY	\$24.25 Ford	\$24.80 AY	\$25.20 Ford / Mueller	\$23.71 Ford	\$27.65 Ford
5	Coupling 3/4" (MPT-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$21.55 AY	\$19.91 Ford	\$19.98 AY	\$20.45 Ford / Mueller	\$19.07 Ford	\$22.25 Ford
6	Coupling 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$22.65 AY	\$20.52 Ford	\$21.00 AY	\$21.50 Ford / Mueller	\$20.06 Ford	\$23.40 Ford
7	Coupling 1" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$19.26 AY	\$17.45 Ford	\$17.86 AY	\$18.20 Ford / Mueller	\$17.04 Ford	\$19.90 Ford
8	Coupling 1" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea Brand	\$23.19 AY	\$21.02 Ford	\$21.50 AY	\$22.00 Ford / Mueller	\$20.55 Ford	\$24.00 Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
9	Coupling 1" (CTS-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$38.67	\$35.05	\$35.85	\$36.50	\$34.28	\$40.00
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
10	Coupling 1" (MPT-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$33.59	\$31.08	\$31.15	\$32.00	\$29.78	\$34.75
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
11	Coupling 1" SW "Packed Joint"	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand							
12	Coupling 1-1/2" (CTS--MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$52.74	\$63.38	\$48.90	\$76.97	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller		
13	Coupling 3/4" x 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$23.01	\$22.45	\$21.33	\$21.75	\$20.38	\$23.80
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
14	Coupling 3/4" x 1" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$17.76	\$16.31	\$16.45	\$25.91	No Bid	\$18.35
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller		Ford
15	Coupling 3/4" x 1" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$20.37	\$18.25	\$18.88	\$29.70	No Bid	\$21.00
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller		Ford
16	Coupling 3/4" x 1" (CTS-PVC) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$37.46	\$34.63	\$34.74	\$35.60	\$33.20	\$38.70
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
17	Coupling 2" (MPT-PVC)"Packed Joint"	ea	\$95.99	\$108.99	\$89.00	\$130.79	No Bid	\$99.25
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller		Ford
18	Coupling 2" (CTS) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$102.32	\$92.66	\$94.90	\$97.50	\$90.74	\$105.75
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
19	Coupling 2" (CTS-MPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$76.85	\$69.59	\$71.28	\$73.00	\$68.15	\$79.40
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
20	Coupling 2" (CTS-FPT) "Packed Joint"	ea	\$80.32	\$72.75	\$74.50	\$76.00	\$71.25	\$83.00
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford
21	Coupling 2" (Meter FL-MPT) w/Gaskets	ea	\$67.72	\$60.18	\$62.80	\$64.25	\$65.37	\$70.00
	Brand		AY	Ford	AY	Ford / Mueller	Ford	Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
22	Coupling 2" (Meter FL-FPT) w/Gaskets ea Brand	\$61.37 AY	\$60.00 Ford	\$56.90 AY	\$58.30 Ford / Mueller	\$59.66 Ford	\$63.40 Ford
Miscellaneous Brass Fitting - Mueller/Ford/A.Y. McDonald							
1	Corporation 3/4"cc (MPT-CTS) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	\$35.47 AY	\$32.11 Ford	\$32.85 AY	\$33.60 Ford / Mueller	\$31.40 Ford	\$36.65 Ford
2	Corporation 1"cc (MPT-CTS) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	\$53.64 AY	\$48.57 Ford	\$49.75 AY	\$51.00 Ford / Mueller	\$47.55 Ford	\$55.45 Ford
3	WYE 1" X 3.4"(CTS) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	\$40.98 AY	\$37.11 Ford	\$38.00 AY	\$38.90 Ford / Mueller	\$36.30 Ford	\$42.35 Ford
4	TEE 3/4" (FPT) "Packed Jacket" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.40 Ford / Mueller	\$17.65 Ford	\$20.60 Ford
5	TEE 3/4" (CTS) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	\$47.93 AY	\$43.39 Ford	\$44.45 AY	\$45.40 Ford / Mueller	\$42.49 Ford	\$49.50 Ford
6	TEE 1" (FPT) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.75 Merit	\$25.15 Ford	\$29.35 Ford
7	TEE 1" (CTS) "Packed Joint" ea Brand	\$51.25 AY	\$46.45 Ford	\$47.50 AY	\$48.44 Ford/Mueller	\$45.46 Ford	\$53.00 Ford
8	Nipple 2" (All Thread / By Close) ea Brand	\$10.84 Matco	No Bid	\$12.00 AY	\$14.57 Merit	\$12.33 Ford	No Bid
9	Nipple 3/4" (All Thread / By Close) ea Brand	\$2.46 Matco	No Bid	\$2.62 AY	\$3.37 Merit	\$3.05 Ford	No Bid
10	Nipple 3/4" (3" Length) ea Brand	\$4.15 Matco	No Bid	\$4.50 AY	\$5.67 Merit	\$5.14 Ford	No Bid
11	Meter Nipple 3/4" X 2 1/2" - long ea Brand	\$5.47 Matco	No Bid	\$7.25 AY	no bid	No Bid	\$11.60 Ford
12	Meter Nipple 3/4"X 1 5/8" - short ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.10 Merit	No Bid	\$11.60 Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
13	Meter Nipple 1" Long ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Meter Riser 3/4" -12" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$96.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Meter Riser 3/4" - 7" ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$92.00 AY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	BIBB, 3/4" Threaded ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.60 AY	\$13.00 Legend	No Bid	No Bid
17	BIBB, 3/4" Smooth ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.00 AY	\$11.00 Legend	No Bid	No Bid
General Galvanized Fittings							
18	Dresser Coupling 3/4" (compression) Smith Blair 522 ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.00 JCM	\$13.18 Proflo	\$10.85 Smith Blair	No Bid
19	Dresser Coupling 1" (compression) Smith Blair 522 ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00 JCM	\$16.33 Proflo	\$12.25 Smith Blair	No Bid
20	Dress Coupling 1-1/4" (compression) Smith Blair 522 ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	\$20.10 Proflo	\$15.95 Smith Blair	No Bid
21	Dress Coupling 1-1/2" (compression) Smith Blair 522 ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.75 Proflo	\$18.05 Smith Blair	No Bid
22	Dress Coupling 2" (compression) Smith Blair 522 ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.00 JCM	\$35.67 Proflo	\$22.38 Smith Blair	No Bid
23	1-1/4" 90 degree ea Brand	\$4.11 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.00 Proflo	No Bid	\$4.95 Matco
24	1-1/2" x 6" nipple ea Brand	\$4.56 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.43 Proflo	No Bid	\$5.70 Matco
25	1-1/2" x 3/4" bushing, MPT-FPT ea Brand	\$5.16 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.93 Proflo	No Bid	\$6.70 Matco

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
26	2" elbow, 45 degree, FPT x FPT ea Brand	\$9.58 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.58 Proflo	No Bid	\$11.60 Matco
27	2" tee, FPT - FPT – FPT ea Brand	\$12.97 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$41.22 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$15.80 Matco
28	2" cap, FPT ea Brand	\$4.59 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.15 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$6.00 Matco
29	2" x 12" nipple ea Brand	\$13.84 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.82 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$16.60 Matco
30	2" x 3/4" bushing, MPT x FPT ea Brand	\$5.99 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.97 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$6.85 Matco
31	2" x 1" bushing, MPT x FPT ea Brand	\$5.67 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.95 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$6.85 Matco
32	1" coupling, FPT – FPT ea Brand	\$3.17 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.68 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$4.15 Matco
33	1" x 6" nipple ea Brand	\$3.01 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.22 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$3.90 Matco
34	1-1/4" x 3" nipple ea Brand	\$2.24 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.25 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$3.15 Matco
35	1-1/4" x 6" nipple ea Brand	\$3.82 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.15 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$4.95 Matco
36	1-1/4" x 3/4" bushing, MPT x FPT ea Brand	\$3.55 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.08 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$4.95 Matco
37	3/4" x 6" nipple ea Brand	\$2.29 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.62 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$3.20 Matco
38	3/4" coupling, FPT-FPT ea Brand	\$1.93 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.95 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$2.70 Matco
39	3/4" elbow, 45 degree, FPT-FPT ea Brand	\$2.57 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.15 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$3.70 Matco

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
40	1" elbow, 45 degree, FPT-FPT ea Brand	\$2.96 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.32 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$4.15 Matco
41	1" plug, MPT ea Brand	\$1.88 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.42 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$2.75 Matco
42	1" union ea Brand	\$7.99 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	No bid	No Bid	\$11.30 Matco
43	2" nipple ea Brand	\$3.12 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.57 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$4.85 Matco
44	2" x 6" nipple ea Brand	\$6.33 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.52 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$8.80 Matco
45	2" coupling, FPT-FPT ea Brand	\$7.26 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.28 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$9.60 Matco
46	2" elbow, 90 degree, FPT-FPT ea Brand	\$9.01 Matco	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.67 Merit Brass	No Bid	\$11.20 Matco
XI.	Rubber Couplings - Fernco, Mission or equal PVC to PVC						
1	4 x 4 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$4.86 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.75 Fernco	\$4.64 Fernco	\$5.50 Fernco
2	4 x 6 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$12.18 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00 Fernco	\$11.65 Fernco	\$13.57 Fernco
3	6 x 6 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$10.38 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.15 Fernco	\$9.92 Fernco	\$11.93 Fernco
4	6 x 8 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$19.28 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.90 Fernco	\$18.44 Fernco	\$21.72 Fernco
5	8 x 8 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$15.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.70 Fernco	\$15.27 Fernco	\$18.15 Fernco

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
6	10 x 10 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$23.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.50 Fernco	\$22.92 Fernco	\$27.20 Fernco
7	12 x 12 PVC to PVC ea Brand	\$27.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.25 Fernco	\$26.75 Fernco	\$31.75 Fernco
8	4" Saddle, WYE, Rubber ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.50 Fernco	No Bid	\$55.30 Fernco
PVC to Clay							
1	4 x 4 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$4.85 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.75 Fernco	\$4.65 Fernco	\$5.50 Fernco
2	4 x 6 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$12.18 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00 Fernco	\$11.65 Fernco	\$13.57 Fernco
3	6 x 6 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$10.38 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.15 Fernco	\$9.92 Fernco	\$11.93 Fernco
4	6 x 8 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$19.28 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.90 Fernco	\$18.44 Fernco	\$21.72 Fernco
5	8 x 8 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$15.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.70 Fernco	\$15.27 Fernco	\$18.15 Fernco
6	10 x 10 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$23.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.50 Fernco	\$22.92 Fernco	\$27.20 Fernco
7	12 x 12 PVC to clay ea Brand	\$27.96 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.25 Fernco	\$26.75 Fernco	\$31.75 Fernco
PVC to Concrete							
1	4 x 4 PVC to concrete ea Brand	\$5.23 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.10 Fernco	\$5.01 Fernco	\$5.95 Fernco
2	4 x 6 PVC to concrete ea Brand	\$12.18 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.00 Fernco	\$11.65 Fernco	\$13.57 Fernco
3	6 x 6 PVC to concrete ea Brand	\$11.48 Fernco	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.30 Fernco	\$10.97 Fernco	\$13.05 Fernco

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
4	6 x 8 PVC to concrete	ea	\$21.18	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.80	\$22.26	\$24.25
	Brand		Fernco			Fernco	Fernco	Fernco
5	8 x 8 PVC to concrete	ea	\$17.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.00	\$16.49	\$19.67
	Brand		Fernco			Fernco	Fernco	Fernco
XII.	Coupling - Hymax 2000 or equal							
1	4" w/overall range of 4.25" - 5.63, overall length 8.7" overall width 7.87" overall coupling middle ring 5.9" max gap between pipe 5.50" and weight 15 lb	ea P/N	\$218.99 860-54-0108-16	\$269.84	\$179.00 #42104460560031 Smith Blair	\$213.00 K86054010816	\$203.14 860-54-0108-16	\$240.00 860-54-0108-16
2	6" with overall range of 6.42"-7.68" overall length 10.8" , overall width 10.75" overall coupling middle ring 8.0", max gap between pipes 7.50" and weight 21 lb	ea P/N	\$290.03 860-54-163-16	\$347.80	\$274.00 #42106560760031 Smith Blair	\$282.00 K86054016316	\$269.05 860-54-0163-16	\$317.55 860-54-0163-16
3	8" w/overall range of 8.54" - 9.84 overall length 10.8", overall width 12.91" overall coupling middle ring 8.0", max gap btween pipes 7.50" and weight 26 lb	ea P/N	\$327.45 860-54-0272-16	\$394.45	\$304.00 #42108540985031 Smith Blair	\$319.00 K86054021716	\$303.78 860-54-0217-16	\$358.55 860-54-0217-16
4	10" with an overall range of 10.70" – 12.00" overall length 13.5", overall width 16.2" overall maximum gap between pipes 6.30" and weight 92 pounds	ea P/N	\$421.24 860-54-0272-16	\$536.11	No Bid	\$410.00 K86054027216	\$390.77 860-54-0272-16	\$461.25 860-54-0272-16
XIII	Repair clamps - 3" Long							
1	¾"	ea Brand	\$4.40 JCM	\$5.00 JCM	\$4.50 JCM	\$7.19 Ford	\$5.87 Smith Blair	\$7.90 Ford
2	1"	ea Brand	\$5.50 JCM	\$6.25 JCM	\$7.00 Smith Blair	\$7.64 Ford	\$6.42 Smith Blair	\$8.40 Ford
3	1 ¼"	ea Brand	\$5.50 JCM	\$6.25 JCM	\$6.00 JCM	\$8.10 Ford	\$6.60 Smith Blair	\$8.90 Ford
4	1 ½"	ea Brand	\$5.50 JCM	\$6.25 JCM	\$7.00 JCM	\$8.47 Ford	\$7.09 Smith Blair	\$9.30 Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
5	2" ea Brand	\$6.60 JCM	\$7.50 JCM	\$8.00 JCM	\$10.52 Ford	\$8.30 Smith Blair	\$11.60 Ford
6	2 1/2" ea Brand	\$8.80 JCM	\$10.00 JCM	\$9.00 JCM	\$12.11 Ford	\$9.71 Smith Blair	\$13.30 Ford
Repair clamps - 6" Long							
1	3/4" ea Brand	\$9.90 JCM	\$11.25 JCM	\$10.00 JCM	\$13.10 Ford	\$10.95 Smith Blair	\$14.40 Ford
2	1" ea Brand	\$9.90 JCM	\$11.25 JCM	\$13.00 JCM	\$13.64 Ford	\$11.68 Smith Blair	\$15.00 Ford
3	1 1/4" ea Brand	\$11.00 JCM	\$12.50 JCM	\$12.00 JCM	\$14.36 Ford	\$12.30 Smith Blair	\$15.80 Ford
4	1 1/2" ea Brand	\$12.10 JCM	\$13.75 JCM	\$13.00 JCM	\$14.50 Ford	\$13.35 Smith Blair	\$15.95 Ford
5	2" ea Brand	\$12.10 JCM	\$13.75 JCM	\$14.00 JCM	\$19.04 Ford	\$15.70 Smith Blair	\$20.95 Ford
6	2 1/2" ea Brand	\$17.60 JCM	\$20.00 JCM	\$18.00 JCM	\$19.96 Ford	\$19.38 Smith Blair	\$21.95 Ford
Full Circle Repair Clamps - JCM - 7 1/2"							
1	2" Range(s) Brand	\$48.40 JCM	\$55.00 JCM	\$49.00 JCM	\$47.50 Powerseal	\$47.55 Smith Blair	\$69.47 Ford
		\$48.40 JCM	\$55.00 JCM	\$50.00 JCM	\$47.00 Powerseal	\$57.37 Smith Blair	\$68.35 Ford
2	3" Range(s) Brand	No Bid	\$68.75 JCM	\$65.00 JCM / S/B	No Bid	\$58.83 Smith Blair	\$76.00 Ford
		\$60.50	\$68.75 JCM	\$62.00 JCM / S/B	\$52.50 Powerseal	\$59.00 Smith Blair	\$76.00 Ford
		\$60.50	\$71.25 JCM	\$63.00 JCM / S/B	\$52.50 Powerseal	\$60.44 Smith Blair	\$76.00 Ford
		No Bid	\$71.25 JCM	\$67.00 JCM / S/B	\$52.50 Powerseal	\$61.27 Smith Blair	\$72.40 Ford
3	4" Range(s) Brand	\$62.70 JCM	\$71.25 JCM	\$64.00 JCM / S/B	\$58.50 Powerseal	\$64.81 Smith Blair	\$72.40 Ford
		\$62.70	\$71.25 JCM	\$65.00 JCM / S/B	\$58.50 Powerseal	\$68.51 Smith Blair	\$83.30 Ford
		\$62.70	\$71.25 JCM	\$66.00 JCM / S/B	\$58.50 Powerseal	\$69.24 Smith Blair	\$83.30 Ford
		\$62.70	\$71.25 JCM	\$80.00 JCM / S/B	\$58.50 Powerseal	\$73.04 Smith Blair	\$83.30 Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply	
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am	
4	6" Range(s)	ea	\$74.80	\$85.00	\$76.00	\$69.00	\$73.50	\$86.30
		ea	\$74.80	\$85.00	\$76.00	\$69.00	\$75.80	\$86.30
		ea	\$74.80	\$85.00	\$77.00	\$69.00	\$75.80	\$96.25
		ea	\$74.80	\$85.00	\$78.00	\$69.00	\$76.93	\$96.25
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	Ford
5	8" Range(s)	ea	\$88.00	\$100.00	\$89.00	\$82.50	\$83.94	\$98.80
		ea	\$88.00	\$100.00	\$90.00	\$82.50	\$83.97	\$98.80
		ea	\$88.00	\$100.00	\$91.00	\$82.50	\$84.64	\$98.80
		ea	\$88.00	\$100.00	\$92.00	\$82.50	\$92.68	\$115.50
		ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$103.00	\$82.50	\$94.47	\$115.50
Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM / S/B	Powerseal	Smith Blair	Ford		
6	10" Range(s)	ea	\$115.50	\$131.25	\$117.00	\$100.25	\$107.71	\$123.05
		ea	\$115.50	\$131.25	\$117.00	\$100.25	\$100.85	\$123.05
		ea	\$115.50	\$131.25	\$117.00	\$100.25	\$103.02	\$123.05
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM / S/B	Powerseal	Smith Blair	Ford
7	12" Range(s)	ea	\$130.90	\$148.75	\$133.00	\$113.00	\$116.19	\$125.90
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	Ford
1	2" Range(s)	ea	\$41.80	\$47.50	\$58.00	\$73.00	\$93.77	\$47.00
		ea	\$44.00	\$50.00	\$60.00	\$73.00	\$94.83	\$50.00
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM
2	3" Range(s)	ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$59.00	\$88.00	\$95.75	No Bid
		ea	\$44.00	\$50.00	\$60.00	\$88.00	\$95.81	\$50.00
		ea	\$56.10	\$63.75	\$66.00	\$88.00	\$98.61	\$63.75
		ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$66.00	\$88.00	\$99.57	No Bid
Brand		JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM		
3	4" Range(s)	ea	\$56.10	\$107.06	\$110.00	\$95.75	\$104.77	\$63.75
		ea	\$100.10	\$107.06	\$124.00	\$95.75	\$112.28	\$113.75
		ea	\$100.10	\$107.06	\$125.00	\$95.75	\$113.25	\$113.75
		ea	\$100.10	\$107.06	\$129.00	\$95.75	\$118.30	\$113.75
		Brand	JCM	JCM	S/B	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply	
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am	
4	6"	ea	\$119.90	\$136.25	\$122.00	\$110.00	\$122.46	\$136.25
	Range(s)	ea	\$119.90	\$136.25	\$123.00	\$110.00	\$124.80	\$136.25
		ea	\$119.90	\$136.25	\$124.00	\$110.00	\$126.63	\$136.25
		ea	\$119.90	\$136.25	\$125.00	\$110.00	\$125.96	\$136.25
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM
5	8"	ea	\$140.80	\$160.00	\$143.00	\$132.00	\$137.44	\$150.50
	Range(s)	ea	\$140.80	\$160.00	\$143.00	\$132.00	\$137.77	\$150.50
		ea	\$140.80	\$160.00	\$144.00	\$132.00	\$138.75	\$150.50
		ea	\$140.80	\$160.00	\$145.00	\$132.00	\$158.29	\$150.50
		ea	No Bid	No Bid	\$180.00	\$132.00	\$164.82	No Bid
	Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM / S/B	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM	
6	10"	ea	\$180.40	\$205.00	\$183.00	\$156.00	\$177.98	\$192.90
	Range(s)	ea	\$180.40	\$205.00	\$183.00	\$156.00	\$167.94	\$192.90
		ea	\$180.40	\$205.00	\$183.00	\$156.00	\$167.63	\$192.90
		Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM
7	12"	ea	\$207.90	\$236.25	\$211.00	\$178.00	\$186.98	\$222.35
	Range(s)	Brand	JCM	JCM	JCM	Powerseal	Smith Blair	JCM
1	Collar Leak Breaks							
	6" Collar Leak Clamp Smith-Blair 229 Certified to NSF/ANSI 61 & 372 Bolts: Elec-Galv Lugs: DI flexi-coat Pipe diameter: 6.63" Width: 7-1/2" Nominal Size: 6" Gasket: BUNA-N	ea Brand	\$83.60 JCM	No Bid	\$85.00 JCM	No Bid	\$84.45 Smith Blair	\$92.65 JCM
2	8" Collar Leak Clamp Smith-Blair 229 Certified to NSF/ANSI 61 & 372 Bolts: Elec-Galv Lugs: DI flexi-coat Pipe diameter: 8.63" Width: 7-1/2" Nominal Size: 8" Gasket: BUNA-N	ea Brand	\$96.80 JCM	No Bid	\$98.00 JCM	No Bid	\$94.24 Smith Blair	\$107.30 JCM

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
Bell Joint Clamps							
1	4" ea Brand	\$110.00 JCM	\$138.80 Ford	\$112.00 JCM	\$121.00 Ford	\$126.35 Smith Blair	\$120.95 JCM
2	6" ea Brand	\$121.00 JCM	\$180.99 Ford	\$123.00 JCM	\$164.00 Ford	\$151.55 Smith Blair	\$130.40 JCM
3	8" ea Brand	\$168.30 JCM	\$185.45 Ford	\$170.00 JCM	\$168.00 Ford	\$209.40 Smith Blair	\$180.00 JCM
4	12" ea Brand	\$261.80 JCM	\$264.79 Ford	\$265.00 JCM	\$240.00 Ford	\$272.97 Smith Blair	\$280.00 JCM
Foster adapters or approved equal							
1	4" ea Brand	\$74.80 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$82.42 Infact	\$104.55 Sigma
2	6" ea Brand	\$ 95.15 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$103.04 Infact	\$133.05 Sigma
3	8" ea Brand	\$ 142.45 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$149.43 Infact	\$196.70 Sigma
4	12" ea Brand	\$200.50 SIP	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$231.90 Infact	\$301.25 Sigma
XIV.	Cast Iron Saddles-Baker, Ford, Smith Blair, Mueller, Rockwell with extended range to fit all pipes.						
MAIN Size							
Tap Size - Cast Iron C900							
1	12" ea Brand	\$85.80 JCM	\$91.76 JCM	\$87.00 JCM	\$44.75 Powerseal / Ford	\$53.30 Smith Blair	\$66.30 Ford
	ea Brand	\$94.60 JCM	\$101.76 JCM	\$96.00 JCM	\$74.00 Powerseal / Ford	\$67.52 Smith Blair	\$85.60 Ford
2	10" ea Brand	\$73.70 JCM	\$78.82 JCM	\$75.00 JCM	\$43.25 Powerseal / Ford	\$44.46 Smith Blair	\$52.45 Ford
	ea Brand	\$83.60 JCM	\$89.41 JCM	\$85.00 JCM	\$72.00 Powerseal / Ford	\$56.60 Smith Blair	\$72.45 Ford

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

		Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe & Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
		12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @ 9:20 am
3	8" ea Brand	\$64.90 JCM	\$69.41 JCM	\$66.00 JCM	\$39.75 Powerseal / Ford	\$40.75 Smith Blair	\$39.00 Ford
	ea Brand	\$71.50 JCM	\$76.50 JCM	\$73.00 JCM	\$58.00 Powerseal / Ford	\$45.98 Smith Blair	\$53.90 Ford
4	6" ea Brand	\$50.60 JCM	\$54.12 JCM	\$52.00 JCM	\$36.70 Powerseal / Ford	\$33.59 Smith Blair	\$34.60 Ford
	ea Brand	\$57.20 JCM	\$61.18 JCM	\$58.00 JCM	\$53.55 Powerseal / Ford	\$40.49 Smith Blair	\$44.15 Ford
5	4" ea Brand	\$45.10 JCM	\$48.24 JCM	\$46.00 JCM	\$35.75 Powerseal / Ford	\$28.57 Smith Blair	\$30.75 Ford
	ea Brand	\$53.90 JCM	\$57.65 JCM	\$55.00 JCM	\$44.00 Powerseal / Ford	\$38.05 Smith Blair	\$41.30 Ford
6	1-1/4" -1-1/2" Service Clamp ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	2" x 1cc Service Saddle ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.70 Powerseal / Ford	No Bid	No Bid
8	2-1/2" x 1cc Service Saddle ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	3" x 1cc Service Saddle ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.50 Powerseal / Ford	No Bid	No Bid
10	10"-12" x 1cc Service Saddle ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	16" x 1cc Service Saddle ea Brand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$397.00 Romac	No Bid	No Bid

Group J1 - Water & Sewer Line Supplies

Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

			Southern Waterworks Supply	Southern Pipe& Supply	Consolidated Pipe	Ferguson Waterworks	Central Pipe Supply	Coburns Supply
			12/12 @ 9:28am	12/7 @ 9:11 am	12/9 @ 10:08 am	12/12/2022 11:36	12/6 @ 11:04 am	12/12 @9:20 am
1	M & H 929	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	M & H 929	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1	Mueller A-422	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 784.00	No Bid	No Bid
2	Mueller A-422	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 887.00	No Bid	No Bid
1	Mueller A-423	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 784.00	No Bid	No Bid
2	Mueller A-423	ea	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 887.00	No Bid	No Bid

*WINNER IS INDICATED WITH THIS SHADING

*ALTERNATE IS INDICATED WITH THIS SHADING

Zack Guelker	Jesse Locke	Bill Turner	Katje Toups	Cameron Dilmore	Mark Tate
429 Cole Rd	2202 34th St	10250 Larkin Smith	14231 Seaway	101 Ware Rd	2378 John Hill
Hattiesburg, MS	Gulfport, MS	Gulfport, MS	Gulfport, MS	Pearl, MS 39288	Gulfport, MS
601-268-7463	228-863-2505	228-396-8818	228-863-2757	601-939-3322	225-202-7808
zack@southernwaterworks.com	jesse.lock@southernpipe.com	william.turner@cspipe.com	katje.toups@ferguson.com	cdilmore@centralpipe.com	mtate@coburns.com