

Group K - Pumps for Lift Stations

Contract Period 1-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable option 1-01-24 through 12-31-24

		JH Wright	Bay Motor	Control Systems, Inc.
Lift Stations with transducers				
1	Duplex panel/10 hp pump	\$8,785.00	No Bid	\$8,470.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
2	Duplex panel/15 hp pump	\$8,800.00	No Bid	\$8,534.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
3	Duplex panel/20 hp pump	\$13,430.00	No Bid	\$8,563.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
4	Duplex panel/25 hp pump	\$13,950.00	No Bid	\$8,681.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
5	Duplex panel/30 hp pump	\$13,950.00	No Bid	\$8,681.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
Lift Stations with float ball setup				
1	Duplex panel - 5 hp pump	\$8,275.00	No Bid	\$6,423.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
2	Duplex panel - 7.5 hp pump	\$8,575.00	No Bid	\$6,423.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
3	Duplex panel - 10 hp pump	\$8,785.00	No Bid	\$6,863.00
	Brand	Primex		Control Systems, Inc.
Myers pumps or equal - 230V,3Phase - 40' lead				
1	4vx 30m4-23 - 4" non-log pump 3 hp	\$4,512.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand	Wico		
2	4vx 50m4-23 - 4" non-log pump 5 hp	\$4,512.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand	Wico		
3	4vx 75ma-23 - 4" non-log pump 7.5 hp	\$4,780.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand	Wico		
4	4vx 100ma-23- 4" non-log pump 10 hp	\$4,920.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand	Wico		

5	4vx 150ma-23- 4" non-log pump 15 hp		\$5,580.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand		Wico		
6	4vx 200ma-23- 4" non-log pump 20 hp		\$6,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand		Wico		
Submersible pumps -					
1	3 hp with 4" discharge		\$6,811.00	\$6,487.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
2	5 hp with 4" discharge		\$6,843.00	\$6,587.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
3	7.5 hp with 4" discharge		\$8,064.00	\$8,375.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
4	10 hp with 4" discharge		\$8,428.00	\$8,885.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
5	15 hp with 4" discharge		\$9,405.00	\$10,400.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
6	20 hp with 4" discharge		\$10,217.00	\$11,600.00	No Bid
	Brand		Wemco	Mudbug	
		Paul Coletta	Sabrina Moran	Steve Hupperich	
		27395 Polland Rd	PO Box 411	909 Quinn Street	
		Daphne, AL	Long Beach, MS 39560	Jackson, MS 39202	
		228-238-3320	228-863-0666	601-355-8594	
		pcoletta@jhwright.com	sabrina@baymotorwinding.com	steveh@controlsysinc.com	