

Group P3 - Fencing Materials

Contract Period 01-01-2022 through 12-31-2022

Renewal Option 01-01-2023 through 12-31-2023

Can't Be Beat Fence

Southern Exterior

4 ft. Sections or less (Chain – Wood – PVC)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$12.40	\$14.00	lf
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$16.20	\$17.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		\$16.50	\$13.50	lf
3	Furnish and install new pvc fence		\$20.70	\$17.50	lf
4	Remove existing fence and install new chain link fence		\$14.50	\$16.00	lf
4a.	Vinyl Coated		\$18.50	\$19.00	lf
5	Remove existing fence and install new wood fence		\$19.50	\$14.50	lf
6	Remove existing fence and install new pvc fence		\$22.00	\$17.00	lf
7	Furnish and Install Terminal Post (End, Corner, Gate)		\$68.50	\$75.00	ea
7a	Vinyl Coated		\$88.50	\$92.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal posts		\$82.00	\$85.00	ea
8a	Vinyl Coated		\$98.50	\$102.00	ea

6 ft. Sections or less (Chain – Wood – PVC)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$18.50	\$20.00	lf
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$20.60	\$23.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		\$20.75	\$19.00	lf
3	Furnish and install new pvc fence		\$27.00	\$26.00	lf
4	Remove existing fence and install new chain link fence		\$21.50	\$23.00	lf
4a	Vinyl Coated		\$22.60	\$26.00	lf
5	Remove existing fence and install new wood fence		\$24.50	\$23.00	lf
6	Remove existing fence and install new pvc fence		\$29.00	\$20.00	lf
7	Furnish and Install Terminal Post		\$81.00	\$85.00	ea

7a		Vinyl Coated	\$124.00	\$104.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$100.00	\$95.00	ea
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$140.00	\$114.00	ea

8 ft Section (Chain - Wood - PVC)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$22.50	\$29.00	lf
1a		Vinyl Coated	\$28.50	\$33.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		\$27.50	\$24.00	lf
3	Furnish and install new pvc fence		\$52.00	\$45.00	lf
4	Remove existing fence and install new chain link		\$27.50	\$33.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$33.50	\$38.00	lf
5	Remove existing fence and install new wood fence		\$31.00	\$28.00	lf
6	Remove existing fence and install new pvc fence		\$54.00	\$46.00	lf
7	Furnish and Install Terminal Post		\$125.00	\$165.00	ea
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$170.00	\$200.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$140.00	\$180.00	ea
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$180.00	\$215.00	ea

10' Sections or less (Chain – Wood - PVC)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$29.25	\$30.00	lf
1a		Vinyl Coated	\$34.50	\$35.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	\$28.50	lf
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove, furnish and install new chain link fence		\$33.50	\$32.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$37.50	\$39.00	lf
5	Furnish and Install Terminal Post		\$32.50	\$29.50	lf
6	Remove and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$138.00	\$100.00	ea
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$152.00	\$125.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$150.00	\$105.00	ea

8a	Vinyl Coated		\$182.00	\$130.00	ea
12' High Sections (Chain - Wood)					
1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$30.50	\$32.00	lf
	Vinyl Coated		\$35.50	\$37.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new Chain link fence		\$35.00	\$33.00	lf
4a	Vinyl Coated		\$40.50	\$38.00	lf
5	Remove and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6			No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$140.50	\$128.00	ea
7a	Vinyl Coated		\$175.00	\$143.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$160.50	\$133.00	ea
8a	Vinyl Coated		\$190.00	\$145.00	ea
14' High Sections - (Chain - Wood PVC)					
1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$32.50	\$34.00	lf
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$38.00	\$37.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new Chain link fence		\$34.50	\$37.00	lf
4a	Vinyl Coated		\$39.50	\$42.00	lf
5			No Bid	No Bid	
6			No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$158.00	\$135.00	ea
7a	Vinyl Coated		\$208.00	\$165.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$168.00	\$150.00	ea
8a	Vinyl Coated		\$218.00	\$180.00	ea

16' High Sections - (Chain Wood -PVC)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$34.50	\$37.00	lf
		Vinyl Coated	\$40.90	\$42.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new chain link fence		\$40.50	\$45.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$46.00	\$50.00	lf
5	Remove and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Remove and install new pvc fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$153.00	\$150.00	ea
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$233.00	\$175.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$183.00	\$165.00	ea
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$233.00	\$170.00	ea

18' Sections (Chain)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$44.50	\$50.00	lf
1a		Vinyl Coated	\$53.00	\$55.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new chain link fence		\$49.00	\$55.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$58.00	\$60.00	lf
5	Remove and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Remove and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$166.00	\$170.00	lf
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$241.00	\$190.00	lf
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$185.00	\$195.00	lf
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$255.00	\$210.00	lf

20' Sections (Chain)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$48.50	\$50.00	lf
1a		Vinyl Coated	\$51.50	\$60.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new chain link fence		\$52.50	\$55.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$55.50	\$65.00	lf
5	Remove and instal lnew wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Remove and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal posts		\$182.00	\$190.00	ea
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$202.00	\$210.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$200.00	\$215.00	ea
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$268.00	\$220.00	ea

22' Sections or less (Chain)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$51.50	\$52.00	lf
		Vinyl Coated	\$62.00	\$62.00	lf
2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new chain link fence		\$60.00	\$60.00	lf
4a		Vinyl Coated	\$70.00	\$74.00	lf
5	Remove and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Remove and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and intll terminal post		\$195.00	\$200.00	ea
7a		Vinyl Coated	\$300.00	\$220.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$215.00	\$223.00	ea
8a		Vinyl Coated	\$320.00	\$240.00	ea

24' High Sections (Chain)

1	Furnish and install new chain link fence		\$54.50	\$60.00	lf
1a		Vinyl Coated	\$64.00	\$70.00	lf

2	Furnish and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Furnish and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Remove and install new chain link fence		\$59.50	\$66.00	lf
4a	Vinyl Coated		\$69.00	\$76.00	lf
5	Remove and install new wood fence		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Remove and install new PVC fence		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Furnish and install terminal post		\$215.00	\$195.00	ea
7a	Vinyl Coated		\$328.00	\$220.00	ea
8	Remove, furnish and install terminal post		\$225.00	\$223.00	ea
8a	Vinyl Coated		\$338.00	\$245.00	ea
1	Removal and /or repairs to existing fence (all types)		\$18.00	\$19.00	lf
2	Removal and/or repairs to vinyl coated fence		\$21.00	\$22.00	lf
3	Remove and install top, middle and bottom rail		\$4.50	\$5.00	lf
4	Remove and install top, middle and bottom rail - Vinyl Coated		\$6.50	\$7.00	lf
Remove and Install Line Post		Galvanized		Galvanized	
1	4'		\$27.00	\$14.00	ea
2	6'		\$32.50	\$20.00	ea
3	8'		\$37.50	\$28.00	ea
4	10'		\$42.50	\$34.00	ea
5	12'		\$47.50	\$40.00	ea
6	14'		\$52.50	\$48.00	ea
7	16'		\$57.50	\$56.00	ea
8	18'		\$62.50	\$60.00	ea
9	20'		\$67.50	\$65.00	ea
10	22'		\$72.50	\$70.00	ea
11	24'		\$70.50	\$80.00	ea
Remove and Install Line Post		Vinyl		Vinyl	
1	4'		\$33.00	\$19.00	ea
2	6'		\$39.00	\$26.00	ea
3	8'		\$46.20	\$34.00	ea
4	10'		\$92.00	\$44.00	ea
5	12'		\$99.00	\$51.00	ea

6	14'	\$105.00	\$	62.00	ea
7	16'	\$112.00	\$	71.00	ea
8	18'	\$129.00	\$	80.00	ea
9	20'	\$145.00	\$	90.00	ea
10	22'	\$162.00	\$	100.00	ea
11	24'	\$158.00	\$	118.00	ea

Remove and terminal Line Post		Galvanized	Galvanized		
1	4'	\$82.00	\$	34.00	ea
2	6'	\$100.00	\$	44.00	ea
3	8'	\$140.00	\$	73.00	ea
4	10'	\$150.00	\$	98.00	ea
5	12'	\$160.50	\$	135.00	ea
6	14'	\$168.00	\$	150.00	ea
7	16'	\$183.00	\$	160.00	ea
8	18'	\$185.00	\$	190.00	ea
9	20'	\$200.00	\$	200.00	ea
10	22'	\$215.00	\$	210.00	ea
11	24'	\$225.00	\$	215.00	ea

Remove and terminal Line Post		Vinyl	Vinyl		
1	4'	\$98.50	\$	40.00	ea
2	6'	\$140.00	\$	50.00	ea
3	8'	\$180.00	\$	75.00	ea
4	10'	\$182.00	\$	105.00	ea
5	12'	\$190.00	\$	145.00	ea
6	14'	\$218.00	\$	175.00	ea
7	16'	\$233.00	\$	200.00	ea
8	18'	\$255.00	\$	220.00	ea
9	20'	\$268.00	\$	230.00	ea
10	22'	\$320.00	\$	235.00	ea
11	24'	\$338.00	\$	238.00	ea

Chain Link Roller Gates - 10' or less

1	Furnish and install new chain link roller gates		\$14.00	\$10.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$16.00	\$12.50	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new chain link roller gate		\$15.00	\$10.25	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00	\$12.75	sq ft

Chain Link Roller Gates - 10' - 18'

1	Furnish and install new chain link roller gate roller gate		\$14.00	\$10.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$16.00	\$12.50	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new roller gate		\$15.00	\$10.25	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00	\$12.75	sq ft

Chain Link Roller Gates - 18.1' - 30'

1	Furnish and install new chain link roller gate - 18.1" to 30'		\$14.00	\$10.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$16.00	\$12.50	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new chain link - 18.1" - 30'		\$15.00	\$10.25	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00	\$12.75	sq ft

Chain Link Cantilever Gates - 10' or less

1	Furnish and install new chain link cantilever gates		\$20.00	\$21.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$23.00	\$22.00	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new chain link cantilever gate		\$22.00	\$21.50	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$25.00	\$22.50	sq ft

Chain Link Cantilever Gates - 10' - 18'

1	Furnish and install new chain link cantilever gates		\$20.00	\$21.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$23.00	\$22.00	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new chain link cantilever gate		\$22.00	\$21.50	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$25.00	\$22.50	sq ft

Chain Link Cantilever Gates - 18.1' - 30'

1	Furnish and install new chain link cantilever gates		\$20.00		\$21.00	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$23.00		\$22.00	sq ft
2	Remove existing gate and install new chain link cantilever gate		\$22.00		\$21.50	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$25.00		\$22.50	sq ft

Chain Link Swing Gate

1	Furnish and install new chain link swing gate - less than 6' wide		\$15.00		\$9.50	sq ft
1a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00		\$10.50	sq ft
2	Furnish and install new chain link swing gate - 6' - 12' wide		\$15.00		\$9.50	sq ft
2a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00		\$10.50	sq ft
3	Furnish and install new chain link swing gate- 12'1" - 20' wide		\$15.00		\$9.50	sq ft
3a	Vinyl Coated		\$17.00		\$10.50	sq ft

Wood Swing Gate

1	Furnish and install new wood swing gate - less than 6' wide		\$8.00		\$9.50	sq ft
2	Furnish and install new wood swing gate - 6' to 12' wide		\$8.00		\$9.50	sq ft
3	Furnish and install new wood swing gate - 12'1" - 20' wide		\$10.00		\$9.50	sq ft
4	Furnish and install 3 strand 12 ga. Class 3, barb wire with barb arms for wood or chain link fence		\$2.10		\$1.95	per lf

PVC Vinyl Slats (Various Colors)

Furnish and Install PVC Vinyl Slates						
1		6'	\$11.75		\$12.00	per lf
2		7'	\$14.00		\$13.00	per lf
3		8'	\$15.75		\$14.50	per lf
4		10'	\$19.50		\$15.00	per lf
1	Furnish and install Razor Wire	18"	\$7.50		\$8.00	per lf

Furnish and Install Privacy Screens

1	6'	\$3.50	\$3.00	per lf
2	7'	\$4.25	\$3.50	per lf
3	8'	\$4.50	\$4.00	per lf
4	10'	\$7.00	\$6.50	per lf

Furnish and Intall Plate Assembly on post and install on concrete

1	6" X 6"	\$45.00	\$20.00	ea
2	8" X 8"	\$55.00	\$25.00	ea

Core Drill through concrete to set post

1	4" Hole	\$45.00	\$45.00	ea
2	6" Hole	\$65.00	\$55.00	ea
3	8" Hole	\$75.00	\$65.00	ea
4	12" Hole	\$110.00	\$85.00	ea

Meredith Anderson
 2204 Hwy 53
 Perkinston, MS
 228-255-9040
meredith@cantbebeatfence.com

Rance Necaise
 31023 Crane Creek Rd
 Perkinston, MS
 228-586-2110
cbaker@sefence.com